Jefferson
"» Parlsh

state of Louisiana

Bid Number 50-00143819

Two (2) Year Contract for Rental of Heavy Equipment (Part 1) for the
Jefferson Parish Department of Public Works and All Jefferson Parish
Agencies

Bid Due: November 28, 2023 AT 2:00 PM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing
Department’s eProcurement site, www.jeffparishbids.net, by the bid due date
and time. Late bids will not be accepted.

lefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Purchasing Specialist Il, Mark Buttery

Email: MButtery@jeffparish.net
Phone: 504-364-2810




Bid No. 50-00143819

Two vear contract for rental of heavy equipment (Part I) for
Jefferson Parish Department of Public Works and all Jefferson
Parish agencies.

BONDS:

Bid Bond: .
An electronic bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid.
Failure to submit with bid will result in a bid rejection.

Specification:

The following groups of items are contained in this document for bid purposes

Group a: bid item nos. 0010-0150 crane crawlers

Group b: bid item nos. 0170-0270 truck mounted cranes
Group c: bid item nos. 0290-0350 dragline excavators
Group d: bid item nos. 0370-0390 backhoes

Group e: bid item nos. 0410-0430 hydraulic excavators
Group f: bid item nos. 0450-0510 crawler tractors (dozers)
Group g: bid item nos. 0530 mats

Group h: bid item nos. 0550 winch and bucket trucks
Group i: bid item nos. 0590-0630 lattice boom cranes
Group j: bid item nos. 0890-0990 skid steer loader (bobcats)
Group k; bid item nos. 1000-1010 dump trucks

Group I: bid item nos. 1130-1210 transportation

Group m: bid item nos. 1220 flagman

The terms and conditions of resolution 136353 shall be a part of the bid whether attached or not.
A copy may be obtained from the office of the parish clerk, 6™ floor,
General government building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, Louisiana.

The contractor may complete his bid by the utilization of subcontractors; however, no payment
will be made by Jefferson Parish to subcontractor for any work performed under the terms of the
contract. The contractor assumes all responsibility for the work performed by his

subcontractors. The cost of any incidental transport of goods and/or materials between the
contractor and his subcontractor shall not be eligible for payment; therefore, the time required for
incidental transport of goods and/or materials between the contractor and his subcontractors will
not be eligible for payment. All subcontractor work shall be governed by all provisions of the

contract.

All work shall be performed between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 4:00 p.m. Monday through
Friday. The contractor shall not perform any work on any days observed as legal parish
holidays, Saturdays, or Sundays unless authorized to do so. There will be no overtime provisions
under the terms of this contract.
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Bid No. 50-00143819

The contractor shall be required to complete a daily work sheet for each piece of equipment
rented. Work sheets are to indicate the following.

equipment rented

location of job site

hours worked

downtime (if applicable)

work performed (quantitative)

okl

Rental periods will be calculated by the general practice used in industry to base rates upon one
shift of eight (8) hours per day, forty (40) hours a week, or one hundred seventy-six (176) hours
per month of a thirty (30) consecutive day period.

In the event of unforeseen jobsite problems or unavoidable delays while the work is in progress
not attributed to the contractor’s actions, a minimum of four (4) hours will be paid to the
contractor for that day. In the event of inclement weather to the extent that equipment cannot
function, a minimum of two (2) hours will be paid to the contractor for the equipment on the
jobsite during the normal working period.

Bid prices must include all costs for fuel, lubricants, operators, helpers, maintenance, and
preparation, and other incidentals for the regular work day period, with one (1) hour for lunch.

The hourly rental rate shall begin when the contractor’s equipment is on the job site and begins
work.

Additionally, transportation costs will be paid on a per move basis when contractor is requested
to move from one job site to another. Transportation quoted on any method other than a per
move basis will not be accepted.

Setting up, checking, adjusting, or preparing rented unit for day’s work prior to the hours
covering the work day period shall not be a payable part of the rental period. Preparations of the
machine prior to the rental period shall be considered as a part of the contractor’s normal or
routine maintenance.

The minimum rental period for all items on this bid shall be one (1) day based on a minimum of
eight (8) hours of productive work.
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Bid Bond

An Electronic Bid Bond must be submitted with this bid, through one of the respective clearing
houses at www.jeffpdrish.net or www.centralbidding.com. To access the bonding companies on
Central Bidding, hover over the “Central Bidding” link at the top of the page and select the “Bid
Bonds” link.

The electronic bid bond number is to be placed in the required section listed on the standard
envelope. Scanned copies of bid bonds will not be accepted with your submission.

‘# ), CENTRALEBIDDING

, 4
\Central Bidding¥s'iie leading
ionline biddifig services

genci

) CENTRALAIDDNG

$41.6 Billion
38,136 Bid
Opportunities
18,123 Vendors
568 Agencies



INVITATION TO BID

DATE: 10/25/2023 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 1
BID NO.: 50-00143819 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHAglgGBD(;E)I(’QRTMENT PURCHASING SPECIALIST:
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009 MBUTTERY@jeffparish.net

504-364-2678

BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED ONLINE VIA WWW.JEFFPARISHBIDS.NET UNTIL 2:00 PM, 11/28/2023

AND PUBLICLY OPENED THEREAFTER IN THE WEST BANK PURCHASING DEPT, SUITE 4400, JEFFERSON PARISH
GENERAL GOVERNMENT BUILDING, 200 DERBIGNY STREET, GRETNA, LA 70053. At no charge, bidders are to submit
via Jefferson Parish’s electronic procurement page by visiting www.jeffparishbids.net to register for this free site.
Additional instructions are included in the text box highlighting electronic procurement.

LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED

NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN IN INK OR TYPEWRITTEN, AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE FIRM OR
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC FIGURES OR
SIGNATURES SHALL RESULT IN BID REJECTION. HOWEVER, ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES AS DEFINED IN
LSA -R.S. 9:2620(8) ARE ACCEPTABLE. SIGNATURE MUST BE A SECURED DIGITAL SIGNATURE.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS
THE FOLLOWING INSTRUCTIONS APPLY TO ALL BIDS

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of
Louisiana Law as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson
Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 136353 and/or Resolution No. 141125 as amended.

Jefferson Parish adheres to the Louisiana Code of Governmental Ethics, contained in Louisiana Revised Statutes Annotated, R.S.
42:1101, et seq. Vendor/Proposer by this submission, warrants that there are no "conflicts of interest" related to this procurement that
would violate applicable Louisiana Law. Violation of the Louisiana Code of Governmental Ethics may result in rescission of contract,
permit or licenses, and the imposition of fines and/or penalties, without contractual liability to the public in accordance with applicable
law.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from http://purchasing jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor Information. Current W-9 forms with respective Tax

Identification numbers and vendor applications may be submitted at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or
a current W-9 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Vendors may experience a delay in payment if your company
is not a registered vendor with Jefferson Parish.

All quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or job site, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing
Department. This provision does not apply to public works projects

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the
project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials
must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery andfor acceptance of the project. Any deviations or
alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

Bidders should submit all questions in writing via email to the Purchasing Specialist's email address as indicated above, no later than
Five (5) working days prior to the bid opening. Bid numbers should be mentioned in all requests. If submitting online, vendors may
send questions via the E-Procurement site no later than Five (5) working days prior to the bid opening.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to
allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions.
The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum. Please note that all official
communication will be expressed in the form of an addendum.

Visit our website at HTTP://PURCHASING.JEFFPARISH.NET
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BID NO.: 50-00143819

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgement on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge any Addendum on the
bid form shall cause the bid fo be rejected. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in
bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item
pricing forms as indicated. Vendors must not alter the bid forms. Doing so will cause the bid to be rejected.

A corporate resolution or written evidence of the individual signing the bid having such authority must be submitted with the bid.
Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected. For corporate entities, such written evidence may be a printout of the Louisiana
Secretary of State's website listing the sighatory as an officer. Such printout shall be included with the bid submission. Bids
submitted by Owners or Sole Proprietorships must include certification that he or she owns the entity for which the bid is signed.
This documentation must be submitted with the bid. Failure to do so will result in bid rejection.

NOTE: A sample corporate resolution can be downloaded from our website http://purchasing jeffparish.net or you may provide
gour own document. A sample certification of sole proprietorship can also be downloaded from our website
ttp://purchasing.jeffparish.net or you may provide your own document.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

A. AWARD OF CONTRACT: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual
item basis, or such combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall
be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE
SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE. SPLIT AWARDS MADE TO SEVERAL VENDORS WILL
ONLY BE GRANTED TO THOSE DEEMED RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE.

All bid prices shall remain valid for 45 days. Jefferson Parish and the lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s) by mutual written
consent may mutually agree to extend the deadline for award by one (1) or more extensions of thirty (30) calendar days.

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submit bids in response to this solicitation may protest any element of the procurement, in writing
to the Director of the Purchasing Department. Written protest must be received within 48 hours of the release of the bid tabulation by
the Purchasing Department. After consultation, the Parish Attorney’s Office will then respond to protests in writing. (For more
information, please see Chapter 2, Article VII, Division 2, Sec. 2-914.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

PREFERENCE: Unless federal funding is directly spent by Jefferson Parish for this purchase, preference is hereby given to materials,
supplies, and provisions produced, manufactured or grown in Louisiana, quality being equal to articles offered by competitors outside
the state. “LSA - R.S. 38:2251-2261"

B. USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the
purpose of establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided
brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

C. CANCELLATION OF CONTRACT: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part if not shipped promptly. No
charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JElFFEtRS“?N PARISH reserves the right to cancel any contract at anytime and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

For good cause and as consideration for executing a contract with Jefferson Parish, vendor conveys, sells, assigns and transfers to

Jefferson Parish or its assigns all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the

3n#trusl IaI;vs _o{l the United States and the State of Louisiana, relating to the particular good or services purchased or acquired by
efferson Parish.

D. PRICES: Jefferson Parish is exempt from paying sales tax under LSA-R.S. 47:301 (8)(c). All prices for purchases by Jefferson
Parish of supplies and materials shall be quoted in the unit of measure specified and unless otherwise specified, shall be exclusive of
state and local taxes. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the
unit price shall prevail.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any
person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination oh the
basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and VII of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), %1), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must
comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s
specifications (ANSI A17.1-1961).
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Jefferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federal funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s) that will
provide high quality services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly .
encourages the involvement of minority and/or woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE’s, WBE's and SBE’s) to
stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.

The purpose and intention of this invitation to bid is to afford all suppliers an equal opportunity to bid on all construction,
maintenance, repair, operating supplies and/or equipment listed in this bid proposal. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE
BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Items bid must meet specifications.

Advertised bids will be tabulated and a copy of the tabulation will be forwarded to each responding bidder.

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This Is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are to submit
electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidder's
submission will be rejected. Please note all requil;'el?eqts contained in this bid package for electronic bid
submission.

Please visit our E-Procurement Page at www.jeffparishbids.net to register and view Jefferson Parish
solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
http:/Ipurchasing.jeffparish.net.

The general specifications for construction projects and the purchase of materials, services and/or supplies are those adopted by the

JEFFERSON PARISH Council by Resolution No. 136353 or 141125 as amended. The general conditions adopted by this resolution

shall be considered as much a part of this document as if they were written wholly herein. A copy may be obtained from the Office of

the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053.

‘F(ou may also obtain a copy by visiting the Purchasing Department webpage at http://purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on Online
orms.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID
PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

10, 11,12, 13, 15

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(l), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective
bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any
and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contracter shall be responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.
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10.

11.

12,

13.

14.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license

number will be shown on the outside of the bid electronic envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
When submitting the bid electronically, the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the electronic
procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

. It is the bidder’s responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract. Passageways must be kept

clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily
because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precaution must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of
JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shall be
recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A
price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of
Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in
the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid
specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing
of the contract.

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the

contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the

contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached “Standard Insurance Requirements” sheet attached to this
bid solicitation. Failure to comply with this instruction will result in bid rejection.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. All sureties must be in original format (no copies) When submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an
electronic bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid
solgciiptign on Central Auction House. No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid
supmission.

This is a requirements confract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on
warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.

Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, frelght must be quoted as a
separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits,
including: Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and
E-Verify Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitied PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant
and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be
submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material
alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The
Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.
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INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

15. NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders must
submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion Affidavit, Debt
Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one
form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material
alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly
notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format
and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as
non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced e:ippendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted as per the appendix instructions. Failure to submit applicable
certifications per the appendix instructions will result in bid rejection.

17. For this project, the Contractor shall not pay any state or local sales or use taxes on materials and equipment which are affixed
and made part of the immovable property of the project or which is permanently incorporated in the project (hereinafter referred to as
"applicable materials and equipment."). All purchases of applicable materials or equipment shall be made by the contractor on behalf
of and as the agent of Jefferson Parish (Owner), a political subdivision of the State of Louisiana. No state and local sales and use
taxes are owed on applicable materials and equipment under the provisions of Act 1029 of the 1991 Regular Session - Louisiana
Revised Statute 47:301(8)(c). Owner will furnish to contractor a certificate form which certifies that Owner is not required to pay such
state or local sales and use taxes, and coniractor shall furnish a copy of such certificate to all vendors or suppliers of the applicable
materials and equipment, and report to Owner the amount of taxes not incurred.

t shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
uty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
ligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
erformance review, or hearing pursuant to JPCO 2-155.10(19). By signing this document, every corporation, partnership, or
erson contracting with PARISH, whether by cooperative endeavor, intergovernmental agreement, bid, proposal, application
r solicitation for a parish contract, and every application for certification of eligibility for a parish contract or program,
ttests that it understands and will abide by all provisions of JPCO 2-155.10.

See Page 1 for Conflicts of Interest Statement
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Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will
only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.
Are you requesting an escalation provision?

YES NO X

MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED 0%

INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THEDATEOF c oot ract _expiration

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor Is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES as_needed

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) 17861

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

FIRM NAME: C. "Bud" Taulli Construction, Inc.
ADDRESS: 3044 Barataria Blvd.

CITY, STATE: Marrero, LA B zp. 10072
TELEPHONE: (504) 340-6926 Fax: (504)340-8817

EMAIL ADDRESS: c.bud.taulli®gmail.com

In the event that addenda are Issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form.Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge
any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER: _ -
NUMBER:
TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § 2.6 76, 315. 00
AUTHORIZED : M
SIGNATURE: (7 ; j d — C.. Bud Taulli Jr.

i
Printed Name

TITLE: President

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE
indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

3,343.00

3,403.00

165.00

292,00

2.00

32.00

43.00

2.00

HR

HR

HR

HR

HR

HR

HR

HR

HR

Two (2) Year Contract for Rental of
Heavy Equipment (Part 1) for the
Jefferson Parish Department of Public
Works and All Jefferson Parish Agencies

0010 CRANE, CRAWLER MOUNTED 35 FT.
BOOM .75 CUYD BUCKET

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR RENTAL OF
HEAVY EQUIPRMENT ( PART 1) FOR THE
JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC
WORKS AND ALL JEFFERSON PARISH AGENCIES

CURRENT CONTRACT# 55-20274
EXPIRES 5§/15/2024

0030 BOOM EXTENSION 5 FT. SECTION FOR
ABOVE CRAWLER MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM
.75 CUYD BUCKET

0050 BOOM EXTENSION 10 FT. SECTION FOR
ABOVE CRAWLER MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM
.75 CUYD BUCKET

0070 GRANE, CRAWLER MOUNTED 35 FT. BOOM
1.5 CUYD BUGKET

0080 BOOM EXTENSION 5 FT. SECTION FOR
AVOVE CRAWLER MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM

1.5 CUYD BUCKET

0110 BOOM EXTENSION 10 FT. SECTION FOR
ABOVE CRAWLER MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM
1.5 CUYD BUCKET

0130 PILE DRIVER ATTACHMENTS 40 FT.

LEADS WITH FOLLOWING BLOCKS AND 2500 LB
HAMMER

0150 PILE DRIVER ATTACHMENTS 45 FT.

LEADS WITH FOLLOWING BLOCKS AND 3000 LB
HAMMER

0170 CRANE, TRUCK MOUNTED 30 FT, BOOM
.5 CUYD BUCKET

$ A/D Bml

s Ko Bid

5 No Bid

$ No Bid

s No Bid |

$ No BI‘A

5 No_Bid

s No Bid

$ No ﬁ:é ,
s No Bid

s No_Bid

s No Bid
s B/

s No Bid

5 No Bid |

s No_Bid |

sNo Bid

sNo Bid




DATE: 10/25/2023 Page 8
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 5000143819 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

10 2.00 HR 0190 BOOM EXTENSION 5 FT. SECTION FOR s No Bid |s No 610’
ABOVE TRUCK MOUNTED CRANE 30 FT. BOOM
.5 CUYD BUCKET

1 2,00 HR 0210 BOOM EXTENSION 10 FT. SECTION FOR $ No Bi d s No BICJ
ABOVE TRUCK MOUNTED CRANE 30 FT. BOOM
.5 CUYD BUCKET

12 43.00 HR 0230 CRANE, TRUCK MOUNTED 35 FT. BOOM s No Bld__ﬁ No de N
1.0 CUYD BUCKET

13 2.00 HR 0250 BOOM EXTENSION 5 FT. SECTION FOR 5 MD B |'A | $ No B!o’
ABOVE TRUCK MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM R
1.0 CUYD BUCKET

14 2.00 HR 0270 BOOM EXTENSION 10 FT. SECTION FOR 5 _&Q_@,d s No ﬁ:d
ABOVE TRUCK MOUNTED CRANE 35 FT. BOOM - B )
1.0 GUYD BUCKET

15 2.00 HR 0290 DRAGLINE, EXCAVATOR CRAWLER s id SR l Bi
MOUNTED 35 FT. BOOM .75 CUYD BUCKET “&Q“‘E i Q“‘“!'L

16 2.00 HR 0310 DRAGELINE, EXCAVATOR CRAWLER s No B n‘J $_A_[Q_B,H
MOUNTED 35 FT. BOOM, EXPANDABLE TRACK, - " i B
1.5 CUYD BUCKET

17 2.00 HR 0330 DRAGLINE EXCAVATOR TRUCK MOUNTED s 5 :‘J $ Mo Bnd
30 FT. BOOM .5 CUYD BUCKET “N 0 T g

18 2.00 HR 0350 DRAGLINE EXCAVATOR TRUCK MOUNTED $ MQ (3 fd $ NQ B fd
35 FT. BOOM .75 CUYD BUCKET "

19 2.00 HR 0370 BACKHOE, TRUCK MOUNTED 15 FT. DIG $ Nb B’uj s No @;d
DEPTH .5 CUYD BUCKET [ :

20 2,892.00 HR 0390 BACKHOE, TRAGK MOUNTED 15 FT. DIG S 10b.00 | 5289 200.00
DEPTH .5 CUYD BUGKET

21 969.00 HR 0410 EXCAVATOR, HYDRAULIC GRAWLER S |80-00 |s174420.00

MOUNTED 21.1 - 24.0 M TONS 1.0 CUYD




DATE: 10/25/2023

Page 9
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00143819 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE SriiR
NUMBER | QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES B QUOTED T
-

BUCKET

22 471200 HR 0430 EXCAVATOR, HYDRAULIC CRAWLER $__190-00 | 5895280.00
MOUNTED LONG REACH 45-50 FT. REACH 21
FT. DIG DEPTH 1.0 CUYD BUCKET

23 2.00 HR 0450 CRAWLER TRACTOR D-4, 80 HP, HGP $__ 12500 |s_ 250.00

24 2.00 HR 0470 CRAWLER TRACTOR D-5, 165 HP, HGP $_190.00 |5 3¢60.00

25 2.00 HR 0430 CRAWLER TRACTOR D-8, 285 HP, HGP $ ] _$_A[o_8{d

2 2,00 HR 0510 CRAWLER TRACTOR D-8, 370 HP, HGP $ Ala___ﬂ {,g{ s No B ;‘d

27 17,421.00 HR 0530 HARDWOOD MATS 8IN X 4FT X 24FT WITH 5. 5.00 |3 gz 105.00
BOLTS AND 1 IN. CABLE ON EACH END,
INCLUDING TRANSPORTATION

28 2.00 HR 0550 WINCH AND BUCKET TRUCK 6 TON s No ﬁfd s Mo Bid
CAPACITY AT 20 FT.

29 2,796.00 HR 0580 CRANE, LATTICE BOOM CRAWLER 5 AI ()] B_‘A 3 MQ 8 fc!___
MOUNTED 60 TON CAPACITY 40 FT. BOOM WITH '"' —
THE FOLLOWING ACCESSORIES AS REQUIRED:
80 FT. SWINGING LEADS, 80 FT. FIXED
LEADS, VIBRATING DDRIVER EXTRACTOR,
HEADBLOCK, SWIVEL STRUT CAP, UNIVERSAL.
CAPM SHEET PILE CAP, 3000 LB. DROP
HAMMER, SHACKLES, STIRRUPS, AND
DRAGELINE ATTACHMENT

30 2.00 HR 0610 BOOM EXTENSION 10 FT. SECTION ] N 0 HLJ S 514
FOR ABOVE LATTICE BOOM CRAWLER CRANE 15 No

L 531.00 HR 0630 BOOM EXTENSION 20 FT, SECTION FOR $ ND_&L s Mo B:J
ABOVE LATTICE BOOM CRAWLER MOUNTED CRANE -

32 310800 HR 0830 SKID STEER LOADER BOBCAT 700 $__90.00 |$279720.00
SERIES 40 HP DIESEL, INCLUDING

(€]



DATE: 10/25/2023

Page 10
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00143819 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

TRANSPORTATION

33 125.00 HR 0930 BUCKET ATTACHMENT FOR STEER LOADER $_10.00. 1% _1,250.p00)

34 3,051.00 HR 0950 CRAWLER TRACKS FOR STEER LOADER S5 25,00 |$ 7027500

s 3,053.00 HR 0970 FORK ATTACHMENT FOR STEER LOADER $__10.00 |5 30,530.00

36 27.00 HR 0990 GRAPPLE ATTACHMENT FOR STEER LOADER 5 260.00 |5 S4%0.00

37 2.00 HR 1000 DUMP TRUCK 12 CUYD ( ON ROAD ) s 8o.00 |3 1l0.6D

38 250000, HR 1010 DUMP TRUCK 7 CUYD ( OFF ROAD ) 5 .00 | $250,000.00

39 3.00 EA 1130 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP A $ N |'d 5 MQ 5 /
EXCLUDING ATTACHMENTS F “OB B C/—

40 11.00 EA 1140 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP B $_A[o_6_1¢l s No Bid
EXCLUDING ATTACHMENTS I

4 © 2.00 EA 1150 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP C S L !Q B;A 5 N D B l‘d
ANY ITEM - B

42 10.00 EA 1160 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP D - S £00. S ’
1160 TRAI _800.00 | %$5,000.0D

43 24.00 EA 1170 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP E $1000.00 | $2% 000.0D
ANY ITEM B

44 2.00 EA 1180 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP F 51,000.0 $_2,000.00.
ANY ITEM = L.

45 2.00 EA 1185 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP H 5 ¥ $ AZQ 5 fd
ANY ITEM E

48 9.00 EA 1190 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP | $ NQ 8 [ QI M fd
EXCLUDING ATTAGHMENTS - L Q“& ﬁ




DATE: 10/25/2023

Page 1
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00143819 SEALED BID
NI.SIAE!;:ER QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES ”g'J,;’T'ggE TOTALS
a1 13.00 EA 1200 TRANSPORTATION COST GROUP J 4Lop. 5.9
EXCLUDING ATTACHMENTS $““““f—L0“0““ 5.200:00
48 2.00 EA 1210 TRANSPORTATION GOST GROUP K S 500.0015%5 1,000-00
ANY ITEM
49 1631504 HR 1220 FLAGMAN ( LABORER ) $ 3500 |$571025.00

ASSIST CONTRACTOR'S EQUIPMENT OPERATOR
AND DIRECT TRAFFIC IN THE VICINITY OF
THE JOB SITE




CORPORATE RESOLUTION

EXCERPT FROM MINUTES OF ME]_ET G OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
C."Bud" Tav/ll CownsiRVCTion

INCORPORATED.

AT THE MEETING OF DIRECTORS OF (2. “Bud” Taulli Lonsizucrion

INCORPORATED, DULY NOTICED AND HELD ON
A QUORUM BEING THERE PRESENT, ON MOTION DULY MADE AND SECONDED. IT
WAS:

RESOLVED THAT ﬁ "Bud" Taul T (fEmdER7) BE AND 1S HEREBY
APPOINTED, CONSTITUTED AND DESIGNATED AS AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT OF THE CORPORATION WITH FULL POWER AND AUTHORITY TO ACT ON
BEHALF OF THIS CORPORATION IN ALL NEGOTIATIONS, BIDDING, CONCERNS
AND TRANSACTIONS WITH THE PARISH OF JEFFERSON OR ANY OF ITS AGENCIES,
DEPARTMENTS, EMPLOYEES OR AGENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, THE
EXECUTION OF ALL BIDS, PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, AFFIDAVITS, BONDS, SURETIES,
CONTRACTS AND ACTS AND TO RECEIVE ALL PURCHASE ORDERS AND NOTICES
ISSUED PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF ANY SUCH BID OR CONTRACT, THIS
CORPORATION HEREBY RATIFYING, APPROVING, CONFIRMING, AND ACCEPTING
EACH AND EVERY SUCH ACT PERFORMED BY SAID AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT.

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE FOREGOING TO BE
A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF AN
EXCERPT OF THE MINUTES OF THE ABOVE
DATED MEETING OF THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS OF SAID CORPORATION, AND
THE SAME HAS NOT BEEN REVOKED OR
RESCINDED.

CRETARY- REASUR]il}l

_ Tlevemtbon 17, 2024

DATE




Non-Public Works Bid
Affidavit Instructions

Affidavit is supplied as a courtesy to Affiants, but it is
the responsibility of the affiant to insure the affidavit
they submit to Jefferson Parish complies, in both form
and content, with federal, state and parish laws.
Affidavit must be signed by an authorized
representative of the entity or the affidavit will not be
accepted. '

Affidavit must be notarized or the affidavit will not be
accepted.

Notary must sign name, print name, and include
bar/notary number, or the affidavit will not be
accepted.

Affiant MUST select either A or B when required or the
affidavit will not be accepted.

Affiants who select choice A must include an
attachment or the affidavit will not be accepted.

If both choice A and B are selected, the affidavit will not
be accepted.

Affidavit marked N/A will not be accepted.

It is the responsibility of the Affiant to submit a new
affidavit if any additional campaign contributions are
made after the affidavit is executed but prior to the time
the council acts on the matter.

Instruction sheet may be omitted when submitting the affidavit

17



Non-Public Works Bid
AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF L 0uie/ans

PARISH/COUNTY OF _J££5£0000/

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared: é_ éggf o

7/2{}/ ) Te. .. (Affiant) who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that
‘ C."Gue” Jpulte ]
he/she is the fully authorized ° /Q?EJ’/AEA/T ___of Comgruesion, zve. (Lntity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number 5p-go/43p79 , to the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaign Contribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A __ \/ Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,
Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or

indirectly.
Choice B - there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this section.
Page | of 3 Updated: 02.27.2014



Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the Parish 1o
the Affiant.

Choice B ___\__/ There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section.

Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

[The remainder of this page is intentionally left blank.)

Page 2 of 3 Updated: 02.27.2014



That no part of the contract price received by Affiant was paid or will be paid to any
person, corporation, firm, association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their normal compensation to persons regularly employed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition
of the public building or project were in the regular course of their duties for Affiant,

Signature of Affiant

Q. Bd Tavll v

Printed Name of Affiant

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME

oNTHE _ZT*'DAy OF Movembes 2025

Notary Public
TAMER M. SULE) mAL”

Printed Name of Notary

12 9FIT
Notary/Bar Roll Number

My commission expires 27u.€5 M YLCC' )(ﬁ IR.E

TAMER M SULEIMAN
Notary Public
State of Louisiana
Jefferson Parish
N\otarleD# 128812
My Commission is for Life

Page 3 of 3 Updated: 02.27.2014



4.5.19
8.22.19
9.3.19
9.3.19
10.29.19
3.15.21

Campaign Contributions
C. Bud Taulli Construction, Inc.

Ricky Templet Campaign Fund $ 1,000.00
Committee to Elect Cynthia Lee Sheng $ 500.00
Committee to Elect Jennifer Van Vrancken $ 500.00
Campaign for Dominick Impastato $ 500.00
Deano Bonano Campaign $ 500.00
Committee to Elect Jennifer Van Vrancken $  500.00

1]



TAND T. DING PURPOSES

All required insurance under this bid shall conform to Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646
or No. 113647, as applicable. Contractors may not commence any work under any ensuing
contract unless and until all required insurance and associated evidentiary requirements
thereto have been met, along with any additional specifications contained in the Invitation to
Bid. Except as where otherwise precluded by law, the Parish Attorney or his designee, with
the concurrence of the Director of Risk Management or his designee, may agree on a case-by-
case basis, to deviate from Jefferson Parish’s standard insurance requirements, as provided in
this Section. Vendors requesting deviation therefrom shall submit such requests in writing,
along with compelling substantiation, to the Purchasing Department prior to the bid’s due date.
Any changes to the insurance requirements will be reflected in the bid specifications and
addenda. Prior to contract execution and at all times thereafter during the term of such
contract, contractors must provide and continuously maintain all coverages as required by the
foregoing Resolutions, and the contract documents. Failure to do so shall be grounds for
suspension, discontinuation or termination of the contract.

For bidding purposes, bidders must submit with bid submission a current (valid)

insurance certificate evidencing the required coverages. Failure to comply will cause

bid to be rejected. The current insurance certificate will be used for proof of insurance at time
of evaluation. Thereafter, and prior to contract execution, the low bidder will be required to
provide final insurance certificates to the Parish which shall name the Jefferson Parish, its
Districts Departments and Agencies under the direction of the Parish President and the
Parish Council as additional insureds regarding negligence by the contractor for the
Commercial General Liability and the Comprehensive Automobile Liability policies.
Additionally, said certificates should reflect the name of the Parish Department receiving goods
and services and reference the respective Jefferson Parish bid number.

JEFFERSON PARISH REQUIRED STANDARD INSURANCE
M  WORKER'S COMPENSATION INSURANCE

As required by Louisiana State Statute, exception; Employer's Liability, Section B shall
be $1,000,000 per occurrence when Work is to be over water and involves maritime
exposures to cover all employees not covered under the State Worker's Compensation
Act, otherwise this limit shall be no less than $500,000 per occurrence.

Note: If your company is not required by law to carry workmen’s compensation
insurance, i.e. not a Louisiana company, sole employee of the company, then
bidders must request a workmen’s compensation insurance declaration affidavit
prior to the bid opening date. This insurance declaration affidavit must be fully
completed, signed, properly notarized and submitted with the bid. A scanned copy
may be submitted with the bid; however, the successful bidder must submit the
original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract
execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being

1|Pag Revised 10 22 2020



rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the
next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

M OMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABI

Shall provide limits not less than the following: $1,000,000.00 Combined Single Limit
per Occurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

¥  COMPR

Bodily injury liability $1,000,000.00 each person; $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.
Property Damage Liability $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.

Note: This category may be omitted if bidders do not/will not utilize company
vehicles for the project or do not possess company vehicles. Bidder must request
an automobile insurance declaration affidavit prior to the bid opening date. This
insurance declaration affidavit must be fully completed, signed, properly notarized
and submitted with the bid. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly
notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid; however, the successful bidder
must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material
alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to
award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

DEDUCTIBLES - The Parish Attorney with concurrence of the
Director of Risk Management have waived the deductible section of
the Terms and Conditions for all Invitations to Bid, until further notice.

uMB ILITY COVERAGE
An umbrella policy or excess may be used to meet minimum requirements.

FORC VATION CTS:
The following are required if selected below. Such insurance is due upon contract execution.

[ ] OWNER’S PROTECTIVE LIABILITY

To be for the same limits of liability for bodily injury and property damage
liability established for commercial general liability.

|:| ’ RANCE

The contractor shall maintain Builder’s Risk Insurance at his own expense to
insure both the owner (Parish of Jefferson) and contractor as their interest may
appear.

2|: g ¢ Revised 10 22 2020



G ® DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
ACORD CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE i thioes

THIS CERTIFICATE 1S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER GONIACT  Kyra Fairchild
Hartwig Moss Insurance Agency P—m";f:’"ﬁ £y (504) 525-9901 IF;}’(‘:I noj: (504) 569-9900
2626 Canal Street AL . Kyra@hmia.com
drd Floor INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
New Orleans LA 70119-6410 | \ysyrera: United Fire & Casualty Co 13021
INSURED nsuRerB: Bridgefield Casualty Ins Co 10335

C. Bud Taulli Gonstruction, Inc. GO e

INSURER D :

3044 Barataria Blvd INSURERE

Mamero LA 70072 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  23-24 Cert REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO GERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

ADDL]SUBR]
'E?RR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (nﬁg:ung‘fv% ¢5%§YN$KY§1 LIMITS
><| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OGCURRENCE ¢ 1,000,000
I CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR ?QEM%:E;O;E'; occrfr?enae) s 100,000
|| MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
A 60387169 10/02/2023 | 10/02/2024 | prpsonaLsaovingury | s 1:000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
> poriey [ 58 [ ] oc PRODUCTS - COMPIOPAGG | s 2:000.000
OTHER: $
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT s 1,000,000
| ™ (Ea accidenl) ! 2
5 ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
OWNED SCHEDULED i
A | | AUTos ony i 60387169 10/02/2023 | 10/02/2024 | BODILY INJURY (Per accidenl) | §
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
|| AuTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY | (Per accident)
$
| ><| umBRELLALIAB | <] occuR EACH OCCURRENCE s 2,000,000
A EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE 60387169 10/02/2023 | 10/02/2024 AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
DED I | RETENTION § $
WORKERS COMPENSATION X] PER [ I OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Yin STATUTE ER
500,000
B [ O AR EREXECUTIVE NIA 019805127 10/02/2023 | 10/02/2024 | EL-EACHACCIDENT $
(Mandatary i NH) EL. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE | 5 900,000
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICYLIMIT | $ 500,000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHIGLES (ACORD 101, Additional h may be if more space is required)
Bid Number 50-00143819
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
200 Derbigny Street
General Govemnment Bldg, Ste 4 AU THOR A RET TR ENIGINE
Gretna LA 70053 @;&%’———
|
©1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
ACORD 25 (2016/03) The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



