

CAMERON PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

FURNITURE AND EQUIPMENT BID FOR SOUTH CAMERON HIGH SCHOOL BID # 2010-35-47

ITEM NUMBER	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	COMMENT
<i>Furniture listed below (blue) is to be delivered to South Cameron School site, 753 Oak Grove Hwy, Grand Chenier, LA 70643 On August 2, 2010</i>						
ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES						
DM-7132-97	DMI	10 FT CONFERENCE TABLE	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-81	DMI	EXEC. MID BACK LEATHER EXECUTIVE CHAIR	16	NO BID		
DM-7132-25BC	DMI	BUFFET	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-650	DMI	PRESENTATION BOARD	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-848	DMI	LEFT-U DESK-CREDENZA-BRIDGE (PRINCIPAL)	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-635	DMI	HUTCH	3	NO BID		
DM-7132-847	DMI	RIGHT U-DESK-CREDENZA-BRIDGE (ST/SB)	2	NO BID		
DM-6835-1105	DMI	BLACK HIGH BACK LEATHER CHAIR (PRINCIPAL)	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-51	DMI	DESK RETURN (LEFT)	3	NO BID		
DM-7132-50	DMI	DESK RETURN (RIGHT)	1	NO BID		
SAF-4335MH	SAFCO	LITERATURE RACK	1	NO BID		
DM-7132-16	DMI	2 DRAWER LATERAL FILE	4	NO BID		
DM-7132-277	DMI	4 DRAWER LATERAL FILE FINISHED BACK	4	NO BID		
DM-7132-23	DMI	CREDENZA FULL RETURN BASE	2	NO BID		
DM-7132-07	DMI	LATERAL FILE STORAGE CABINET	1	NO BID		
CH-5800	CAROLINA HOUSE	LOVESEAT WH-2121 (CAPPUCINO W/CHERRY FINISH)	1	NO BID		
CH-5850	CAROLINA HOUSE	CHAIR WH-2121 (CAPPUCINO W/ CHERRY FINISH)	2	NO BID		
CH-1160	CAROLINA HOUSE	COFFEE TABLE- CHERRY FINISH	1	NO BID		
CH-1553	CAROLINA HOUSE	TRIPLE SEAT/CHERRY FINISH WHI-2137	2	NO BID		
CH-1552	CAROLINA HOUSE	DOUBLE SEAT/CHERRY FINISH WHI-2137	1	NO BID		
CH-1550CCT	CAROLINA HOUSE	CORNER TABLE CONNECTOR W/LEG -CHERRY FINISH	1	NO BID		
CH-1550CT	CAROLINA HOUSE	CONNECTOR TABLE- CHERRY FINISH	1	NO BID		

[illegible]

ITEM NUMBER	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	COMMENT
COMPUTER LABS- HIGH SCHOOL/ BUSINESS LAB/ GIFTED						
VER-LSD36 CH/BK	VERSA	36X30 LAPTOP WORK STATION CHERRY/BK	77	NO BID		
VER-WK1112	VERSA	WHEEL KIT	77	NO BID		
SCH-150-17	SCHOLARCRAFT	STACK CHAIR BLACK LARGE SEAT	50	48.00	2,400.00	As specified Delivered & Installed
ALE-TK48FA10B	ALERA	SWIVEL TASK CHAIR	27	NO BID		
ALE-VA72RE6024MC	ALERA	24X60 NESTING TABLES	3	NO BID		
SCH-150-15	SCHOLARCRAFT	STACK CHAIR CRANBERRY LARGE SEAT	6	47.50	285.00	As specified Delivered & Installed
SCIENCE LABS(3) HIGH/ MIDDLE SCHOOL						
NPS-6418-HB	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	ADJUSTABLE HEIGHT PADDED STOOL	82	94.00	7,708.00	As specified Delivered & Installed
ART ROOM						
B52916-1003	BLICK	ART HORSE	8	NO BID		
Z40980	MILLER	DISPLAY PANEL 48X80 BLK FABRIC	4	NO BID		
Z15995	ENASCO	WOODEN EASELS RICHESON DULCE EASEL	8	NO BID		
Z15792	FLEETWOOD	2 TEIR STORAGE SYSTEM	2	NO BID		
Z17675	ENASCO	SATURN WIRE DRYING RACK 32X48 -40 TRAYS	2	NO BID		
B53004-1001	BLICK	TRACE-MASTER OPAQUE PROJECTOR	2	NO BID		
LT-GBB	MILLER	MULTIPLEX DISPLAY PANELS SET OF 3	2	NO BID		
Z11957	ENASCO	2 TIER PAPER STORAGE SYSTEM	2	NO BID		
DIV-P7402K30N	DIVERSIFIED	42X72 ART TABLE CHEM GUARD SURFACE-GOLDEN OAK	8	641.00	5,128.00	As specified Delivered & Installed
THC-LB6118-788-60	COOPER CABINETS	GOLDEN OAK LADDER BACK CHAIR	32	NO BID		
Z-15792	FLEETWOOD	TOTE TRAY CABINET	2	NO BID		

ITEM NUMBER	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	COMMENT
TEACHER LOUNGE						
1-BT60-R	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	ROUND TABLE	1	194.50	194.50	As Specified Delivered & Installed
NPS-9200	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	CHAIRS- MIDNIGHT BLUE	6	48.00	288.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
HOME ECONOMICS						
ALE-VA72RE7224MC	ALERA	24 X 72 NESTING TABLES	9	NO BID		
SCH-150-17	SCHOLARCRAFT	STACK CHAIR- CRANBERRY- LARGE SEAT	51	48.00	2,448.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
SCH-200	SCHOLARCRAFT	CHAIR DOLLY	4	71.50	286.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
THC-SLB-227	COOPER CABINET	BAR STOOLS	4	NO BID		
HIGH SCHOOL						
HON 38000	HON	DESK 30 X66 CHARCOAL/MAHOGANY	15	335.11	5,026.65	As Specified Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
HON 380001	HON	RETURN 48" WIDE (L OR R TO BE DETERMINED @BID AWARD	15	219.48	3,292.20	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
HON-38852NS	HON	CREDENZA	1	340.38	340.38	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
SCH-630-17	SCHOLARCRAFT	STUDENT DESK 17 1/2 " CRANBERRY W/GOLDEN OAK	250	74.50	18,625.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
THC-SLB-227	COOPER CABINET	BAR STOOLS	4	NO BID		
MIDDLE SCHOOL						
HON 38000	HON	DESK 30 X66 CHARCOAL/MAHOGANY	14	335.11	4,691.54	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
HON 380001	HON	RETURN 48" WIDE (L OR R TO BE DETERMINED @BID AWARD	14	219.48	3,072.72	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
SCH-630-17	SCHOLARCRAFT	STUDENT DESK 17 1/2 " CRANBERRY W/GOLDEN OAK	130	74.50	9,685.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
SCH-630-15	SCHOLARCRAFT	STUDENT DESK 15 1/2 " CRANBERRY W/GOLDEN OAK	55	77.00	4,235.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed
ELEMENTARY SCHOOL						
HON 38000	HON	DESK 30 X66 CHARCOAL/MAHOGANY	16	335.11	5,361.76	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
HON 380001	HON	RETURN 48" WIDE (L OR R TO BE DETERMINED @BID AWARD	16	219.48	3,511.68	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
HON-38852NS	HON	CREDENZA	3	340.38	1,021.14	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered & Installed
MHR-6066H	MAHOR	HORSESHOE TABLE OAKTOP/BK BAND STD. LEGS	1	235.00	235.00	Bidding Scholar Craft # FS949HS6066-2140 Delivered & Installed
MHR-2448	MAHOR	24 X 48 RECT. TABLE OAKTOP/BK BAND STD. LEGS	2	116.00	232.00	Bidding Scholar Craft # FS949RE2448-2140 Delivered & Installed
SCH-120-15 RED	SCHOLARCRAFT	15 1/2" STACK CHAIR	14	32.00	448.00	As Specified Delivered & Installed

ITEM NUMBER	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	COMMENT
PUBLICATIONS ROOM						
SCH-150	SCHOLARCRAFT	STACK CHAIR CRANBERRY- LARGE SEAT	12	48.00	576.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
DIV-P7142K30N	DIVERSIFIED	30 X 60 LAB TABLE CHEM GUARD SURFACE-OAK FINISH	3	489.00	1,467.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
ALE-VA72RE6024MC	ALERA	24 X 60 NESTING TABLE	3	No Bid		
PBS ROOM						
ALE-VA72HR4824MC	ALERA	HALF ROUND TABLE TOPS	2	No Bid		
ALE-VA72RE7224MC	ALERA	RECTANGULAR TABLE TOPS	6	No Bid		
NPS-8664	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	SIGNATURE STACK CHAIR-DIAMOND NAVY	16	52.50	840.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
MULTIPURPOSE ROOM						
PL137	ISAAC ROGERS	10 FT. CONFERENCE TABLE	6	No Bid		
DH-271	DECATUR HOUSE	GUEST CHAIR BLACK	60	No Bid		
TEACHER WORKROOM						
CR40Z7200	LAMINATION TECHNOLOGY	27W LAMINATOR	1	No Bid		
MBM-4002CC	MBM	HEAVY DUTY SHREDDER	6	No Bid		
PL136	ISAAC ROGERS	8FT CONFERENCE TABLE	2	No Bid		
NOR-7901BK	NORSTAR	BLK HIGH BACK CHAIR	8	No Bid		
SAF-1858GR	SAFCO	COPIER/LAMINATOR STAND	1	No Bid		
GBC-9800350	ACCO/GBC	ELECTRIC PAPER PUNCH	6	No Bid		
MAR-1217A	MARTIN YALE	FOLDING MACHINE	6	No Bid		
READING COACH ROOM						
MHR-4872 OAK BLK STD	MAHOR	KIDNEY SHAPE TABLE OAK BLK BAND	1	194.00	194.00	Biding Scholar Craft #FS949KD4872-2140
ALE-VA72R-4848MC	ALERA	48" ROUND CONFERENCE TABLE-CHERRY FINISH	1	No Bid		
ND-IR105	ISAAC ROGERS	GUEST CHAIR- BLK CHERRY FINISH	6	No Bid		

Delivered +
Installed

ITEM NUMBER	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Quantity	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	COMMENT
THROUGH OUT SCHOOL						
LUX-OHT29BLK	LUXOR	BLACK OVERHEAD PROJECTOR STAND	24	152.25	3,654.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
BLT-89759	BALT	MULTIMEDIA CART	45	215.00	9,675.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
HON-314PS	HON	4 DRAWER LETTER FILE CABINET -CHARCOAL	51	134.85	6,877.35	Hon State Contract # 408247 Delivered + Installed
X-SEL29601NY	X-SEL	AVANTI SUPER CHAIR	50	NO BID		
EXT-138-1K	EXPANDED TECH	SLIP ON FLOOR SAVERS 1000 P/BOX	4	NO BID		
CAFETORIUM						
NPS-BT60R	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	60" ROUND TABLES	50	194.50	9,725.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
NPS-DY-60R	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	CART FOR ROUND TABLE	5	219.00	1,095.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
CLS-3400B	CLARIN	FOLDING CHAIRS-CLARVINYL GREY/OPAL SILVER MET. FRAME	500	80.00	40,000.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
NPS-BT3072	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	RECTANGULAR TABLES	12	136.00	1,632.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
NPS-DY-3072/3096	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	CHAIR TRUCK FOR RECTANGULAR TABLES	1	232.00	232.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
BFT-CBT829	BIOFIT	8FT. BY 29" HIGH BENCH TABLE-BLK FRAME-GREY NEBULA	40	553.69	22,147.60	Bidding SICO 2007 pricing State Contract # 407072 - based on Delivered + Installed
NPS-84	NATL. PUBLIC SEATING	CHAIR TRUCK FOR FOLDING CHAIRS (HOLDS 84)	6	323.00	1,938.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
BFT-12F4ADA32C	BIOFIT	ADA CAFETERIA TABLE CHROME/GREY NEBULA TOP	1	1085.26	1,085.26	Bidding SICO 2007 pricing State Contract # 407072 based on Delivered + Installed
BFT-10F1224-C	BIOFIT	PRESCHOOLER LUNCH TABLE CHROME/GREY NEBULA	3	1140.87	3,422.61	Bidding SICO 2007 pricing State Contract # 407072 Delivered + Installed
901	OKLAHOMA SOND	WOOD VENEER LECTURN 900 SERIES/ LECTERN BASE	4	807.00	3,228.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
910	OKLAHOMA SOND	WOOD VENEER LECTURN 900 SERIES/	4	807.00	3,228.00	AS Specified Delivered + Installed
My signature <u><i>Harry J. Gulletta</i></u> indicates that I have read this statement and all prices are inclusive as stated.						
Please note that bid will be awarded to low bidder per line item .						