



Pyramid School Products

6510 N 54th Street Tampa FL 33610
PHONE- (800) 792-2644 FAX- (813) 621-7688
E-MAIL- bids@pyramidsp.com

February 15, 2016

St. Charles Parish School Board
13855 River Rd.
Luling, LA 70070

RE: Bid for Janitorial Supplies

To Whom It May Concern:

Thank you for the opportunity to respond to this proposal. Our bid reference number for this project is **#21616STCH**. **This number must be listed on all orders placed against this bid.** Please refer to this number when corresponding with us regarding shipments or any other matter as it may arise.

****Also, please note the case-pack requirements listed in the bid.**

(Orders may be e-mailed to our Sales Department at orders@pyramidsp.com. For questions regarding shipments or invoices, please contact our Customer Service Department at ext 248, or by e-mail at customerservice@pyramidsp.com.)

If you have any questions regarding the bid documents, or need additional information, please feel free to contact us @ (800) 792-2644, Ext. 233.

Sincerely,

Pyramid School Products
Bid Department

Conforms to Document A310™ - 2010

Bid Bond

CONTRACTOR:

(Name, legal status and address)

Pyramid Paper Company Inc.
dba Pyramid School Products
6510 N. 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610

SURETY:

(Name, legal status and principal place of business)

OHIO FARMERS INSURANCE COMPANY
1 Park Circle, PO Box 5001
Westfield Center, OH 44251-5001

OWNER:

(Name, legal status and address)

**St. Charles Parish School Board
Luling LA**

BOND AMOUNT:

Five Percent of the Total Amount Bid (5%)

PROJECT:

(Name, location or address, and Project number, if any)

Bid for Janitorial Supplies

The Contractor and Surety are bound to the Owner in the amount set forth above, for the payment of which the Contractor and Surety bind themselves, their heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, as provided herein. The conditions of this Bond are such that if the Owner accepts the bid of the Contractor within the time specified in the bid documents, or within such time period as may be agreed to by the Owner and Contractor, and the Contractor either (1) enters into a contract with the Owner in accordance with the terms of such bid, and gives such bond or bonds as may be specified in the bidding or Contract Documents, with a surety admitted in the jurisdiction of the Project and otherwise acceptable to the Owner, for the faithful performance of such Contract and for the prompt payment of labor and material furnished in the prosecution thereof; or (2) pays to the Owner the difference, not to exceed the amount of this Bond, between the amount specified in said bid and such larger amount for which the Owner may in good faith contract with another party to perform the work covered by said bid, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in full force and effect. The Surety hereby waives any notice of an agreement between the Owner and Contractor to extend the time in which the Owner may accept the bid. Waiver of notice by the Surety shall not apply to any extension exceeding sixty (60) days in the aggregate beyond the time for acceptance of bids specified in the bid documents, and the Owner and Contractor shall obtain the Surety's consent for an extension beyond sixty (60) days.

If this Bond is issued in connection with a subcontractor's bid to a Contractor, the term Contractor in this Bond shall be deemed to be Subcontractor and the term Owner shall be deemed to be Contractor.

When this Bond has been furnished to comply with a statutory or other legal requirement in the location of the Project, any provision in this Bond conflicting with said statutory or legal requirement shall be deemed deleted herefrom and provisions conforming to such statutory or other legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated herein. When so furnished, the intent is that this Bond shall be construed as a statutory bond and not as a common law bond.

Signed and sealed this 15th day of February, 2016

[Signature]
(Witness)

Pyramid Paper Co. Inc. dba Pyramid School Products
(Principal) (Seal)

By: [Signature]
Secretary (Title)

OHIO FARMERS INSURANCE COMPANY
(Surety) (Seal)

By: [Signature]
Judy D. Platt Attorney-in-Fact (Title)

ST. CHARLES PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

Instructions to Bidders

The St. Charles Parish School Board will receive sealed bids until 9:00 a.m., February 16, 2016, in accordance with the following instructions and attached specifications.

1. Bids shall be submitted on the attached bid form. Any bid on any item shall include a unit price and a total price. If there is any discrepancy between the unit price and the total price extension, the unit price shall be considered binding and the total price will be adjusted accordingly.
2. **All bids shall be either hand delivered or sent by registered or certified mail with a return receipt requested** to the St. Charles Parish School Board Office, 13855 River Road, Luling, Louisiana 70070, in a sealed envelope clearly marked on the outside, **"BID ON JANITORIAL SUPPLIES February 16, 2016."** Bids will also be accepted electronically via our website www.stcharles.k12.la.us, under "Quick Links," select "Online Bids, RFP's, etc."

All bids arriving after the stated date and time will be returned unopened to the bidder(s). No bid may be withdrawn for at least forty-five (45) days after the scheduled closing time for the receipt of bids.

3. Prices shall include delivery charges to all St. Charles Parish Schools and the Warehouse at 165 School Board Lane, Luling, Louisiana 70070. A list of school sites and addresses is attached. Prices are to be good for a period of (1) **one year** beginning March 24, 2016, and ending March 23, 2017. Sales tax **IS NOT** to be included in your bid prices.

4. Bidders may bid on the entire list of supplies or any individual item or any combination of items.

5. Any deviations from specifications, including chemical or material content, size or weight, number of items per case or carton, volume per container or package, etc., shall be clearly indicated on bid form.

6. **ALL BIDS SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A BID BOND, CERTIFIED CHECK, CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMOUNT OF FIVE PERCENT (5%) OF THE TOTAL AMOUNT OF THE BID. BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED UNLESS THE REQUIRED CHECK OR BID BOND IS ATTACHED.**

PLEASE SEND US
A COPY OF RECAP
THANK YOU

(22)

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, Florida 33610-1908
(AC 813) 621-6446
Toll Free 800-792-2644
(Fax) 813-621-7688

7. A Performance Bond in the total amount of the order(s) will be required from the successful bidder(s) if the amount purchased exceeds \$1,000.00.

8. Model numbers, catalog cuts, descriptive literature and detailed specifications on all items **MUST** be included as part of your bid if bidding items other than specified. Failure to submit any of the above may be sole cause for rejection of bid on that particular item. Bidders may be required to submit samples on specific items if bidding other than specified. All samples shall be delivered to the St. Charles Parish School Board Warehouse, 165 School Board Lane, Luling, Louisiana, **WITHIN THREE DAYS OF NOTIFICATION**. Samples shall be labeled as to the name brand, manufacturer, and bidder. Samples must be picked up within 10 days of notification or samples will become the property of St. Charles Parish Public Schools. Failure to submit samples may be sole cause for rejection of bid on that particular item.

9. Material Safety Data Sheets are required for each chemical product bid and must be submitted with bid. Failure to submit MSDS sheet with bid may be cause for rejection of that particular item. The chemicals shall be contained in compatible, stable packaging, which bears a batch number, which will permit identification of the date, time, and location of the manufacturer of that specific batch of product.

10. Quantities listed on this bid will be ordered between March 24, 2016, and March 23, 2017. The quantities on the bid form are estimates and represent estimated requirements for the entire year. Orders will be placed on an "as needed" basis.

11. Preference, in accordance with Louisiana Revised Statute 38:2251, will be given to Louisiana products, materials, supplies or equipment. As a bidder you **MUST** indicate on your bid response that the product for which you are claiming this preference meets the criteria of a Louisiana product.

12. It is the intent of the specifications to invite bids on high quality merchandise. Mentioning a brand, manufacturer, and number is done only to establish the standard of quality desired. It is not the intent to eliminate brands of equal quality but instead to set forth and convey to prospective bidders the general style, type, character, and quality of the product desired.

13. The School Board reserves the right to select a higher priced item where, in the judgment of the School Board, such item is of superior quality or designs or would be more suitable for the purpose intended. The School Board further reserves the right to reject any and all bids, adjust quantities by increasing or decreasing and to waive all informalities.

14. The School Board reserves the right to buy any of the bid items from State Contract if those prices are more favorable.

15. The School Board may take samples at random from containers and submit to an accredited laboratory to determine if the delivered merchandise meets all specification requirements. If merchandise does not meet the requirements, it will be rejected with supplier being charged for cost of laboratory analysis. The School Board will purchase materials to replace those rejected at the market price and the difference will be charged against the bidder or his bondsman. In the future, bids will not be accepted from supplier delivering merchandise that has been rejected.

ST. CHARLES PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

By _____
Patrick O'Malley
Ancillary Services

ST. CHARLES PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORM ON JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

PLEASE SEND US
A COPY OF RECAP
THANK YOU!

2016-2017

Pyramid School Products
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, Florida 33610-1908

1. WASTE RECEPTACLES (PLASTIC) - (650001) - 50-Gallon, double ribbed base, round corners, heavy-duty plastic, seamless construction, interlocking handles, attached hinge lid, built-in 8" rubber wheels. TO BE AS RUBBERMAID BRUTE BIGWHEEL NO. 3559 PLASTIC CONTAINER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 40 each

| | | | |
|---------------|--------------------------|-------------|----------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Rubbermaid</u> | Unit Price | <u>79.98</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>3559-(new # 9027)</u> | Total Price | <u>3199.20</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>EA</u> | | |

2. WASTEBASKETS (PLASTIC - CLASSROOM SIZE) - (650003) - 41 1/4-Quart heavy-duty plastic, seamless construction, 15 1/4"Wx11"Dx19 7/8"H. TO BE AS RUBBERMAID NO. 2957 CLASSROOM TRASH CANS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 322 each (12 EA / ctn. Full ctns only)

| | | | |
|---------------|-------------------|-------------|----------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Rubbermaid</u> | Unit Price | <u>4.94</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>2957</u> | Total Price | <u>1590.68</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>EA</u> | | |

3. CAN LINERS (24x33) - (650004) - Can liner black coreless rolls, .35mil., 24"x33", 12-16 gallons, 1000 count per box (20/50). . Gross case weight 18.4 lbs. TO BE AS Inter-Plast NO. IG-SL2433LTK CAN LINER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 282 boxes

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | <u>NO BID</u> |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

4. CAN LINERS (38x58) - (650005) - Extra heavy weight coreless rolls, .80 mil., 38" x58" 60 gallons, 100 count per box. Gross case weight 11.7. TO BE AS Inter-Plast NO. IG-SL3858XHW DRUM CAN LINER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 1900 boxes

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|-------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | _____ |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

5. CAN LINERS (40x46) - (65006) -Extra Heavy Weight coreless rolls, .80 mil., 40" x46", 40-50 gallons, 100 count per box (20/50). Gross case weight 9.8lbs. TO BE AS Inter-Plast NO. IG-SL4046XHW CAN LINER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 1200 boxes

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|--------------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | <u>NO BP</u> |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

6. SANITARY NAPKIN BAGS - (650007) - 12 3/4" x 7 1/2" x 7 8" Waxed; 500 bags per case, to fit all wall mounted disposable units TO BE AS SANISAC NO. 77 LINERS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 30 cases

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Haspeco</u> | Unit Price | <u>12.25</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>KL260</u> | Total Price | <u>367.50</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>EA</u> | | |

7. BROOMS - (PARLOR) - (651011) - 100% corn fibers, wire wound, 42" painted handle. TO BE AS ROYAL BROOM NO. RB9902 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 150 each (12 EA/ctn. Full ctns only)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Wilco</u> | Unit Price | <u>2.83</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>E503000</u> | Total Price | <u>424.50</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>EA</u> | | |

8. MOPS-(DECK) - (651020) - All purpose 100% cotton, 16 oz., 4-ply wire wound on smooth 48" handle. TO BE AS NO. 16 ABCO DECKMOP OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 60 each (12 EA/ctn. Full ctns only)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>2.09</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>CD50016</u> | Total Price | <u>125.40</u> |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

9. TOILET BOWL BRUSH - (652013) - Polypropylene is twisted in wire and shaped to clean interior bowl surfaces; plastic handle; hang up hole. TO BE AS PROLINE BOWL BRUSH BRU 6217 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 113 each (12 EA/ctn. Full ctns only)

| | | | |
|---------------|--------------|-------------|--------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>.59</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>00017</u> | Total Price | <u>66.67</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>EA</u> | | |

10. TOILET BOWL MOP (with ringer) - (652015) - All purpose 100% cotton on smooth 22" handle with hanger & ringer

Quantity: Approximately 64 each (50 EA/can. Full ctas only)
 Brand Name Folco Unit Price 78
 Stock Number 280105 Total Price 49.92
 Unit of Issue EA

11. MOP HEADS (GENERAL PURPOSE) - (651022) - 20 oz. cotton pinn with screw connection to be used with Item 13. Below. TO BE AS WILEN No. 20WI-CL20 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 80 each (12 EA/can. Full ctas only)
 Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 2.59
 Stock Number CM22245 Total Price 207.20
 Unit of Issue EA

12. MOP HEADS (FINISH) - (651024) - 20 oz., 4-ply rayon pinn with screw connection; to be used with Item 13. below. TO BE AS WILEN MOP HEADS NO. RM-32205 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 140 each (12 EA/can. Full ctas only)
 Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 2.98
 Stock Number RM32205 Total Price 417.20
 Unit of Issue EA

13. MOP HANDLES - (651026) - Metal threaded connector countersunk into 60" hard wood handle for easy screw-on attachment to mop head. To fit items 11. and 12. above.

Quantity: Approximately 280 each (12 EA/can. Full ctas only)
 Brand Name Greenwood Unit Price 2.77
 Stock Number 416 Total Price 775.6
 Unit of Issue EA

14. LOBBY DUSTPAN WITH HANDLES - (651015) - 5 3/4" x 12" x 36" TO BE AS RUBBERMAID NO. 2007 LOBBY DUST PAN WITH HANDLES OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 202 each (6 EA/can. Full ctas only)
 Brand Name Rubbermaid Unit Price 5.89
 Stock Number FG2531 Total Price 1189.78
 Unit of Issue EA

15. **FLOOR FINISH - (653020)** - Metal-complexed synthetic polymer floor finish, non-volatile, storage stability, slip resistance, for use on all floors except unsealed wood or cork, Covers 2000-2500 sq.ft. per gallon; must be in 5-gallon boxes. **TO BE AS JOHNSON DIVERSEY'S COMPLETE OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 600 - 5 gallon boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

16. **FLOOR STRIPPER - (653022)** - Concentrated, liquid wax stripper, penetrates old and dirty metal complexed polymer emulsion finishes to permit their subsequent removal by a mop or scrubbing machine; for use on and not harmful to any type of hard, resilient flooring, phosphate free, biodegradable surfactants, non-volatile, must be in 5-gallon boxes. **TO BE AS JOHNSON DIVERSEY BRAVO EXTRA HEAVY DUTY STRIPPER OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 343 - 5 gallon boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

17. **BLEACH - (656023)** - 5.25% sodium Hypochlorite, 1-gallon containers. **TO BE AS CLOROX BLEACH OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 1800 - 1 gallon containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

*Spec
MSDS*

18. **POWDER CLEANSER - (656024)** - Chlorine cleanser containing color active bleach, should not contain any phosphates; 21 oz. containers. **TO BE AS COMET DISINFECTANT CLEANSER WITH CHLORINAL OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 72 - 21 oz. Containers (MSDS REQUIRED) *(24 - 21oz. Cont. per case)*

Brand Name BABO Unit Price .96
 Stock Number P752088 Total Price 69.12
 Unit of Issue 21 oz. Container

19. TOILET BOWL CLEANER - (652025) - Acid free bathroom cleanser, germicide, disinfectant, deodorizer; quart containers. **TO BE AS ALLSTAR NON-ACID RESTROOM CLEANER RTU NO. U 15272 OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 218 - 1 quart containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

NO BID

20. DEFOAMER - (653040) - Water-based, complex defoamer stabilized with a blend of organic and inorganic silicone for maximum defoaming, 32oz. container. **TO BE AS JOHNSON DIVERSEY DEFOAMER OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 45 - 32 oz. Containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

21. PAPER TOWELS - (654027) - Single-fold bleach towel, 10 1/4 x 9 1/4 open size; 250 sheets per pack, 16 packs per case 24.2# Cs. Wt.; **TO BE AS SCA-SB1840 PAPER TOWELS OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 1628 cases

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

22. TOILET TISSUE - (654030) - 2-ply toilet tissue 4.5 x 4.5, 500 sheets per roll, 96 rolls per case, 44.8 pound Case Weight. **TO BE AS Georgia Pacific GP-19800 TOILET TISSUE OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 31 cases

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

23. WIPERS - (654036) - All purpose wipers ^{12" x 13"} 12.5" x 14.4" ⁵⁰ (quarter fold) 56 wipers per pack; 18 packs per case. **TO BE AS KIMBERLY-CLARK WYP-ALL NO. 0570110 ALL PURPOSE WIPERS OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 3000 packs (6 PKGS/cs. Full cs. only)

Brand Name MOTI Unit Price 5.99
 Stock Number 89007 Total Price 17,970.00
 Unit of Issue 50/PKGS.

24. VANDALISM MARK REMOVER PRE-MOISTENED TOWELS - (656048)
 One-step cleaning system removes graffiti and spray paint from signage, stainless steel, glass, lockers, vinyl upholstery, vehicles and buses, 10 1/2" x 12 1/4" pre-moistened towels, 30 per container. TO BE AS (TW DYMOM SCRUBS) OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 300 - Containers (MSDS REQUIRED) *(6 cont./case, Full cases only)*

Brand Name DYMO - Scrubs Unit Price 8.69
 Stock Number 90130 Total Price 2607.00
 Unit of Issue 30/cont.

25. CHEWING GUM REMOVER - (656031) - Freezes gum and candle wax for easy removal, 7 oz. Aerosol cans. TO BE AS ALLSTAR GUM REMOVER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 200 - 7 oz. Cans (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12/case)*

Brand Name Chase (Spraypak) Unit Price 1.61
 Stock Number 433-4107 Total Price 322.00
 Unit of Issue 12 oz. can.

26. WASP AND HORNET SPRAY - (655032) - Indoor and outdoor use, 16' stream, conductivity = 40,100 volts, 11 oz. cans. TO BE AS ALLSTAR ASR-600 WASP AND HORNET SPRAY OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 1000 - 11 oz. Cans (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12/case)*

Brand Name Chase (Spraypak) Unit Price 2.79
 Stock Number 433-4108 Total Price 2790.00
 Unit of Issue 20 oz. can

27. FURNITURE POLISH - (656033) - Provides luster that helps protect wood and other surfaces against ordinary wear, resists smears, fingerprints, smudges and common oil-based marks, 15 oz. Aerosol can. TO BE AS JOHNSON SHINE-UP FOR INSTITUTIONAL AND COMMERCIAL USE FURNITURE POLISH OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 384 - 15 oz. cans (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12/case)*

Brand Name Chase (Spraypak) Unit Price 1.99
 Stock Number 433-4109 Total Price 764.16
 Unit of Issue 20 oz. can

28. URINAL BLOCKS (ROUND) - (652036) - Deodorizing, 3.0 oz. individually wrapped, ingredients: paradichlorobenzene. TO BE AS FRESH PRODUCTS URINAL BLOCKS (ROUND) NO. 92175 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 110 dozen (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12-03/cs. Full cs. only)*

Brand Name Fresh Unit Price 4.69
 Stock Number 4PAPS-PKG-DZ Total Price 515.00
 Unit of Issue DZ

Spec? MSDS enclosed

✓

✓

29. URINAL BLOCKS (WALL)- (652038) - Deodorizing, 16 oz. individually wrapped, with holder, ingredients: paradichlorobenzene. **TO BE AS FRESH PRODUCTS NO. 98014 OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 114 boxes (6 Bx/cs. Full cs. only) (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Fresh Unit Price 15.89
Stock Number 16 WBL4 Total Price 1811.46
Unit of Issue Bx of 6

30. ANT POISON - (655040) - 5% DURSBAN granules in ready to use form; one bag should cover 5000 sq. ft. **TO BE AS PENNINGTON'S PRIDE FIRE ANT GRANULES OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 344 - 10# bags (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price AD BIO
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

31. BUCKET & WRINGER COMBINATION - (651028) - Dual pack bucket and wringer; 8 gallon/32 liters with 3" casters. **TO BE AS IMPACT NO. 6000/2635-3 OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 35 sets

Brand Name Rubbermaid Unit Price 40.99
Stock Number #6.7580-88 Total Price 1434.65
Unit of Issue Set

32. SOAP PADS (656042) - Steel wool soap pads 2"x4", 10 pads per box, biodegradable surfactants for institutional use, hotel size. **TO BE AS BRILLO SOAP PADS HOTEL SIZE OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 600 boxes (12 Bx/cs. Full case only) (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Brillo Unit Price 1.86
Stock Number SP1210 Total Price 1116.00
Unit of Issue 10/Box

33. ABSORBENT (POWDERED) (656043) - Powder capable of absorbing body fluid spills, diesel fuel spills, gasoline spills, and other hazardous chemical spills; 1# bags. **TO BE AS SOAK IT ABSORBENT OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 484 1# bags (50 BAGS/cs. Full cs. only) (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Tolco - Soak it Unit Price 1.71
Stock Number 260406 Total Price 827.64
Unit of Issue 1 LB. BAG

Spec MSDS

34. DUSTERS (FEATHER) - (656046) - 14" overall length, ostrich feather dusters; handles with hang up holes. TO BE AS DUSTER CATS DUS14FD OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 101 each (24 ea/can, Full ctns only)

Brand Name LambSkin Spec. Unit Price 3.59
 Stock Number D14EC Total Price 362.39
 Unit of Issue EA

35. NEUTRAL - PH - DISINFECTANT CLEANER - (653092) - Neutral cleaner with disinfectant. Must kill HIV-1 on pre-cleaned environmental surfaces or objects previously soiled with blood/ body fluids. TO BE AS HI-TECH CITRUS DISINFECTANT CLEANER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 136 - 5 gallon containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

36. CARPET SPOTTER (GENERAL PURPOSE) - (653063) - General purpose carpet spot remover; 1 quart container. TO BE AS JOHNSON DIVERSEY GENERAL PURPOSE SPOTTER OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 288 - 1 quart containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

37. SPRAY BOTTLE W/TRIGGER (PLASTIC) - (656050) - 32-oz. plastic spray bottle with trigger

Quantity: Approximately 474 each (100 ea/can, Full ctns only)

Brand Name Impact Unit Price .72
 Stock Number 5032W6+902RW9 Total Price 341.28
 Unit of Issue EA

38. BOMB FOGGER - (655052) - Combination of two synthetic pyrethroids for total release lock down against flying and crawling insects. Special lock down valve allows the contents to be sprayed manually or automatically. One can treats up to 6,000 cubic feet. water-based formula has low residual odor and contains no chlorinated solvents or ozone depleters. USDA F2 Rated; 16 oz. can. TO BE AS AMREP FOG AWAY OR EQUAL.

Spec's
 MSDS
 enclosed

Quantity: Approximately 252 - 16 oz. cans (12/can) (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Chase Unit Price 3.69
 Stock Number 438-5105 Total Price 929.88
 Unit of Issue 8 oz-1 can

39. BAIT STATIONS (ROACH) - (655053) - Professional insect control roach bait stations, odorless, packaged in child resistant bait stations. TO BE AS COMBAT ROACH KILLER BAIT STATIONS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 72 each (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

40. DETERGENT (DISHWASHING LIQUID) - (656054) - Food service formula containing anionic and nonionic surfactants and ethanol. Appearance: Yellow liquid with lemon odor, 50-oz. container. TO BE AS LEMON SCENT JOY OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 466 - 42 oz. containers (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

Spec's
MSDS
enclosed

41. AIR FRESHENER/DISINFECTANT - (652096) - 20oz. Aerosol can, eliminates stale, musty odors. Must kill HIV-1 and Herpes Simplex type II Fungicidal and Virucidal. TO BE AS Linen Fresh Disinfectant Spray OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 1536 - 13 oz. cans (12/cs) (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Chase (Spraypak) Unit Price 1.89
 Stock Number 433-4104 Total Price 2903.04
 Unit of Issue 20 oz. can

42. GLUE TRAPS FOR RATS - (655057) - Non-poisonous glue traps for rats, mice and insects, non-drying, non-flowing glue retains holding power, plastic trays allow for clean, easy handling. TO BE AS EATON'S STICK-EM GLUE TRAPS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 465 packs (240 PKG. min order) (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Eaton Unit Price 1.82
 Stock Number 233N Total Price 846.30
 Unit of Issue PKG of 2

43. WHITE BOARD CLEANER - (656058) - White board cleaner for dry erase surfaces, porcelainized enamel, melamine, and Expo surfaces; 8 oz. plastic pump spray bottles. TO BE AS SANFORD EXPO NO. 81803 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 876 each (12 ea/can) (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name SANFORD (Expo) Unit Price 1.76
 Stock Number 81803 Total Price 1541.76
 Unit of Issue 8 oz. can

44. INSECTICIDE (WATER BASE) - (655059) - A residual, water based space and surface spray for the control of flying and crawling insects. For use indoors and outdoors; non-objectionable odor; rated with a specific gravity of 1.0; one gallon container. **TO BE AS ALLSTAR RESIDUAL WATER BASED INSECTIDE OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 344 - 1 gallon containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price AO BID
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

45. TOILET TISSUE ROLLS (JUNIOR JUMBO) - (654032) - Junior Jumbo toilet tissue roll, white 2-ply, 12" x 1000', Case Wt. 25.7lbs. (3.7" x 1000') 12 rolls/case. **TO BE AS SCA- TJ0922 OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 1010 cases

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

46. ANT BAITS - (655066) - Effective against Pharaoh, Argentine, Cornfield Ants; child resistant; to contain N-Ethyl perfluorooctanesulfonamide at .50%, 24 baits per box. **TO BE AS PROCONTROL DUAL CHOICE ANT BAIT**S OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 126 boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

47. GLASS & WINDOW CLEANER - (656070) - Liquid glass and window cleaner; USDA C-1 classification; ready to use; one gallon container; non-streaking, non-smearing, fortified with ammonia; 10.5 pH. **TO BE AS HI-TECH SPARKLE OR EQUAL.**

Quantity: Approximately 104 - 1 gallon containers (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

48. PADS (BLACK STRIPPING - 20") - (658007) - High Productivity stripping pads; 5 pads per case TO BE AS 3M 7300 20" BLACK STRIPPING PADS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 100 cases

Brand Name ACS Unit Price 15.69
Stock Number 73-20 Total Price 1569.0
Unit of Issue 5/case.

49. PADS (RED BUFFING - 20") - (658009) - Red buffer pads; 5 pads per case TO BE AS 3M 5100 20" RED BUFFER PADS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 6 cases

Brand Name ACS Unit Price 10.59
Stock Number 51-20 Total Price 63.54
Unit of Issue 5/case.

50. PADS (BEIGE BUFFING - 20") - (658010) - Beige buffing pads; 5 pads per case TO BE AS 3M 4200 20" BEIGE BUFFER PADS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 11 cases

Brand Name ACS Unit Price 10.59
Stock Number 42-20 Total Price 116.49
Unit of Issue 5/cs.

51. PADS (GREEN SCRUBBING - 20") - (658008) - Green scrubbing pads for scrubbing and cleaning; 5 pads per case. TO BE AS 3M SCOTCH BRITE 20" GREEN SCRUBBING PADS OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 14 cases

Brand Name ACS Unit Price 10.59
Stock Number 42-20 Total Price 148.26
Unit of Issue 5/cs.

52. PADS (HOG'S HAIR - 27") - (658030) - Hog's Hair pads for burnishing; 2 pads per case. TO BE AS AMERICO 20" 401727 HOG'S HAIR BURNISHING PADS 27" OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 10 cases

Brand Name ACS Unit Price 10.45
Stock Number 37-27-2 Total Price 104.50
Unit of Issue 2/cs.

53. BROOM ANGLER - (651012) -Jumbo Angler Broom, 12" wide flagged bristles fully washable fibers 42" handle TO BE AS Metropolitan House wares # 1123lg OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 174 each 12/cs.
 Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 3.14
 Stock Number 60462-12W Total Price 546.36
 Unit of Issue EA

54. TOWEL CABINET SINGLE FOLD - (654028) HEAVY DUTY SINGLE FOLD TOWEL DISPENSER TO FIT SINGLE FOLD TOWEL (STOCK # 50027). TO BE AS CONTINENTAL # 630 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 166 each (6 EA/cmv.)
 Brand Name Continental Unit Price 15.99
 Stock Number 630W Total Price 2654.34
 Unit of Issue EA

55. 9" JUMBO BATH TISSUE DISPENSER - (654034) 9" JUMBO BATH TISSUE DISPENSER WITH SMOKE COLORED COVER TO FIT MAIN STREET JUMBO ROLL TISSUE (STOCK # 50060). TO BE AS SCA ECLIPSE QUICKVIEW 66T OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 146 each
 Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

56. PADS (Green Scrubbing - 17") - (658001) - Green scrubbing pads for scrubbing and cleaning; 5 pads per case.

Quantity: Approximately 9 cases
 Brand Name ACS Unit Price 8.69
 Stock Number 55-17 Total Price 78.21
 Unit of Issue 5/case.

57. PADS (HOG'S HAIR - 20") - (658012) - Hog's Hair pads for burnishing; 5 pads per case.

Quantity: Approximately 26 cases
 Brand Name ACS Unit Price 10.59
 Stock Number 37-20 Total Price 275.34
 Unit of Issue 5/cs.

58. PADS (BLUE ICE BURNISHING - 20") - (658014) - Blue Ice pads for
Burnishing; 5 pads per case.

Quantity: Approximately 29 cases

| | | | |
|---------------|--------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ACS</u> | Unit Price | <u>10.59</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>52-20</u> | Total Price | <u>307.11</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>5/cs.</u> | | |

59. Enzyme Odor Eliminator - (652100) Multi-purpose Enzyme odor eliminator with pleasant scent, to be used on carpet and tile surfaces, biodegradable, must be effective on organic matter. Must be suitable for school setting. **TO BE AS Synergy System Odor Eliminator**

Quantity: Approximately 142 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | <u>NO BID</u> |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

60. Coffee Stirrers - (080045) - 1000/box

Quantity: Approximately 5 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|-------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | _____ |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

61. 9in. plate, Styrofoam black - (080025) - 125/SL

Quantity: Approximately 34 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|-------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | _____ |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

62. 9oz Clear Plastic Cup - (080015) - 25/SL

Quantity: Approximately 5 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|-------|-------------|-------|
| Brand Name | _____ | Unit Price | _____ |
| Stock Number | _____ | Total Price | _____ |
| Unit of Issue | _____ | | |

63. Maxi Pads (regular) - (717002) - 250/CASE

Quantity: Approximately 20 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Gardb Unit Price 25.98
 Stock Number 147A Total Price 519.6
 Unit of Issue 250/cs.

64. Hand Sanitizer Touch Free Refill - (652040)

Quantity: Approximately 26 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
 Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
 Unit of Issue _____

65. Disposable Vinyl Gloves - (717043) - Medium 100/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 112 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Tradex Unit Price 21.90
 Stock Number VMD5201 Total Price 2452.80
 Unit of Issue 100/Box, 10 Box/cs

66. Disposable Vinyl Gloves - (717044) - Large 100/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 74 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Tradex Unit Price 21.90
 Stock Number VLG5201 Total Price 1620.6
 Unit of Issue 100/Box, 10 Box/cs.

67. Disposable Vinyl Gloves - (717045) - Extra Large 100/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 18 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Tradex Unit Price 21.90
 Stock Number VXL5201 Total Price 394.20
 Unit of Issue 100/Box, 10 Box/cs.

68. Gloves Multi Purpose - (656092) - Extra Large

(12 PR/Box, Full Box only)
 Quantity: Approximately 168 pairs (MSDS REQUIRED)
 Brand Name Tradex Unit Price 44
 Stock Number LXL6500 Total Price 73.92
 Unit of Issue PR

69. Gloves Multi Purpose - (656090) - Large

Quantity: Approximately 108 pairs (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12 PR/Box, Full Bx only)*

Brand Name Trader Unit Price .44
Stock Number L166500 Total Price 47.52
Unit of Issue PR

70. Gloves Multi Purpose - (656088) - Medium

Quantity: Approximately 131 pairs (MSDS REQUIRED) *(12 PR/Box, Full Bx only)*

Brand Name Trader Unit Price .44
Stock Number L166500 Total Price 57.64
Unit of Issue PR

71. Fluorescent Bulbs - (660705) - 4 Foot

Quantity: Approximately 166 pairs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price ADBD
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

72. Fluorescent Bulbs - (660707) - 2 Foot 30/CASE

Quantity: Approximately 15 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

73. Batteries - (103001) - 9 VOLT 12/PACK - Alkaline

Quantity: Approximately 94 packs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Rayovac Unit Price 9.84
Stock Number AL9V-12 Total Price 924.96
Unit of Issue 12/PK.

74. Batteries - (103003) - AA (4 PACK) Alkaline

Quantity: Approximately 2000 packs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Rayovac Unit Price 1.04
Stock Number ALAA-4 Total Price 2080.00
Unit of Issue 4/PK.

75. Batteries - (103004) - AAA (4 PACK)

(Alkaline)

Quantity: Approximately 1431 packs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Rayovac Unit Price 1.04
 Stock Number ALAAA-4 Total Price 1488.24
 Unit of Issue 4/PKG.

76. Batteries - (103005) - C (12 PACK)

(Alkaline)

Quantity: Approximately 80 packs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Rayovac Unit Price 5.16
 Stock Number ALC-12 Total Price 412.80
 Unit of Issue 12/PKG.

77. Batteries - (103006) - D (12 PACK)

(Alkaline)

Quantity: Approximately 117 packs (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Rayovac Unit Price 7.32
 Stock Number ALD-12 Total Price 856.44
 Unit of Issue 12/PKG.

78. Dust Mop Handles - (657000)

(12 EA / case. Full chn only)

Quantity: Approximately 54 each (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 4.29
 Stock Number 01406NB Total Price 231.66
 Unit of Issue EA

79. Disposable Dust Mops - (657005) - 24x5

Quantity: Approximately 78 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 27.84
 Stock Number DOTL12524DB Total Price 2171.52
 Unit of Issue 12/cs.

80. Disposable Dust Mops - (657010) - 36x5

Quantity: Approximately 39 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name ABCO Unit Price 40.20
 Stock Number DOTL12536DB Total Price 1567.80
 Unit of Issue 12/cs.

81. Disposable Dust Mops - (657015) - 48x5

Quantity: Approximately 13 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|------------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>51.24</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>ADTL12548</u> | Total Price | <u>666.12</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>12/cs.</u> | | |

82. Disposable Dust Mops - (657020) - 60x5

Quantity: Approximately 6 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|--------------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>58.68</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>ADTL12560DB</u> | Total Price | <u>352.08</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>6/cs.</u> | | |

83. Dust Mop Frames - (657025) - 24x5

Quantity: Approximately 4 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|--------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>21.48</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>BH24524</u> | Total Price | <u>85.92</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>12/cs.</u> | | |

84. Dust Mop Frames - (657030) - 36x5

Quantity: Approximately 3 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|--------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>27.48</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>BH24536</u> | Total Price | <u>82.44</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>12/cs.</u> | | |

85. Dust Mop Frames - (657035) - 48x5

Quantity: Approximately 4 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|---------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>40.68</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>BH24548</u> | Total Price | <u>162.72</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>12/cs.</u> | | |

86. Dust Mop Frames - (657040) - 60x5

Quantity: Approximately 2 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

| | | | |
|---------------|----------------|-------------|--------------|
| Brand Name | <u>ABCO</u> | Unit Price | <u>29.94</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>BH24560</u> | Total Price | <u>59.88</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>6/cs.</u> | | |

87. 8 oz Styrofoam Cup - (080000) -25/SL

Quantity: Approximately 33 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO BID
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

88. 20 oz Styrofoam Cup - (080010) - 25/SL

Quantity: Approximately 51 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

89. 7 in. Plate Styrofoam White - (080020) - 125/SL

Quantity: Approximately 4 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

90. 10 in. Plate, Styrofoam White - (080030) - 125/SL

Quantity: Approximately 12 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

91. 6 in Plate, Black Plastic - (080035) - 125/SL

Quantity: Approximately 8 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

92. Black Foam Bowl - (080037) - 125/SL

Quantity: Approximately 9 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

93. 11.25x12.5 Napkin Lunch - (080040) - 500/PK

Quantity: Approximately 20 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

NO BID

94. Plastic Table Cover - (080050) - 40x300

Quantity: Approximately 16 rolls (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

95. Plastic Black Heavy Duty Forks - (080055) - 1000/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 27 boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

96. Plastic Black Heavy Duty Spoons - (080060) - 1000/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 23 boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

97. Plastic Black Heavy Duty Knives - (080065) - 1000/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 8 boxes (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

98. 16 in Black Plastic Cater Tray - (080070) -

Quantity: Approximately 3 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

99. Gloves Clear Plastic Medium - (080075) - 100/BOX

Quantity: Approximately 13 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name Trader Unit Price 3.99
Stock Number PMD6501 Total Price 51.87
Unit of Issue 100/BX, 10BX/CS.

100. 6' Table Cloth Fitted with Elastic - (080080) -

Quantity: Approximately 15 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price NO
Stock Number _____ Total Price 30
Unit of Issue _____

101. 8' Table Cloth Fitted with Elastic - (080085) -

Quantity: Approximately 13 cases (MSDS REQUIRED)

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

102. KITCHEN ROLL PAPER TOWELS - 2 PLY 11.0" X 8.0" SHEET SIZE
85 SHEETS PER ROLL, 30 ROLLS PER CASE NET CASE WT 15.5LBS TO BE AS
GEORGIA PACIFIC 27385 OR EQUAL

Quantity: Approximately 450 cases

Brand Name _____ Unit Price _____
Stock Number _____ Total Price _____
Unit of Issue _____

103. FACIAL TISSUE - 2 PLY 8.0" X 8.33" SHEET SIZE 100 SHEETS PER BOX, 30
BOXES PER CASE NET CASE WT 8.6LBS TO BE AS GEORGIA PACIFIC 48100 OR
EQUAL

Quantity: Approximately 550 cases

Brand Name General Paper Unit Price 14.99
Stock Number GEN6501 Total Price 8244.9
Unit of Issue 100/BX, 30BX/CS.

104. ZIPPER TOP QUART BAGS - 8"X8" LOW DENSITY POLY 2 MIL THICKNESS 1000 PER CASE.

Quantity: Approximately 600 cases

| | | | |
|---------------|------------------|-------------|------------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Americare</u> | Unit Price | <u>23.79</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>ZipQt(x2)</u> | Total Price | <u>14,274.00</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>1000/cs.</u> | | |

105. ZIPPER TOP GALLON BAGS - 12"X12" LOW DENSITY POLY 2 MIL THICKNESS 1000 PER CASE (10.5" x 10.9")

Quantity: Approximately 600 cases

| | | | |
|---------------|------------------|-------------|------------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Americare</u> | Unit Price | <u>43.99</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>ZipGAL</u> | Total Price | <u>26,394.00</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>1000/case</u> | | |

106. HAND SANITIZER - 18 12 OZ PUMP OR SQUEEZE BOTTLE, 12 BOTTLES PER CASE ACTIVE INGREDIENT MUST BE AT LEAST 62% ETHYL ALCOHOL. TO BE AS PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER 9659 OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 220 CASES

| | | | |
|---------------|--------------------------------|-------------|----------------|
| Brand Name | <u>DERMAGEL</u> | Unit Price | <u>34.68</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>5025-430-02</u> | Total Price | <u>7629.60</u> |
| Unit of Issue | <u>12 - 12 oz. Bottles/cs.</u> | | |

107. BABYWIPES - PREMIUM GRADE HYPOALLERGENIC FRAGRANCE FREE 7" X 8" 80 WIPERS PER PACK 12 PACKS PER CASE. PACK MUST BE ABLE TO DISPENSE WIPERS. NO REFILL PACKS WILL BE CONSIDERED. TO BE AS NICE'N CLEAN PREMIUM BABY WIPES OR EQUAL.

Quantity: Approximately 440 cases

| | | | |
|---------------|---------------------|-------------|------------------|
| Brand Name | <u>Nice-N-clean</u> | Unit Price | <u>34.98</u> |
| Stock Number | <u>NICAG30FW</u> | Total Price | <u>15,391.20</u> |
| Unit of Issue | | | |

LOUISIANA PREFERENCE CLAIMED ON ITEM NO.(s) _____.

**ALL EQUIPMENT MUST BE BRAND NEW - NO REFURBISHED
EQUIPMENT WILL BE CONSIDERED.**

* * * * *

BID SUBMITTED BY:

| | | |
|-----------------------|----------------------------------|------------------------------|
| _____ | Pyramid School Products | <u>2-15-16</u> |
| Name of Company | 6510 North 54th Street | Date |
| _____ | Tampa, Florida 33610-1908 | <u>N/A</u> |
| Mailing Address | (AC 813) 621-6446 | Discount (If Applicable) |
| _____ | (Toll Free) 800-792-2644 | <u>Kenneth D. Miller</u> |
| City, State, Zip Code | (Fax) 813-621-7688 | Typed Name of Representative |
| _____ | <u>ext 225</u> | <u>Kenneth D. Miller</u> |
| Telephone Number | | Signature of Representative |
| _____ | | |
| Fax Number | | |

NOTE: The exterior shipping carton and interior containers shall be labeled to comply with Occupational Safety and Health Administration (OSHA) Right to Know law standards where required. A Material Safety Data Sheet shall be provided with all chemical products.

St. Charles Parish Public Schools
School Addresses

| <i>WESTBANK</i> | <i>WESTBANK</i> |
|---|--|
| <p>Allemands Elementary 1471 WPS Rd. (Hwy. 632) Des Allemands, LA 70030</p> | <p>Carver Elementary 337 Gum St. Hahnville, LA 70057</p> |
| <p>Hahnville High School 200 Tiger Drive Boutte, LA 70039</p> | <p>Lakewood Elementary 501 E. Heather Drive Luling, LA 70070</p> |
| <p>Eual J. Landry Alternative School 108 Tiger Circle Hahnville, LA 70057</p> | <p>Luling Elementary 904 Sugarhouse Road Luling, LA 70070</p> |
| <p>J.B. Martin Middle 434 South Street Paradis, LA 70080</p> | <p>Mimosa Park Elementary 222 Birch Street Luling, LA 70070</p> |
| <p>R.J. Vial Elementary 510 Louisiana Street Paradis, LA 70080</p> | <p>R.K. Smith 281 Sugarland Parkway Luling, LA 70070</p> |
| <p>Satellite Center Culinary Arts Kitchen 283 Sugarland Parkway Luling, LA 70070</p> | |

| <i>EASTBANK</i> | <i>EASTBANK</i> |
|--|---|
| <p>Albert Cammon Middle 234 Pirate Drive St. Rose, LA 70087</p> | <p>Destrehan High School #1 Wildcat Lane Destrehan, LA 70047</p> |
| <p>Harry M. Hurst Middle 170 Road Runner Lane Destrehan, LA 70047</p> | <p>New Sarpy Elementary 103 Plantation Road Destrehan, LA 70047</p> |
| <p>Norco Elementary 102 Fifth Street Norco, LA 70079</p> | <p>St. Rose Elementary 230 Pirate Drive St. Rose, LA 70087</p> |
| <p>Ethel Schoeffner Elementary 140 Plantation Road Destrehan, LA 70047</p> | |