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BID TO BE SERVICED BY:
SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC
1215 W MORRIS AVE
HAMMOND, LA 70403
985-542-4900 PHONE
TRAVIS LAYFIELD, MANAGER
MIKE WISE, SALESMAN
GOV-SALES@STMTIRES.COM

Lynn.Hayden
Highlight





#281042 $468.80
#012709 $422.75
#012711 $462.93
#281069 $514.19
#359343 $653.33

$342.95 #GL1933211225
$325.87 #GL1173591225
$351.07 #GL1173591245
$354.08 #R5548264
$624.56 #MI5001511720000

#247780 $665.24 $643.84 #TOYO562010

NO BID $193.05 #3001010015
#TA5B38 $20.00 $20.00 #TA5B38
NO BID NO BID
#372592 $849.00 $762.92 #GAL540612

#355410 $787.82 $1,042.40 #MAX60603
#NO BID $734.32 #CA6X12453
#TA6R36 $51.00 $51.00 #TA6R36
#002759 $121.64 $141.85 #Z120034407

#005349 $100.59 NO BID
#378355 $145.20 $166.40 #GAL231231

#008520 $275.74 $180.33 #GL1584711163
#TA5B38 $20.00 $20.00 #TA5B38
#425129 $764.68 $578.08 #GL1597827257

#374751 $192.59 $106.68 #C225D16F

#CAT322200 $10.00 $10.00 #CAT322200

#004195 $308.18 $194.40 #TRX9016

NO BID $115.23 #HNK1024737

#248511 $290.51 $160.37 #GL1173591176
#005362 $128.41 $120.99 #GL1932337735

#014315 $129.91 $151.19 #22021000

NO BID $168.51 #GL1173593176

#005346 $126.75 $97.16 #Z1200040377

NO BID NO BID
#002777 $154.16 $112.13 #LTR1702HTWF
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GALAXY
GLADIATOR
TRANSAMERICAN
GLADIATOR
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TRANSMAX
TRANSMAX
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ZENNA
GLADIATOR
WESTLAKE
ZENNA
ZEETEX

WATERFALL



#002767 $140.51 $108.40 #Z1200045690
#372575 $425.93 $403.87 #GAL540733
#TA6R48 $50.00 $50.00 #TA6R48
NO BID $74.16 #TH17650
#317365 $593.58 $371.15 #GAL545292
#F552518 $53.00 $53.00 #F552518
#TA6R48 $50.00 $50.00 #TA6R48
NO BID $636.93 #GAL540608
#005349 $100.59 NO BID
#005344 $121.60 $106.25 #TOYO148230
#TA6R48 $53.00 $53.00 #TA6R48
#005374 $142.01 $140.01 #24689211

ZEETEX
GALAXY
TRANSAMERICAN
WESTLAKE
GALAXY
FIRESTONE
TRANSAMERICAN
GALAXY

TOYO
TRANSAMERICAN
WESTLAKE



#005507 $1,310.17 $1,025.18 #MAX031245

$83.72 $95.30
#TMS21
#TMS20NO BID

#005509 $2,428.15 $2,003.86 #GAL299698

$465.71 $1,126.12NO BID
#3001040087
#MAX951016

#005346 $126.75 $97.16 #Z1200040377
#002777 $154.16 $112.13 #LTR1702HTWF

#005379 $105.91 $122.47 #SUV1802HTWF

#012709 $422.75 $325.87 #GL1173591225
#005374 $142.01 $140.01 #24689211
#005374
#005374
#005374

#005374

$142.01
$142.01
$142.01

$142.01

$140.01
$140.01
$140.01

$140.01

#24689211
#24689211
#24689211

#24689211
#241235 $763.08 $740.91 #TOYO562090

#002759 $121.64 $141.85 #Z1200034407
#408492 $1,366.11 $1,038.68 #GAL287468
#372575 $425.93 $403.87 #GAL540733
#012709 $422.75 $325.87 #GL1173591225
NO BID $125.55 #T201012001
#012709 $422.75 $325.87 #GL1173591225
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