

DATE: 3/08/2024

INVITATION TO BID  
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00144711

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
P.O. BOX 9  
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009  
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

PURCHASING SPECIALIST:  
DNELSON

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1 WEEK ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) \_\_\_\_\_

|  |                       |
|--|-----------------------|
| *** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***    |                       |
| FIRM NAME: INDUSTRIAL COMMERCIAL MOTORS & CONTROLS |                       |
| SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)                   | TITLE: PRESIDENT      |
| PRINT OR TYPE NAME: William Pappas                 |                       |
| ADDRESS: P.O. Box 1842                             |                       |
| CITY, STATE: MANDEVILLE, LA.                       | ZIP: 70470            |
| TELEPHONE: ( ) 504 415-7288                        | FAX: ( ) 504 827-1167 |
| EMAIL ADDRESS: WPAPPAS@ICMCLLC.COM                 |                       |

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 6,003.20

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144711

SEALED BID

| ITEM<br>NUMBER | QUANTITY | U/M | DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES  | UNIT PRICE<br>QUOTED | TOTALS |
|----------------|----------|-----|--|----------------------|--------|
|                |          |     | <b>PURCHASE OF WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES</b>  |                      |        |
| 1              | 16.00    | EA  | 0001 - Connector, 1/2 in, for 14-3 SO<br>cable, PECO no. CG50-A560<br><br>(0878060)  | \$ <u>NO BID</u>     | \$     |
| 2              | 36.00    | EA  | 0002 - Light, pilot with green lens,<br>120V, 2 no contacts, Idec brand<br><br>no. ALD2QH220DNUG<br>(0870970)  | \$ <u>↑</u>          | \$     |
| 3              | 3.00     | EA  | 0003 - Light, pilot with green KENS24V,<br>2 no contacts, Idec no. ALDZQH220DNUG<br><br>(0870980)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 4              | 12.00    | EA  | 0004 = Switch, 3 position maintained,<br>Allen bradley no. 800T-J2A<br><br>(0871300)   | \$                   | \$     |
| 5              | 6.00     | EA  | 0005 - Connector, sealtite, straight,<br>1 in, Appleton no. ST-100<br><br>(087719D)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 6              | 1.00     | EA  | 0006 - Fuse holder in-line, 12 volt DC,<br>20 amperes, 9 in ling, NAPA Belden<br><br>no. 720212<br>(0880190)   | \$                   | \$     |
| 7              | 16.00    | EA  | 0007 - Switch, toggle, 15 amp, 1 pole,<br>ivory, 120 VAC, Pass and Seymour<br><br>no. 660-1<br>(0873510)   | \$                   | \$     |
| 8              | 1.00     | EA  | 0008 - Adapter, flange coupling, 16 in,<br>wedge style restrained, for ductile<br><br>iron, baked on Blue Teflon coated bolts<br>and nuts, domestic, EBAA no. 2116<br>(018006A)    | \$ <u>✓</u>          | \$     |
| 9              | 1.00     | EA  | 0009 - Breaker, circuit, 400 amperes,<br>600 VAC, 3 pole, with lugs on each end,<br><br>new in factory box, no substitute,<br>ITE Siemens no. HJD63B400 with<br>with 400 amp trip. | \$ <u>NO BID</u>     | \$     |

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144711

SEALED BID

| ITEM<br>NUMBER | QUANTITY | U/M | DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES   | UNIT PRICE<br>QUOTED | TOTALS    |
|----------------|----------|-----|---|----------------------|-----------|
| 10             | 3.00     | EA  | (084189A)<br>0010 - Holder, fuse, 30 amperes,<br>600 volt, 3 pole, Shawmut no. 30353  | \$ NO BID            | \$        |
| 11             | 100.00   | EA  | (0880260)<br>0011 - Screw, self-drilling, pan<br>head-phillips, No. 10-16 X 2 in,<br><br>410 stainless steel, 100 per box,<br>Fastenal no. 0128175<br>(042096A)                                 | \$                   | \$        |
| 12             | 12.00    | EA  | 0012 - Bushing, hex, 1-1/2 inch x<br>1-1/4 inch, grade no. 316 stainless<br><br>steel, 150 lb threaded fittings,<br>Merit brand or equal<br>(029035A)   | \$                   | \$        |
| 13             | 10.00    | EA  | 0013 - Adapter, female, PVC, schedule 80<br>1-1/4 in, female socket x female thread<br><br>(must be constructed as one piece,<br>electrical conduit fittings are not<br>acceptable<br>(0690890) | \$ NO BID            | \$        |
| 14             | 2.00     | EA  | 0014 - Bearing, SNR no. 5212.ZZ<br>(0450370)  | \$ 92.00             | \$ 184.00 |
| 15             | 50.00    | EA  | 0015 - Anchor, wedge,<br>3/8 in Dia. x 2-1/4 in long,<br><br>all stainless steel, 50 per box,<br>Redhed no. SWW-3822, Fastenal no 0152202<br>(0425480)  | \$ NO BID            | \$        |
| 16             | 300.00   | LF  | 0016 - Pipe, schedule 80. PVC,<br>1/2 in x 20 ft,<br><br>plain ends, electrical conduit not<br>acceptable<br>(0691000)  | \$                   | \$        |
| 17             | 4.00     | EA  | 0017 - Elbow, PVC, schedule 80,<br>45 degree, 1/2 in, female socket x<br><br>female socket (electrical fittings<br>are not acceptable<br>(0690490)  | \$                   | \$        |
| 18             | 100.00   | EA  | 0018 - Bolt, hex head,<br>5/8 inch - 11 x 1-3/4 in long,  | \$ NO BID            | \$        |

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144711

SEALED BID

| ITEM<br>NUMBER | QUANTITY | U/M | DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES  | UNIT PRICE<br>QUOTED | TOTALS |
|----------------|----------|-----|--|----------------------|--------|
| 19             | 300.00   | EA  | grade 316 stainless steel,<br>(0412440)<br><br>0019 - Nut, 1/2 in - 13,<br>grade no. 316 stainless steel<br><br>(0411800)  | \$ NO BID            | \$     |
| 20             | 4.00     | EA  | 0020 - Bolt, eye, 1/4 in-20 UNC-2A<br>thread size, 1 in shank,<br><br>500 lb capacity, meets ASTM A489<br>and ANSI B 18.15, Proto no. 94020,<br>Fastenal no. 42310<br>(0275000)                      | \$                   | \$     |
| 21             | 2.00     | EA  | 0021 - Bushing, hex, galvanized,<br>class 125 schedule 40, 1-1/4 inch MPT x<br><br>1 inch FPT, domestic,<br>Fastenal No. 66596<br>(0290170)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 22             | 4.00     | EA  | 0022 - Coupling, for 6 inch clay<br>pipe x 4 inch sdr-26 pvc pipe,<br><br>5000 series shielded strong<br>back RC type, stainless steel<br>clamp and shear ring,<br>Fernco No. 1002-64RC<br>(013552A) | \$                   | \$     |
| 23             | 200.00   | EA  | 0023 - Splice, butt, sta-kon, 12-10 wire<br>range, insulated, Thomas and Betts<br><br>no. 2RC10X<br>(0870250)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 24             | 8.00     | EA  | 0024 - Block, contact, 1 normally open<br>and 1 normally closed contact,<br><br>Allen Bradley no. 800T-XA<br>(0871290)   | \$                   | \$     |
| 25             | 20.00    | EA  | 0025 - Monitor, phase, voltage,<br>208/220/230/240 volt Diversified<br><br>Electronics no. SLA-230-ALE, must<br>meet specifications of this item<br>(0859790)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 26             | 4.00     | EA  | 0026 - Locknut, conduit, 3 in,<br>galvanized steel, Steel City no. LN0108  | \$ NO BID            | \$     |



## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144711

SEALED BID

| ITEM<br>NUMBER | QUANTITY | U/M | DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES   | UNIT PRICE<br>QUOTED | TOTALS |
|----------------|----------|-----|---|----------------------|--------|
| 27             | 3.00     | EA  | (0879530)<br>0027 - Connector, liquidtite, 3 in,<br>straight, Appleton no. ST-300   | \$ NO BID            | \$     |
| 28             | 12.00    | EA  | (0877191)<br>0028 - Sleeve, conduit, 1/2 in, aluminum<br>(0878300)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 29             | 5.00     | EA  | 0029 - Sleeve, conduit, 3/4 in, rigid<br>galvanized steel<br>(0878310)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 30             | 2.00     | EA  | 0030 - Switch, safety, 30 amperes,<br>600 volt, fusible, 3 pole, type 3R<br>enclosure, Square D no. H31RB<br>(087411A)  | \$                   | \$     |
| 31             | 2.00     | BX  | 0031 - Pads, vinyl mastic,<br>size 3-1/4 inch x 4-1/2 inch,<br>10 pads per box, Scotch 3M no. 2200<br>(0870140)   | \$                   | \$     |
| 32             | 10.00    | EA  | 0032 - Nipple, king, combination,<br>1-1/2 inch, cadmium or zinc plated<br>steel, hose x male national pipe<br>threads, Dixon brand or equal<br>(0486800)                           | \$                   | \$     |
| 33             | 1,000.00 | LF  | 0033 - Cable, stainless steel,<br>3/8 inch diameter, grade 304,<br>7 x 19 construction, 12000 pound<br>breaking strength, 1000 feet per reel,<br>Wireco brand or equal<br>(0487510) | \$                   | \$     |
| 34             | 16.00    | EA  | 0034 - Nipple, king, combination,<br>1-1/4 inch, cadmium or zinc plated<br>steel, hose x male national pipe<br>threads, Dixon brand no. ST15 or equal<br>(0486790)                  | \$                   | \$     |
| 35             | 100.00   | EA  | 0035 - Bend, PVC, 1 in by 45 degrees,<br>SDR35, bell by spigot  | \$ NO BID            | \$     |

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144711

SEALED BID

| ITEM<br>NUMBER | QUANTITY | U/M | DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES   | UNIT PRICE<br>QUOTED | TOTALS             |
|----------------|----------|-----|---|----------------------|--------------------|
| 36             | 40.00    | EA  | (0130710)<br>* 0036 - Pump, sump, 1/3 horsepower,<br>1-1/2 in discharge, 38 gpm<br><br>at 10 ft TDH, overload protected,<br>piggyback plug-in, 10 foot cord,<br>cast iron body, mechanical float<br>switch, Hydromatic No. V30A1<br>Myers MS33V10<br>(0570700) <i>ASHLAND MOD# B33VI-10</i> | \$ <u>145.48</u>     | \$ <u>5,819.20</u> |
| 37             | 5.00     | EA  | 0037 - Rod, all thread,<br>9/16 inch - 12 x 36 inch long,<br>grade 316 stainless steel<br>Grainger No. 25DL54<br>(0425850)<br><br><i>* SPEC SHEETS ATTACHED<br/>           WITH VERTICAL MECHANICAL FLOAT</i>   | \$ <u>NO BID</u>     | \$                 |