

## **ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS CULVERTS**

**Sealed bids will be received by the Pointe Coupee Parish Police Jury at 160 East Main Street, Courthouse Annex Building, New Roads, Louisiana until 2:00 p.m., Monday, April 17, 2017 and then publicly opened and read for the purchase of a one (1) year supply of various size culverts.**

**Bid must be submitted on proper bid form in sealed envelope marked "*BID--CULVERTS*"**

**All culverts furnished must meet the Louisiana State Department of Transportation and Development, Office of Highways latest standard specifications.**

**Please quote prices on polyethylene (Double Wall N12), riveted asphalt coated, riveted galvanized corrugated metal, spiral asphalt coated and spiral galvanized.**

**Deliveries to be made to the Parish Maintenance Facility on LA Highway 1, four (4) miles west of New Roads. Deliveries may vary from one (1) culvert to an entire truck load.**

**Bid documents and further information may be obtained from the Police Jury Office at 160 E. Main St., Courthouse Annex, New Roads, LA 70760, (225) 638-9556 and are also available at Central Bidding. Electronic Bids are accepted and can be accessed at [www.centralbidding.com](http://www.centralbidding.com). For questions related to the electronic bidding process, please call Central Bidding at 225-810-4814.**

**The Police Jury reserves the right to consider and/or reject any and all bids.**

**This institution is an equal opportunity provider, and employer.**

**GERRIE P. MARTIN - SECRETARY**

**PUBLISH: March 23, 30 & April 6, 2017  
(Block Ad)**

# LOUISIANA UNIFORM PUBLIC WORKS BID FORM

TO: \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
(Owner supplied owner information)

BID FOR: \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
(Owner supplied project information)

The undersigned bidder hereby declares and represents that she/he; a) has carefully examined and understands the Bidding Documents, b) has not received, relied on, or based his bid on any verbal instructions contrary to the Bidding Documents or any addenda, c) has personally inspected and is familiar with the project site, and hereby proposes to provide all labor, materials, tools, appliances and facilities as required to perform, in a workmanlike manner, all work and services for the construction and completion of the referenced project, all in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents.

The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following **ADDENDA**:

No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_ No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_ No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_  
No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_ No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_ No. \_\_\_\_ Dated: \_\_\_\_\_

**BASE BID:** For all work required by the Bidding Documents (including any and all unit prices tabulated in the attached UNIT PRICE FORM, if applicable, but not alternates) the sum of: (\$ \_\_\_\_\_ )

\_\_\_\_\_ Dollars

**ALTERNATES:** For any and all work required by the Bidding Documents for Alternates.

Alternate No. 1 (*designer insert description of alternate*) add/deduct the lump sum of: (\$ \_\_\_\_\_ )  
\_\_\_\_\_ Dollars

Alternate No. 2 (*designer insert description of alternate*) add/deduct the lump sum of: (\$ \_\_\_\_\_ )  
\_\_\_\_\_ Dollars

Alternate No. 3 (*designer insert description of alternate*) add/deduct the lump sum of: (\$ \_\_\_\_\_ )  
\_\_\_\_\_ Dollars

**TOTAL BID:** (Base Bid plus Alternates, if applicable, listed above (\$ \_\_\_\_\_ )  
\_\_\_\_\_ Dollars

**NAME OF FIRM OR JOINT VENTURE:** \_\_\_\_\_

**LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NUMBER:** \_\_\_\_\_

**SIGNATURE OF BIDDER \*\*:** \_\_\_\_\_

**NAME OF BIDDER:** \_\_\_\_\_

**TITLE OF BIDDER:** \_\_\_\_\_

**ADDRESS OF BIDDER:** \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

**DATED:** \_\_\_\_\_

**\*\*** If someone other than a corporate officer signs for the Bidder/Contractor, a copy of a corporate resolution or other signature authorization shall be required for submission of bid. Failure to include a copy of the appropriate signature authorization, if required, may result in the rejection of the bid unless bidder has complied with La. R.S. 38:2212(A)(1)(c) or RS 38:2212(O) .

**BID SECURITY** in the form of a bid bond, certified check or cashier's check as prescribed by LA RS 38:2218.A is attached to and made a part of this bid. If a bid bond is provided it shall be on the attached form and only on the attached form.

# LOUISIANA UNIFORM PUBLIC WORKS BID FORM

## UNIT PRICE FORM

**TO:** \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
*(Owner supplied owner information)*

**BID FOR:** \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
*(Owner supplied project information)*

**UNIT PRICES:** For any and all work required by the Bidding Documents, described as unit prices.

REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		
REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		
REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		
REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		
REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		
REF. NO.	UNIT OF MEASURE:	PRICE PER UNIT	
	QUANTITY:	Words:	
	DESCRIPTION:	Figures:	
	UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY X PRICE PER UNIT)		
	Words:		
	Figures:		

**Additional sheets may be included if necessary. All quantities are estimated. The contractor will be paid based upon actual quantities as verified by the City Engineer. Unit price written in words shall govern. Should the written unit price be illegible, then the unit price in figures shall govern. All spaces must be filled out, even if "No" dollars and "No" cents.**

**BID BOND**  
**FOR**

Date: \_\_\_\_\_

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS:

That \_\_\_\_\_ of \_\_\_\_\_, as Principal,  
and \_\_\_\_\_, as Surety, are held and firmly bound  
unto the \_\_\_\_\_ (Obligee), in the full and just sum of five  
(5%) percent of the total amount of this bid, including all alternates, lawful money of the United States, for payment  
of which sum, well and truly be made, we bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns,  
jointly and severally firmly by these presents.

Surety represents that it is listed on the current U. S. Department of the Treasury Financial Management Service list of approved bonding companies as approved for an amount equal to or greater than the amount for which it obligates itself in this instrument or that it is a Louisiana domiciled insurance company with at least an A - rating in the latest printing of the A. M. Best's Key Rating Guide. If surety qualifies by virtue of its Best's listing, the Bond amount may not exceed ten percent of policyholders' surplus as shown in the latest A. M. Best's Key Rating Guide.

Surety further represents that it is licensed to do business in the State of Louisiana and that this Bond is signed by surety's agent or attorney-in-fact. This Bid Bond is accompanied by appropriate power of attorney.

THE CONDITION OF THIS OBLIGATION IS SUCH that, whereas said Principal is herewith submitting its proposal to the Obligee on a Contract for:

NOW, THEREFORE, if the said Contract be awarded to the Principal and the Principal shall, within such time as may be specified, enter into the Contract in writing and give a good and sufficient bond to secure the performance of the terms and conditions of the Contract with surety acceptable to the Obligee, then this obligation shall be void; otherwise this obligation shall become due and payable.

\_\_\_\_\_  
PRINCIPAL (BIDDER)

\_\_\_\_\_  
SURETY

BY: \_\_\_\_\_  
AUTHORIZED OFFICER-OWNER-PARTNER

BY: \_\_\_\_\_  
AGENT OR ATTORNEY-IN-FACT(SEAL)

\_\_\_\_\_  
Name of Project

\_\_\_\_\_  
Name of Grantee

\_\_\_\_\_  
Date of Bid

**ATTESTATION CLAUSE REQUIRED BY  
LA. R.S. 38:2227 (PAST CRIMINAL CONVICTIONS OF BIDDERS)**

As a Bidder on the above-entitled Public Works Project, does hereby attest that:

- A. No sole proprietor or individual partner, incorporator, director, manager, officer, organizer, or member who has a minimum of a ten percent (10%) ownership in the bidding entity named below has been convicted of, or has entered a plea of guilty or nolo contendere to any of the following state crimes or equivalent federal crimes:

(a) Public bribery (R.S. 14:118)

(c) Extortion (R.S. 14:66)

(b) Corrupt influencing (R.S. 14:120)

(d) Money laundering (R.S. 14:23)

- B. Within the past five years from the project bid date, no sole proprietor or individual partner, incorporator, director, manager, officer, organizer, or member who has a minimum of a ten percent (10%) ownership in the bidding entity named below has been convicted of, or has entered a plea of guilty or nolo contendere to any of the following state crimes or equivalent federal crimes, during the solicitation or execution of a contract or bid awarded pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 10 of Title 38 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes:

(a) Theft (R.S. 14:67)

(f) Bank fraud (R.S. 14:71.1)

(b) Identity Theft (R.S. 14:67.16)

(g) Forgery (R.S. 14:72)

(c) Theft of a business record  
(R.S. 14:67.20)

(h) Contractors; misapplication of  
payments (R.S. 14:202)

(d) False accounting (R.S. 14:70)

(i) Malfeasance in office (R.S. 14:134)

(e) Issuing worthless checks  
(R.S. 14:71)

Coburn's Supply Company

Michael Self

\_\_\_\_\_  
NAME OF BIDDER

\_\_\_\_\_  
NAME OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER

4-17-2017

Municipal OSR

\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE

\_\_\_\_\_  
TITLE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER



\_\_\_\_\_  
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED  
SIGNATORY OF BIDDER

**POINTE COUPEE PARISH POLICE JURY**  
**BID FORM**  
**CULVERTS**  
**SPIRAL ASPHALT COATED**  
**SPIRAL 2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION**

Coburn's Supply Company

<b>DIAMETER</b>	<b>GAUGE</b>	<b>ROUND</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>
<b>12</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 12.41</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>15</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 15.70</b>	<b>17 X 13</b>	<b>\$ 19.70</b>
<b>18</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 19.95</b>	<b>21 X 15</b>	<b>\$ 25.30</b>
<b>21</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 22.57</b>	<b>24 X 18</b>	<b>\$ 28.60</b>
<b>24</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 25.18</b>	<b>28 x 20</b>	<b>\$ 31.89</b>
<b>24</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 30.05</b>	<b>28 X 20</b>	<b>\$ 36.75</b>
<b>30</b>	<b>16</b>	<b>\$ 32.07</b>	<b>35 X 24</b>	<b>\$ 40.79</b>
<b>30</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 37.90</b>	<b>35 X 24</b>	<b>\$ 46.62</b>
<b>36</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 37.60</b>	<b>42 X 29</b>	<b>\$ 53.80</b>
<b>36</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 57.00</b>	<b>42 X 29</b>	<b>\$ 66.42</b>
<b>42</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 57.65</b>	<b>49 X 33</b>	<b>\$ 68.43</b>
<b>42</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 74.40</b>	<b>49 X 33</b>	<b>\$ 85.20</b>
<b>48</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 69.40</b>	<b>57 X 38</b>	<b>\$ 82.86</b>
<b>48</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 89.20</b>	<b>57 X 38</b>	<b>\$ 102.68</b>
<b>54</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 80.69</b>	<b>64 X 43</b>	<b>\$ 98.47</b>
<b>54</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 102.75</b>	<b>64 X 43</b>	<b>\$ 120.60</b>
<b>60</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>	<b>71 X 47</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>60</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>	<b>71 X 47</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>66</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>	<b>77 X 52</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>66</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>	<b>77 X 52</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>

**H-6 BANDS = COST OF 1 FOOT OF PIPE**  
**H-12 BANDS = COST OF 1 1/2 FEET OF PIPE**  
**10-C BANDS = COST OF 3 FEET OF PIPE**

**POINTE COUPEE PARISH POLICE JURY**  
**BID FORM**  
**CULVERTS**  
**SPIRAL ASPHALT COATED**  
**SPIRAL 3" X 1" CORRUGATION**

Coburn's Supply Company

<b>DIAMETER</b>	<b>GAUGE</b>	<b>ROUND</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>
<b>60</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 97.95</b>	<b>66 X 51</b>	<b>\$ 109.64</b>
<b>60</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 127.10</b>	<b>66 X 51</b>	<b>\$ 143.16</b>
<b>60</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 157.39</b>	<b>66 X 51</b>	<b>\$ 178.00</b>
<b>66</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 116.77</b>	<b>73 X 55</b>	<b>\$ 130.24</b>
<b>66</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 149.55</b>	<b>73 X 55</b>	<b>\$ 167.92</b>
<b>66</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 183.54</b>	<b>73 X 55</b>	<b>\$ 207.00</b>
<b>72</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 127.95</b>	<b>81 X 59</b>	<b>\$ 142.66</b>
<b>72</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 163.17</b>	<b>81 X 59</b>	<b>\$ 183.19</b>
<b>72</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 199.60</b>	<b>81 X 59</b>	<b>\$ 225.00</b>
<b>78</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 137.90</b>	<b>87 X 63</b>	<b>\$ 153.74</b>
<b>78</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 179.78</b>	<b>87 X 63</b>	<b>\$ 198.44</b>
<b>78</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 216.87</b>	<b>87 X 63</b>	<b>\$ 244.48</b>
<b>84</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 149.12</b>	<b>95 X 67</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>84</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 190.40</b>	<b>95 X 67</b>	<b>\$ 213.69</b>
<b>84</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 234.12</b>	<b>95 X 67</b>	<b>\$ 263.94</b>
<b>96</b>	<b>14</b>	<b>\$ 168.94</b>	<b>112 X 75</b>	<b>\$ NO BID</b>
<b>96</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>\$ 217.50</b>	<b>112 X 75</b>	<b>\$ 244.22</b>
<b>96</b>	<b>10</b>	<b>\$ 267.26</b>	<b>112 X 75</b>	<b>\$ 301.54</b>

**H-6 BANDS = COST OF 1 FOOT OF PIPE**  
**H-12 BANDS = COST OF 1 1/2 FEET OF PIPE**  
**10-C BANDS = COST OF 3 FEET OF PIPE**

Polyethylene (Double Wall N12) Pipe

Diameter

12	\$5.55
15	\$7.23
18	\$10.27
24	\$15.10
30	\$26.07
36	\$30.57
42	\$37.59
48	\$47.44
60	\$83.77



**POINTE COUPEE PARISH POLICE JURY**  
**BID FORM**  
**CULVERTS**  
**SPIRAL GALVANIZED**  
**SPIRAL 2 2/3" X 1/2" CORRUGATION**

Coburn's Supply Company

<b>DIAMETER</b>	<b>GAUGE</b>	<b>ROUND</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>	<b>ARCHED</b>
<b>12</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 9.72	<b>N/A</b>	\$
<b>15</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 11.66	<b>17 X 13</b>	\$ 13.39
<b>18</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 14.56	<b>21 X 15</b>	\$ 16.72
<b>21</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 16.50	<b>24 X 18</b>	\$ 18.95
<b>24</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 18.42	<b>28 x 20</b>	\$ 21.20
<b>24</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 23.30	<b>28 X 20</b>	\$ 26.78
<b>30</b>	<b>16</b>	\$ 23.30	<b>35 X 24</b>	\$ 26.78
<b>30</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 29.12	<b>35 X 24</b>	\$ 33.50
<b>36</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 34.90	<b>42 X 29</b>	\$ 40.18
<b>36</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ 47.58	<b>42 X 29</b>	\$ 54.70
<b>42</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 46.89	<b>49 X 33</b>	\$ 53.90
<b>42</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ 63.65	<b>49 X 33</b>	\$ 73.20
<b>48</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 55.90	<b>57 X 38</b>	\$ NO BID
<b>48</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ 75.72	<b>57 X 38</b>	\$ 87.10
<b>54</b>	<b>14</b>	\$ 62.89	<b>64 X 43</b>	\$ NO BID
<b>54</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ 85.00	<b>64 X 43</b>	\$ 97.80
<b>60</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ NO BID	<b>71 X 47</b>	\$ NO BID
<b>60</b>	<b>10</b>	\$ NO BID	<b>71 X 47</b>	\$ NO BID
<b>66</b>	<b>12</b>	\$ NO BID	<b>77 X 52</b>	\$ NO BID
<b>66</b>	<b>10</b>	\$ NO BID	<b>77 X 52</b>	\$ NO BID

**H-6 BANDS = COST OF 1 FOOT OF PIPE**  
**H-12 BANDS = COST OF 1 1/2 FEET OF PIPE**  
**10-C BANDS = COST OF 3 FEET OF PIPE**

**POINTE COUPEE PARISH POLICE JURY**  
**BID FORM**  
**CULVERTS**  
**SPIRAL GALVANIZED**  
**SPIRAL 3" X 1" CORRUGATION**

Coburn's Supply Company

DIAMETER	GAUGE	ROUND	ARCHED	ARCHED
60	14	\$ 78.06	66 X 51	\$ 89.76
60	12	\$ 107.20	66 X 51	\$ 123.26
60	10	\$ 137.49	66 X 51	\$ 158.10
66	14	\$ 89.79	73 X 55	\$ 103.26
66	12	\$ 122.59	73 X 55	\$ 140.96
66	10	\$ 156.58	73 X 55	\$ 180.04
72	14	\$ 98.30	81 X 59	\$ 113.00
72	12	\$ 133.49	81 X 59	\$ 153.54
72	10	\$ 169.94	81 X 59	\$ 195.44
78	14	\$ 105.57	87 X 63	\$ 121.40
78	12	\$ 144.42	87 X 63	\$ 166.09
78	10	\$ 184.51	87 X 63	\$ 212.14
84	14	\$ 114.09	95 X 67	\$ NO BID
84	12	\$ 155.36	95 X 67	\$ 178.64
84	10	\$ 199.08	95 X 67	\$ 228.95
96	14	\$ 129.84	112 X 75	\$ NO BID
96	12	\$ 178.44	112 X 75	\$ 205.17
96	10	\$ 228.19	112 X 75	\$ 262.43

H-6 BANDS = COST OF 1 FOOT OF PIPE  
H-12 BANDS = COST OF 1 1/2 FEET OF PIPE  
10-C BANDS = COST OF 3 FEET OF PIPE