ALTERNATE BRANDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED
St. Charles Parish Public School System - Child Nutrition Program

08 - Frozen Food Products

Bid Number 2016-17

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC

P.O. Box 279

Request for Bid Bid Period: 7/1/16 through 6/30/17 Im_ﬁBO:Q. LA 70404
ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
Meat Meat Alternates-2000
2002 Chicken, Drumsticks, IQF: Tyson 8832 Tyson 96 ct 42.98/cs
2005 Chicken, Patty Breaded Proview 50515
No Bid
2007 Chicken, Oven Fried Goldkist 23700 No Bid
2008 Chicken, Patty Spicy Breaded Goldkist 66560
King's Delight 328 King's Delight 128/2.5 0z 0.42/ea
Tyson 3860
Zartic 67027SYL
2009 Chicken, Popcorn King's Delight 11095
Goldkist 06911 King's Delight 114/serv 0.51/serv or 58.14/cs
Proview 43010
2019 Chicken, Tenders Breaded Tyson No Bid
2021 Chicken, Pattie, Breaded Tyson 2154-0328
Proview 504115 No Bid
2033 Fish Portions, Golden fried Good Harbor 52132
Highliner 1089300
Sasinz] MMMMMMHMWMMMQ Po1036 Highliner 80/3.6 0z 0.58/ea
Trident 488285
2034 Shrimp, Popcorn Tampa Maid 78220
mmm”“_ﬁwwwo Tampa Maid 5/24 2.68/# or 26.80/cs
Tampa Bay Fisheries 25651
2035 Fish, Strips Breaded American Pride 58206 Highliner 4/54 2.57/4
2036 Fish, Catfish Fillets Guidry's SKF3-5 Captain Franks 15/# 73.85/cs
2037 Shrimp, Salad. Frozen, Raw, IQF Qcean Select Premier
No Bid
2040 Soup, Baked Potato MMI 10274 MMI 8/4# 53.60/cs
2060 Turkey, Oven Roasted Jennie-0 2364-20
Butterball No Bid
2063 Turkey, Taco Meat JTM 5235 No Bid
2064 Turkey, Bacon Jennie-0 No Bid
2066 Turkey, Ham, Whole Jennie-O Butterball 2/8-9# 2.62/#
2067 Turkey, Roast . 2/124
Jennie-0 3170-04 Butterball 3.87/#
2070 Turkey, Sausage, Pattie Jennie-0 No Bid




S & W Wholesaie Eooa-.

P.O. Box 274
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
2072 Pork, Ground Distributor's Choice Bell Foods 1/10# 21.30/cs
2093 Sausage, Smoked Beef & Pork

Chisesi 8115
Manda 336 Manda:977 1/10# 3.38/#
2096 Turkey & Cheese Sub Advance 68125 Advance 45/4.4 oz 39.87/cs
2097 Turkey Ham & Cheese Sub Advance 68124 45/4.4 0z
Advance 40.38/cs
Cheese-2100
2100 Cheese, American Bongards 10049 Land O'Lakes 6/5# 2.76/#
2101 Cheese, American, bulk Bongards 20263-1 Land O'Lakes 6/5# 2.59/#
2105 Cheese, Parmesan, Shaker Kraft
Kraft g
Schreiber 25417 = 12/8i02 L
2107 Cheese, Sauce Queso JTM 5718 No Bid
2108 Cheese, Colby Jack Sticks Bongards 40220 Land O'Lakes 168/1 oz 0.27/ea
2109 Cheese, Mozzarella, String Bongards 40240 Land O'Lakes 168/1 oz 0.25/ea
2111 Cheese, Sauce Nacho JTM 5708 ;
No Bid
2112 Cheese, Mozzarella, Shredded Bongards 10038 Land O'lakes 4/54 3.02/#
Fruits and Vegetables-2200
2201 Okra, Cut, Frozen Fine Line Fine Line 12/24 1.93/bag
2204 Greens, Mustard Fine Line Fine Line 12/3# 0.85/#
2207 Peas & Carrots, Frozen Fine Line Fine Line 20# 0.88/#
2208 Broccoli, Florets Fine Line Fine Line 12/2#4 1.04/#
2210 Potatoes, Tots McCains
Simplot No Bid @ this time
Lamb Wesson PP50
2215 Strawberries, Whole, Frozen _n__..:w Line Frra i 304 1.56/#
Paris Foods
<dls Wedge Fries, 8 Cut, Crispy McCain 1000000496 McCain 6/54 36.17/cs
Bakeable Seasoned
- : s,
2234 California Blend Vegetables Fine Line Fiwpling 08 0.83/#
Frozen




S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 27¢
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
2235 Salsa, Corn and Bean Simplot sku#10071179777762 Simplot 6/2.5# 30.73/cs
2237 Vegetahles, Stir Fry Fine Line Fine Line 12/2# 2.00/bag
2238 Hash Browns Simplot 430018 Simplot 6/5# 31.45/cs
Breads and Grains-2300
2303 Croissant, Sliced, Whole Grain Hadley Farms 134

Bake Crafters 3284 Sara Lee:41315 48/2.35 oz 19.20/cs
2310 Muffin, Blueberry 1.8 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 72/2 oz 24,16/ cs
2311 Muffin, Choc. Chip 1.8 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 72/2 oz 24.16/cs
2312 Muffins, Choc. Choc. Chip Dave's Baking Co.
3.6 oz. Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 48/4 oz 33.32/cs
2313 Tortilla, Whole Wheat 8" Mission 10411
Super Lopez Mission 24/12 0.13/ea
2314 Muffins, Blueberry 3.6 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 48/4 oz 33.32/cs
2315 Muffins, Banana 1.8 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
, Otis Sounkmever Otis Spunkmeyer 72/2 oz 24.16/cs
2316 Muffins, Banana 3.6 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 48/4 oz 33.32/cs
2317 Muffins, Apple Cinn. 1.8 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmever Otis Spunkmeyer 72/2 oz 24.16/cs
2318 Muffin, Apple Cinn. 3.6 oz. Dave's Baking Co.
Bake Crafters
Otis Spunkmeyer Otis Spunkmeyer 48/4 oz 33.32/cs
2319 Waffles, Cinnamon Ind. Smuckers 33506 Smuckers 72/2.4 0z 36.72/cs
2320 Waffles, Blueberry, Ind. Smuckers 33507 Srriickers 72/2.4 02 36.72/cs




S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC

P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404
ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
2321 Waffles, Choc. Chip Ind. Smuckers 33508 Srriitkere 72/2.4 0z 36.72/cs
2322 Biscuit, Round Handi-Split Rich's 06063 Rich's 240/2.2 oz 38.40/cs
2324 Breadstick, Maple Filled Wild Mikes Wwitd Mikes 112/1.4 o0z 31.36/cs
2325 Breadstick, Cheese Filled Wild Mikes
Wild Mikes 112/2 oz 54.88/cs
2331 Tortilla, Flour 6" Low Sodium Azteca 06109
Ultra Grain Mission:33822 24/12 30.33/cs
2333 Tortilla, Flour 10" Low Sodium Azteca 06009
Ultra Grain Mission:33825 12/12 31.12/cs
2334 Tortilla, Flour 8" Low Sodium Azteca 06209
Ultra Grain Mission:33824 12/12 24.63/cs
2338 Waffles, Maple Fla d Smuckers 3
BilieS, TRApIe EIRVEre HEKETE AT Smuckers 72/2.4 0z 37.16/cs
2339 Cinnamon Roll, 2.50z Rich's 08221 Rich's 120/2.5 oz 0.23/ea
2347 Bar, Breakfast, Oatmeal Choc. Readi-Bake 40401 Readi-Bake 48/2.5 oz 20.12/cs
2348 Bar,Breakfast, Oatmeal Readi-Bake 40400 Readi-Bake 48/2.5 oz 20.12/cs
2349 Bar, Breakfast, Apple Cinn. Readi-Bake 40403
Readi-Bake 48/2.5 oz 20.12/cs
2350 Bar, Breakfast, Banana Choc. Readi-Bake 40402
Readi-Bake 48/2.5 oz 20.12/cs
2352 Pancake Sandwich 2 oz. Conagra 94643-04442 ConAgra 80/3 oz 0.40/ea
2357 Pancake, on Stick BB Foster Farms 94112 Foster Farms 56/2.85 0z 26.85/cs
2359 Pancake on a Stick Foster Farms 94087 Foster Farms 56/2.85 oz 23.37/cs
2360 Bar, Strawberry Bake Crafters 1288 No Bid
2362 Bun, Hamburger Gluten Free Boulder No Bid
2363 Bun, Hot Dog Gluten Free Boulder No Bid
2364 Roll, Dinner Gluten Free Boulder No Bid
2366 Bread, Sliced Gluten Free Boulder No Bid
2367 Ultra Eat-A-Bowl Super Bakery 8676 No Bid
2368 Breakfast Bites, Mini, Glazed, Bake Crafters 1717
WG, 4 Pack No Bid
Fruit Juice-2400
2400 Fruit Bar, Berry Frozen J &1 2035031 18 100/2 oz 19.25/cs




S & W Wholesale Foods. LILC

P.O. Box 272

Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
2401 Fruit Bar, Sour Apple Frozen J &) 23050215 18] 100/2 oz 19.25/cs
2402 Fruit Bar, Orange, Frozen J & 23050200 & 100/2 oz 19.25/cs
2403 Juice, Apple 4oz M & B 2847

Ardmore Farms 41771 M&B 70/4 oz 0.16/ea
Cal-Tex
2404 luice, Apple/Cherry Mr. J
. No Bid
Vita Fresh
2405 Juice, Frozen, Orange 4oz M & B 2047
Ardmore Farms 41770 ME8 70/4 0z 0.19/ea
2409 Juice, Strawbery Melon 10 oz.
Naked Juice 63395 No Bid
2410 Juice, Green Machine 10 oz.
Naked Juice 63397 No Bid
Eggs-2500
2503 Ege, Eggstravaganza Sunny Fresh Sunny Fresh 4/5# 2.93/#
2504 Egg, Pattie Grilled Michael 30101 Michaels 144/1 oz 0.16/ea
2507 Eggs, Whites, Frozen Michael 60601
Rembrandt
No Bid
Papetti 65419 oH
Almark 56440
2508 Eggs, Whole, Frozen Michael 54246
Rembrandt
Almark 56350 Michaels 6/54 1.64/#
Armour DaBreak 52550
Sunny Fresh
2509 Eggs, Diced, Frozen Sunny Fresh 40065
Michael 41.
Michaels 64102 chaeis 454 B9l
Pizza - 2600
Pizza, Cheese 5" round
2602 Giorgio's 8391 No Bid




S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC

P.O. Box 279

Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROVED BRANDS BRAND Unit Size UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
Pizza, Pepperoni 5" Round
2603 Giorgio's 8671 NoBid
Beef-2700
2701 Beef, Meatballs AFG 290554 No Bid
2704 Frankfurters, Beef John Morrell 02856 John Morrell 1/104 29.05/cs
2705 Beef, Ground Thompson Bell Foods 3/10# 3.30/#
2706 Beef, Salisbury Steak Don Lee 752253
American Food Group 290850 Advance Pierre 114/3 oz 60.89/cs
Pierre 9118
Dairy-2800
2801 Whipped Topping Rich's 2559 Rich's 12/16 oz 0.19/0z
2803 Margarine, 1#
venara 16630 Ventura 30/1# 1.07/#
Smart Balance
2804 Yogurt, Strawberry 4oz Dannon 2731 Dannon 48/4 oz 0.28/ea
2805 Yogurt, Strawberry-Banana 4oz Dannon 2732 Dannon 48/4 oz 0.28/ea
2806 Yogurt, Cherry, 40z Dannon 2733 Dannon:2733 (Vanilla) 48/4 oz 0.28/ea
2801 Yogurt, Cherry Vanilia 40z Camwon Dannon:1957 (Straw/Van) 48/4 oz 0.28/ea
Upstate Farms
2809 Butter, Whipped Spread 5gm Ventura 15846 No Bid
2810 Sour Cream Bulk RF Upstate Farms No Bid
2831 Yogurt, Vanilla LF Upstate Farms Upstate Farms 4/5# 26.70/cs




