Phone: (337) 546-6887 Fax: (337) 546-6889

Coastal Culvert & Supply, Inc.

991 North St. Mary - P. O. Box 1145
Eunice, Louisiana 70535-1145

Louisiana manufacturers may be given an opportunity to meet the lowest and best bid as applied to
products manufactured out of state.

The following is the Louisiana 10% Preference Law.

Pursuant To “Louisiana Preference Law” Statute R.S. 39:1595.
We request a 10% preference for Products Manufactured in Louisiana.

In accordance with title 39:595 of the Louisiana Revised Statutes a preference of 10% may be allowed
for the products produced, manufactured or assembled in Louisiana of equal quality.

Coastal respectfully requests this opportunity as afforded by the above referenced State Statute for
Metal Pipe & Metal Fittings.

Thapk You, /
e
/\zzf/zcua j(f 10 o
Denise Lacombe
Executive Office Manager




AFFIRMATION OF BIDDERS

The undersigned bidder affirms and declares:

1.

That this proposal is executed and signed by said bidder with full knowledge and
acceptance of the provisions contained above.

The Bid Response Form (Exhibit A) is considered a part of this contract.

That should any part of this proposal be accepted in writing by St. Martin Parish
Government within (30) calendar days from the date of bid opening, unless an
earlier date for acceptance is specified by bidder in a proposal schedule, said
bidders will furnish and deliver the commodity and or services for which proposal
is made in the quantities and at the prices bid, and in compliance with the
provisions contained herein. Should any part of this proposal be delayed beyond
the period of thirty (30) days herein provided, or of an earlier date specified by
any bidder in the proposal schedule, such awards shall be conditioned upon
bidders’ acceptance.

Name of Company: COASTAL CULVERT & SUPPLY, INC.

Address: P.0.BOX 1145

'EUNICE, LA70535
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Authorized Agent: V /U///?f4 A m @ /) (Q‘k‘

Name/Title: DENISE LACOMBE/EXECUTIVE OFFICE MANAGER

Telephone Number: —337-546-6887

Accepted by:

Guy Cormier. Parish President
St. Martin Parish Government




June 19, 2012

VCoastal Culverts
P. O. Box 1145
Eunice, LA 70535

Attached is our Call for Bid and specifications for culverts and pipes.

If you are interested in supplying St. Martin Parish Government with culverts
and pipes, please fill out and return the attached Bidder Response Form in a
sealed envelope labeled “Call for Bid - Culverts and Pipes” to Gary
Thibodeaux, Purchasing Agent @ P.O. Box 9, St. Martinville, La 70582, by
10:30 a.m. on July 6, 2012. '

St. Martin Parish Govemment reserves the right to reject bids if they do not
meet our specifications.

Thank you for time and effort. We look forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,

2ol

Gary Thibodeaux
Purchasing Agent

Enclosures

Guy Cormier
Parish President

Post Office Box 9
301 West Port Street
St. Martinville
Lonisiana, 70582
337.394.2200

Fax 394.2203




ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT

301 W. PORT STREET
P.0.BOX9
ST. MARTINVILLE, LA 70582
DATE: June 19, 2012
CALL FOR BIDS:

The St. Martin Parish Government will receive sealed bids until 10:30 A.M. on Friday, July 6,2012,
at St. Martin Parish Courthouse Annex Building, 301 W. Port Street, St. Martinville, Louisiana
70582, for the purchase of Culverts and Pipes for a 12-month period.

All proposals must be submitted in a sealed envelope and clearly marked as “Call for Bid - Culverts
and Pipes” on the outside of the envelope. No proposal will be accepted after 10:30 a.m. on July 6,
2012.

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS AND CONDITIONS

The bids will be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting the requirements. St. Martin
Parish Government does not guarantee any specific quantity to purchase. St. Martin Parish
Government reserves the right to reject any bid.

St. Martin Parish Government reserves the right to terminate the contract with 48 hours written
notice.

Prices quoted hereafter shall be firm for the contractual period and shall include delivery. St. Martin
Parish Government is exempt from sales taxes. A sales tax exemption certificate will be furnished
to all successful bidders.

Bidders shall attach a copy of their standard warranty.

St. Martin Parish Government will issue purchase orders for all orders as needed to the successful
bidder. In no event shall items be delivered without prior authorization and a valid purchase order.

All items must be available and delivered within two (2) working days from the date of order.
Should the contractor fail or refuse to deliver within this time frame, St. Martin Parish Government
reserves the right to cancel its order and purchase the items on the open market. In the event the
price on the open market is higher than the contract price, the contractor will be charged the
difference between the contract price and the delivered price paid on the open market. Bidders will
not be held liable for differences paid between the contract and the price on the open market if failure
to deliver is due to a national emergency.

Invoices must reference the purchase order authorizing the acquisition. Invoices will be paid by St.
Martin Parish Government within thirty(30) days from the date of receipt and acceptance of the order
and invoice.




CALL FOR BIDS

The St. Martin Parish Government will receive sealed bids until 10:30 a.m. on Friday, July 6,
2012, at St. Martin Parish Courthouse Annex Building, 301 W. Port Street, St. Martinville,
Louisiana 70582, for the following items for a period of one (1) year, at which time sealed bids
will be opened and read aloud:

ITEM ONE: Tires and tubes

ITEM TWO: Storage batteries for automobiles and industrial equipment
ITEM THREE: Oils, lubricants, fluids and grease '
ITEM FOUR: Culverts and pipes

ITEM FIVE: Grader blades

ITEM SIX: Limestone

ITEM SEVEN: Cold Mix

ITEM EIGHT: Sand

Specifications may be obtained from Gary Thibodeaux, Purchasing Agent, St. Martin Parish
Government, 301 W. Port Street, St. Martinville, LA 70582, (337) 394-2200.

All bids are to be submitted in a sealed envelope and properly identified.
St. Martin Parish Government reserves the right to reject bids.

Please find bid related materials and place your electronic bids at www.centralbidding.com.

Advertise: June 20, 27, and July 4, 2012




ST. MARTIN PARISH GOVERNMENT EXHIBIT A
BIDDERS RESPONSE FORM

BID OPENING: JULY 6,2012 @ 10:30 A.M.
ITEM NO. FOUR (4): CULVERTS & PIPES

Reinforced Concrete Culverts

18 Inches NO BID

24 Inches NO BID

30 Inches NO BID

36 Inches NO BID

42 Inches NO BID

48 Inches NO BID

54 Inches NO BID

60 Inches NO BID

72 Inches NOBID

Reinforced Concrete Arch Culverts

18 Inches NOBID

24 Inches NOBID

30 Inches NO BID

36 Inches NOBID

42 Inches NOBID

48 Inches NOBID

54 Inches NOBID

60 Inches NO BID
72 Inches NOBID

Corrugated Metal Pipes
Plain Coated
14 Gauge | 16 Gauge | 14 Gauge 16 Gauge

8 Inches NO BID 7.00 NO BID 10.00
10 Inches NO BID 8.00 NO BID 11.50
12 Inches 10.00 8.50 12.25 12.00
15 Inches 12.50 10.00 16.00 13.25
18 Inches 15.00 12.50 19.40 17.00
21 Inches 19.50 15.00 22.21 21.00
24 Inches 20.00 16.00 25.50 21.50
30 Inches 25.00 20.00 32.00 27.00
36 Inches 30.00 24.00 37.50 31.70
42 Inches 40.00 32.00 53.00 42.00
48 Inches 45.00 36.00 57.00 48.00
54 Inches 55.00 48.00 72.00 63.00
60 Inches 64.00 53.00 80.00 68.00
66 Inches 74.00 60.00 95.00 81.50
72 Inches 81.00 65.00 105.00 89.00
78 Inches 86.00 72.00 112.00 96.00




84 Inches 94.00 78.00 122.00 105.00
90 Inches 100.00 82.00 129.00 110.00
96 Inches 107.00 NOBID 138.00 119.00 .
102 Inches 114.00 NOBID 147.00 NOBID
108 Inches 120.00 NO BID 155.00 NO BID
114 Inches 135.00 NOBID 164.00 NOBID
120 Inches 140.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID

Corrugated Plastic Pipes With Built-in Collars

18 Inches 9.25
24 Inches 14.00
30 Inches 22.00
36 Inches 28.00
42 Inches 38.00
48 Inches 45.00
54 Inches NOBID
60 Inches 83.00
72 Inches NO BID

ADDRESS:

AUTHORIZED AGENT:

TITLE:

NAME OF COMPANY: COASTAL CULVERT & SUPPLY, INC.

P.O. BOX 1145

EUNICE, LA 70535

hoijide Falonbe

DENISE LACOMBE

EXECUTIVE OFFICE MANAGER

TELEPHONE NUMBER: 337-546-6887

EXHIBIT A




DOCUMENT 00410 (REVISION 1)
LOUISIANA UNIFORM PUBLIC WORK BID FORM

TO: St. Martin Parish Government BID FOR: 2012 Parishwide Road Improvements

301 W. Port Street

St. Martinville, Louisiana 70582 St. Martin Parish, Louisiana

The undersigned bidder hereby declares and represents that she/he; a) has carefully examined and understands the Bidding
Documents, b) has not received, relied on, or based his bid on any verbal instructions contrary to the Bidding Documents or any
addenda, ¢) has personally inspected and is familiar with the project site, and hereby proposes to provide all labor, materials, tools,
appliances and facilities as required to perform, in a workmanlike manner, all work and services for the construction and
completion of the referenced project, all in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents prepared by: Professional Engineering

and Surveying Company, Inc.. 411 Wall Street. Lafayetie. LA and dated: June 2012.

Bidders mmst acknowledge all addenda. The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following ADDENDA:

Ne. ) Dated:ﬂ_B_’,ama__‘ No. Dated: No. Dated:

No. Dated: No. Dated: No. Dated:

BASE BID: For all work required by the Bidding Documents (including any and all unit prices but not alternates) the sum of:

Dollars ($

ALTERNATES: For any and all work required by the Bidding Documents for Alternates.

Alternate No. 1 (Jmprovements to Hollier Road) for the himp sum of:

Dollars ($
Alternate No. 2 (NONE) for the lump sum of:

Dollars ($
Alternate No. 3 (NONE) for the tump sum of:

Dollars {$

Bddendo A Acoes NOT oppiy o Conested Cowe+t Eguppi&f,'ﬁ'ﬁ
NAME OF BIDDER: ( oastal Cuivery DUDD\U

ADDRESS OF BIDDER: P. (5. Box HHHS

Euonice LR TI0H3c

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICEN SE NUMBER: A

NAME OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER: Dh CISEe L(“L(‘ OF ﬁb
TITLE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER: m :

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER *: /{//4/ Z{, /ﬁ / aryh [/

DATE: “32 [a

* If someone other than a corporate officer signs for the Bidder/Contractor, a copy of a corporate resolution or other signature
authorization shall be required for submission of bid. Failure to include a copy of the appropriate signature authorization, if
required, may result in the rejection of the bid unless bidder has complied with La. R.S. 38:2212(A)(1Xc) or RS 38:2212(0) .

BID SECURITY in the form of a bid bond, certified check or cashier’s check as prescribed by LA RS 38:2218.A is attached to

and made a part of this bid. Ifa bid bond is provided it shail be on the attached form and only on the attached form.




