PHONE 800.245.9540

( I(lN FAX 800.369.5490
EMAIL bids@mackin.com

WEB www.mackin.com

Print and Digital Educational Resources MAIL 3505 County Road 42 West, Burnsville, MN 55306

April 19, 2017

Lafayette Parish School System Paperback Books
Purchasing Department BID #67-17
113 Chaplin Drive Due: April 21, 10:00AM

Lafayette, LA 70508

Dear Purchasing Director:

Thank you for the opportunity to submit a bid for Lafayette Parish School System. Our pricing proposal
and signed forms are attached as per your request.

In reference to Addendum #1, Mackin would like to offer a flat fixed discount for further orders at an
additional 20% off Mackin.com, which is already discounted up to 45% off publishers’ list prices.

Mackin is a one-source acquisition service providing more than 2.5 million titles from over 18,000
different publishers. We are committed to providing a superior level of customer service and free
shipping is always provided on all orders. For more information about Mackin, please visit our website at
www.mackin.com.

If you have any questions about Mackin’s proposal, or if we can assist in any other way, do not hesitate
to contact me. We look forward to continuing our relationship with Lafayette Parish School System!

Best regards,

Gracr Wit

Grace Mundt
Bid Coordinator
Email: bids@mackin.com




SPECIFICATIONS AND BID FORM FOR
PAPERBACK BOOKS, BID #67-17

Sealed bids will be received by the Lafayette Parish School System (LPSS) Purchasing Department, 113
Chaplin Drive, Lafayette, LA up to 10:00 am on April 21, 2017 for Paperback Books.

All bids shall be submitted sealed to the LPSS Purchasing Department on or before the above time and
date, at 113 Chaplin Drive, Lafayette, LA 70508 with a sealed envelope plainly marked “Sealed Bid#
67-17, Paperback Books, opening April 21, 2017 at 10:00 am. ALL BIDS SHALL BE SENT BY
REGISTERED OR CERTIFIED MAIL WITH A RETURN RECEIPT REQUESTED. At the above
time and place bids will be publicly opened and read aloud in the Personnel Conference room.

SPECIAL PROVISIONS

1. SCOPE:

11

1.2

1.3

The intent of this solicitation is to obtain competitive bids for the estimated annual
requirements for PAPERBACK BOOKS for the Lafayette Parish School System, in
accordance with the terms, conditions and specifications contained herein.

REQUIRED BID SUBMITTALS: The section titled BID# 67-17 PAPERBACK
BOOKS BID FORM, the Debarment Certification Form (page 34), and the Bid
Signature Page (page 35) of this bid must be submitted as specified in Section 11.1.

All vendors submitting bids must be engaged in the regular business of book sales, either
wholesale or retail.

2. PERIOD OF CONTRACT:

2.1

2.2

The period of this contract shall be from date of award through June 30, 2017.

LPSS reserves the right to renew the contract at the same terms and conditions for an
additional twenty-four (24) month period. Renewal option will be renewed in twelve
(12) month periods.

3. PRICES AND PRICE ADJUSTMENT:

3.1

3.2

All prices/discounts shall be F.O.B. Destination and shall include all charges that may be
imposed in fulfilling the terms of this contract. Prices/discounts shall remain firm for the
duration of the contract.

Whenever there is a reduction in price which is lower than the contract price, offered to
similarly situated customers contracting for the same period and under the same terms
and conditions, said reduction must be presented directly to the Purchasing Department
of the Lafayette Parish School System.

Prices may not exceed the national advertised and available General Services
Administration (GSA) governmental price list.
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4.

10.

The Lafayette Parish School System does not intend to award or to maintain any item in
any group that is offered at a price equal to or above the publisher’s list price.

QUANTITIES:

4.1  The quantities specified on the Pricing Schedule are estimated only, and are given for the
information of bidders and for the purpose of bid evaluation. They do not indicate the
actual quantity that will be ordered, since such volume will depend upon requirements
that develop during the contract period. The awarded bidder will be required to fill all
orders placed regardless of the original quantities shown.

QUOTATION LIMITATION:

6.1 Bidders shall offer only ONE ITEM AND PRICE for each line item bid. No alternatives will be
accepted, unless requested by the LPSS. If an "or approved equal" item is to be bid, the bidder must
select the brand and model that meets or exceeds the specified item and submit his bid for that item.
A discount price offered for a quantity purchase of the same manufacturer and model would not be
considered a limitation; however, only the unit price requested will be considered in award.

TIME OF PERFORMANCE:

7.1 The winning bidder(s) shall be required to deliver the respective items within 45 days of receipt
of a purchase order from LPSS and at the location specified in accordance with Section 8.1 of
this bid.

DELIVERY:

8.1 Deliveries will be made to various locations in Lafayette Parish. Delivery location shall be stated on
each purchase order issued.

8.2 Warehouse deliveries for the Lafayette Parish Public School System (LPSS), Warehouse
Department, 113 Chaplin Drive, Lafayette, Louisiana 70508, will be received between the hours of
7:30 a.m. and 4:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, except School System Holidays.

8.3 Inside delivery direct to schools, centers or LPSS agencies will include off-loading from the selected
carrier and carrying inside the receiving school, center or LPSS agency. Receiving hours will be
from 8:30 a.m. through 3:30 p.m., Monday through Friday, except School System Holidays, unless
other arrangements have been made with the receiving school, center or LPSS agency.

SHIPPING AND MARKING:

10.1 The bidder will be required to mark all shipments with the Lafayette Parish School System purchase
order number clearly visible on the exterior of each container. A packing slip must be furnished with
each shipment, listing, in addition to the bidder's stock number and description, the purchase order
number, the purchase order item number, the quantity ordered, the quantity shipped, and the quantity
back ordered.

10.2 The bidder shall ensure that all items that are "drop-shipped" are properly marked as outlined in
Paragraph 10.1.

10.3 Invoices and all related written materials pertaining to each delivery must show the purchase order
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11.

12.

13.

number, the purchase order item number, and the item number shown on the contract.

SUBMISSION OF BIDS:

111

11.2

11.3

All bids must be received in the envelope provided with the invitation to bid or in an envelope
labeled as follows: “SEALED BID”. Bid/Project Description, Bid Number, Opening Date and Time,
Bidder’s Company Name and bidder’s number (if applicable toward public works project). The
LPSB shall not be responsible if a bid is not received due to lack of improper labeling of the
envelope.

Bidder’s envelope must be labeled as follows:

Paperback Books, Bid # 67-17
Opening: April 21, 2017
Time: 10:00 am CST
Personnel Conference Room

Bids received after the time or date prescribed shall not be considered for award and shall be
returned to the Bidder.

Each bidder must use the attached bid form for submitting their bid. Bidder must indicate a unit
price for each item for which a bid is submitted. By executing the Bid Proposal Form, the bidder
acknowledges that he has read this Invitation, understands it, and agrees to be bound by its terms and
conditions. Bids may be submitted by mail or delivered in person. Electronic bids maybe submitted
online at www.centralauctionhouse.com. All bids must be received by a Purchasing Department
Buyer at the following location prior to the date and time specified: Purchasing Department, 113
Chaplin Drive, Lafayette, Louisiana 70508.

CONTRACT AWARD:

121

12.2

All items listed in this solicitation will be awarded on the basis of a firm fixed price.

If awarded, the LPSS will award the contract to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder. The
LPSS reserves the right to award the contract in the aggregate or to make a split award to more than
one bidder, whichever is in the best interest of the public.

PURCHASE ORDER:

131

13.2

13.3

134

135

Purchase order(s) for the items listed in this solicitation will be issued as required throughout the
period of this contract and will become an integral part of the resulting contract. The purchase order
indicates that sufficient funds have been obligated.

The purchase order does not supersede any provision of the resulting contract. Performance time
and dates are determined solely by the contract and any modification thereto.

Shipment is not to begin until receipt of the purchase order or other notification by the Purchasing
Agent to proceed.

Bidders shall not require a minimum order quantity.

LPSS will be responsible for payment of books that have been ordered using a LPSS
purchase order.
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13.6 Individual schools will be responsible for payment of books that have been ordered using a
school purchase order.

14. ORDER OF PRECEDENCE:

14.1 In the event of conflict, the Special Provisions of this contract shall take precedence over the General
Conditions and Instructions to Bidders, included herein.

15. CONTACT FOR ADMINISTRATION:

15.1 In the event a contract is executed with your firm as a result of this solicitation, indicate the person(s)
we may contact for prompt contract administration in the space provided on the Bid Proposal Form.

16. EMERGENCY PURCHASES:

16.1 The Parish reserves the right to make emergency purchases from other sources, should the awarded
bidder be unable to furnish the required item within the required time frame.

17. INTERPRETATION OF BID:

17.1 Any questions pertaining to this solicitation shall be directed to:
Lee Francis, Purchasing Agent
Lafayette Parish School Board
P.O. Drawer 2158
Lafayette, Louisiana 70502-2158
Telephone Number: (337) 521-7329

GENERAL CONDITIONS AND INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS Rev.5/10/16

(Bidder: The general rules and conditions that follow apply to all purchases and become a definite part of each formal
invitation to bid, purchase order or other award issued by the Lafayette Parish School Board, unless otherwise specified.
Bidders are expected to fully inform themselves as to the conditions, requirements, and specifications before submitting bids:
failure to do so will be at the bidder’s own risk and he cannot secure relief on the plea of error).

INSTRUCTIONS

SUBMITTING OF SEALED BIDS

A Option 1 — Electronic Bids Submitted Online:
1. Electronic bids maybe submitted online at www.centralauctionhouse.com.

Option 2 — Sealed Bid Envelope:

1. The bidder shall be solely responsible for the timely furnishing of bids. In order to guarantee the
timely furnishing of bids, the bid must be returned by certified, registered mail with a return receipt
requested, or hand delivered. The LPSB will not accept responsibility or guarantee the timeliness of
bids received by any other means.

2. All bids must be received in the envelope provided with the invitation to bid or in an envelope
labeled as follows: “SEALED BID”. Bid/Project Description, Bid Number, Opening Date and Time,
Bidder’s Company Name and bidder’s number (if applicable toward public works project). The LPSB
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shall not be responsible if a bid is not received due to lack of improper labeling of the envelope.

3. Bid shall be submitted under separate cover. The Board shall not be responsible for bid if not
submitted under separate cover.

Bid Forms:
1. Bids must be submitted on the forms furnished in the bid package.

2. Signature: Bid forms must be signed in ink. Typed, printed or stamped names shall be reason to
reject the bid. An unsigned bid shall be considered a “NO BID”.

3. The signature page of the bid document and a signed debarment certification form must be
provided with a bidders bid response.

4. The forms should not be detached from the specifications of which it forms a part.

5. Completeness:

a. All information required in the bid must be supplied to constitute a proper bid.
b. On lines provided, the bidder must insert the manufacturer’s brand name and identifying
numbers along with any other information necessary to sufficiently identify the article(s) offered.
Failure to do so may prevent consideration of the item bid.
C. Failure on the part of any bidder to supply all required information shall be cause to reject said
bid from consideration.

5. Place, Date and Hour:

a. All bids shall be submitted to the location specified.

b. The bid form designates the date and hour of the bid opening. Bids shall be
received until the stated date and time: bids arriving after the started date and time
will not be considered. The responsibility for timely delivery of bids rests solely
with the bidder.

6. Response to Invitations: In the event you cannot submit a bid, please return the bid package
with an explanation why you are unable to bid on these requirements. The large number of firms on the
bid list makes it necessary to delete from the “NOTIFICATION TO BID LIST” bidders who fail to
respond to three successive invitations to bid.

7. Bid Response: More than one offer from an individual, firm, partnership, corporation or
association under the same or different name will be rejected. Bidders shall offer only ONE ITEM
AND PRICE for each line item bid. No alternatives will be accepted, unless requested by the LPSS.
If an "equivalent” item is to be bid, the bidder must select the brand and model that is functionally
equivalent to the specified item and submit his bid for that item. A discount price offered for a quantity
purchase of the same manufacturer and model would not be considered a limitation; however, only the
unit price requested will be considered in award.
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C. Specifications:

1. Specifying of certain brand, catalog number, make or manufacturer is to denote the quality, type
and standard of the article desired that has been cited as meeting the needs of the Lafayette Parish
School Board; however, bids are invited that are comparable products that would equally satisfy
requirements stated herein.

2. Articles offered must be new merchandise (unless specifically excepted) and must be of equal or
superior grade.

3. Questions Regarding Specifications: Any information relative to interpretation of
specifications and drawings shall be requested of the Board in writing. Any interpretation made to
prospective bidders will be expressed as an addendum to the specifications which, if issued, will be sent
to all prospective bidders no later than three (3) days before the date set for opening of bids. Oral
answers will not be binding on the Board.

D. Technical Data:

1. COMPLETE MANUFACTURER’S SPECIFICATIONS MUST ACCOMPANY ALL
BIDS WHEN BIDDING AN ALTERNATE. FAILURE TO SUBMIT COMPLETE
MANUFACTURER’S SPECIFICATIONS WILL BE REASON TO REJECT THE BID.

2. All deviations from the specifications must be noted in detail by the bidder, in writing, at the
time of submittal on the formal bid where specified. The absence of a written list of specification
deviations at the time of submittal of the bid will hold the bidder strictly accountable to the Lafayette
Parish School Board to the specifications as written.

E. Bid Samples: When required as stated in the Bid Proposal. (May be required after bid opening
for evaluation purposes.)

1. Submittal: Samples shall be submitted to the Lafayette Parish School Board Purchasing
Department, at the same location as the bid opening, no later than the date and our of the bid

opening.

2. Identification: Each sample shall be identified with the bidder’s name, bid number, bid item
number, product trade name and identification (catalog number, model number, etc.), and/or as
otherwise indicated in the bid invitation forms.

3. Payment for Samples: The Board will buy no samples and will assume no-cost incidental
thereto. When samples are requested, they must be sent prepaid and within the specified time.

4, Return of Samples: Samples not destroyed in testing must be claimed by bidders within
fourteen (14) days after bid award date. The Board will assume no responsibility for samples not
claimed within the time specified, and it will pay for no samples damaged in testing.

5. Rejection: Failure to provide requested sample within specified time may result in forfeiture of
award.
6. Demonstration/Evaluation: The Board reserves the right to request a demonstration in order to
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properly evaluate any item(s) on the bid. Failure to demonstrate as requested without reason acceptable
to the Board shall be reason to reject the bid.

F. Warranty:
1. Bidder guarantees to replace or repair at his expense all materials of his supply found to be

defective within one (1) year from the day of delivery where such defects are due to defective materials
and/or workmanship. This is to include any freight/delivery charges required for shipping to or from the
particular Lafayette Parish School Board facility.

2. Warranty repair/service for equipment will be performed at the school when possible.

G. Asbestos:

No asbestos material of asbestos containing material shall be a part of or included in any product
sold or furnished to the Lafayette Parish School Board by any person or supplier.

H. Non-Collusion:

Vendors, by submitting a signed bid, certify that the accompanying bid is not the result of, or
affected by, any unlawful act of collusion with any person or company engaged in the same line
of business or commerce, or any other fraudulent act punishable under Louisiana or United
States law.

l. Freight:

Delivery is to be made to the location(s) listed in the bid. All bid prices are to include delivery to
the specified location(s). (F.O.B. destination).
J. Taxes:

In accordance with Act 1029, effective September 1, 1991, the Lafayette Parish School Board is
exempt from Sales Tax on all purchases.

K. Evaluation of Offers:

1. The Lafayette Parish School Board, in making its award, will consider the lowest responsive
bidder. The Lafayette Parish School Board reserves the right to reject any and/or all bids.

2. Bids for All or Part: With the exception of public works projects, the Board reserves the right to
award on an “ALL-OR-NONE” and/or partial basis whichever is in the best interest of the Lafayette
Parish School Board. Bidder may restrict his bid to consideration as “ALL-OR-NONE” by so stating,
but shall give a unit price for each item; any bid in which the bidder names a total price for all the
articles without quoting a price on each item shall be rejected.

3. Cash Discounts: Cash Discounts, if offered, will be taken in consideration in determining the
low bid. DISCOUNTS OF LESS THAN THIRTY (30) DAYS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED IN
MAKING AN AWARD. Beginning date of discount period shall be determined by date of invoice or
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date of delivery of merchandise whichever occurs first.
4. All items listed in this solicitation will be awarded on the basis of a firm fixed price.

5. Errors in Bids: Bids containing errors may be withdrawn by the bidder in accordance with
L.R.S. 38:3314.C. Erasures or changes in bids must be initialed.

6. Tie Bids: Tie bids will be decided on the basis of drawing lots, unless only one instate vendor is
involved. In these cases, preference will be given to the instate vendor as provided for in L.R.S.
38.2225.C.

7. Ability & Experience: Considerations used for determining bidder responsibility include
“financial ability, skill, integrity, business judgement, experience, reputation, quality of previous work
on contracts, and any other similar factors bearing on bidders’ ability to successfully perform the
contract”. Each proposal will receive equal consideration and special attention directed to the bidder’s
qualifications as provided for in L.R.S. 38.2216.C (2) (a).

L. Purchases Without Bid Security, Contracts & Performance (Delivery) Security

1. Failure to Perform: In the event a successful bidder fails to perform (deliver) on an awarded bid
and no bid security and/or performance securities were required, the Board shall declare the bidder in
default. The Board then has the option of excusing the bidder if it determines good cause exists or it
may require a penalty as liquidated damages. In the event a penalty is directed, it shall be the Board’s
option to invoke the following:

a. Payment to the Board in the amount equal to the difference between the unit price bid times the
quantity on an item to item basis of that of the successful bidder and the next responsible low bidder(s)
and/or

b. If it becomes necessary to re-bid, payment to the Board in the amount equal to the difference
between the unit price times the quantity on an item basis of that of the successful bidder on the original
bid and that of the lowest responsible bidder(s) on the re-bid.

M. Change or Withdrawal of Bids:

1. Change or Withdrawal Prior to Bid Opening: Should any bidder desire to change or withdraw
his bid he shall do so prior to the date and hour of the opening.

2. Withdrawal After Bid Opening-But Prior to Bid Award: No bid may be withdrawn after the
scheduled closing time for receipt of bids for sixty (60) calendar days, except as provided in Section
2214 of L.R.S. Title 38, which states the bidder shall give notice in writing of his claim of right to
withdraw his bid within forty-eight hours after the conclusion of the bid opening procedure.

N. Rejection of Bids:

The Board reserves the right to reject any and all bids for just cause. In accordance with L.R.S.
38:2212(1)(1)(b) those stated in the advertisement for bids, and those requirements in the bid
packet shall not be considered informalities and shall not be waived by any public entity.
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0. Award & Acceptance:

1. Bid Tabulation: Copy of bid tabulation may be received upon written request and by submitting
a stamped, self-addressed envelope.

2. If awarded, the LPSS will award the contract to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder.
The LPSS reserves the right to award the contract in the aggregate or to make a split award to more than
one bidder, whichever is in the best interest of the public.

3. Notice of Acceptance: A written award in the form of a purchase order, contract, written notice
of award of any combination of these three to the successful bidder shall be deemed to result in a
binding contract for the purchase of materials or supplies without further action by either party as
provided for in L.R.S 38:2216.B. If the bid and resulting award regards the construction of doing of any
public works, a written contract must be entered into according to L.R.S. 38:2216.A(1).

P. Delivery Provisions:

1. Shipment is not to begin until receipt of the purchase order or other notification by the
Purchasing Agent to proceed. All deliveries of products shall be made within 45 days ARO designated,
freight prepaid. At the time delivery is made an authorized agent must sign a dray receipt.

2. Responsibility of Materials Shipped: Successful bidder shall be responsible for the materials or
supplies until they are delivered to the location(s) specified in the bid specifications. If materials or
supplies are rejected they must be removed by and at the expense of the bidder promptly after
notification of rejection.

3. Inspections: Inspection and acceptance of goods will be made after delivery.

4. Time of Delivery: Deliveries will be accepted between 8:30 A.M. and 3:30 P.M.

5. Packing Slips or Delivery Tickets: ALL SHIPMENTS OR DELIVERIES shall be
accompanied by Packing Slips or Delivery Tickets, and contain the following information:

a. Purchase Order number,
b. Name of the article and stock number (Supplier’s),
C. Quantity ordered,
d. Back orders,
e. Name of the vendor.
Q. Excluded Parties:

Bidders shall complete and sign the “Certification Regarding Debarment, Suspension, and Other
Responsibility Matters Primary Covered Transactions” Form. This form must be included with
the bid proposal.

BIDDERS ARE CAUTIONED THAT FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH THESE
CONDITIONS SHALL BE CONSIDERED SUFFICIENT REASON FOR REFUSAL TO
ACCEPT THE GOODS.
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The Special Case of Meals:

Contracts which relate to school lunch program are exempt from the provisions and requirements
contained herein.

(SPECIAL CONDITIONS found on succeeding pages always supersede the General Conditions).

LAFAYETTE PARISH SCHOOL BOARD
BILLY D. GUIDRY, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR & CHIEF FINANCIAL OFFICER
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BID# 67-17 PAPERBACK BOOKS BID FORM

. Estimated Publisher % . ]
Paperback Book Title ISBN# 3 3 3 . Unit Price Mackin Notes
— Quantity List Price | Discount Off
47 9780316016353 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11
1984 9780451524935 50 $9.99 36.54% $6.34
1 Dead in Attic: After Katrina 9781501125379 50 $17.00 44.47% $9.44
100 More Words Every High
9780544789890 50 6.95 44.469 3.86
School Graduate Should Now » % ?
100 Sideways Miles 9781442444966 50 $11.99 44.45% $6.66
19 Varieties of Gazelle: P f
arieties of bazetle: Foems of | 4500060504045 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
the Middle East
5 Stepsto a5: AP English
Language 2017 Cross Platform 9781259583445 50 $28.00 33.32% $18.67
Prep Course
5 Steps to a 5: AP English
epstoa ngls 9781259586521 50 $18.00 33.33% $12.00
Literature 2017
5tol 9780385391535 50 $17.99 31.91% $12.25
A Chair for My Mother 9780688040741 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
A Day's Work 9780395845189 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
A Lesson Before Dying 9780375702709 50 $14.00 31.93% $9.53
A Seed is Sleepy 9781452131474 50 $7.99 41.55% $4.67
A Sinister Sweet f Splendid
Inister sweetness of splendl 9781595146281 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Academy
A Thousand Splendid Suns 9781594483851 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
A Time to Break Silence: The
Essential Works of Martin Luther 9780807033050 50 $15.00 31.93% $10.21
King, Jr., for Students
A Wrinkle in Time 9780312367541 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Acorn to Oak Tree 9780531249758 50 $5.95 44.37% $3.31
Alas, Babylon 9780060741877 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
Alexand d the Wind-U
exander and the Wind-1p 9780385755511 50 $3.99 37.34% $2.50

Mouse




All American Boys 9781481463331 50 $17.99 44.47% $9.99
All the Bright Places 9780385755917 50 $10.99 37.40% $6.88
Always Running: LaVidaLoca: | g g,7/35769:7 50 $16.00 44.44% $8.89
Gang Days in L.A.
Amelia's Road (Revised) 9781880000274 50 Out of Print
American Gods 9780062472106 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
An Angel for Solomon Singer 9780531070826 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Animal Farm 9780451526342 50 $9.99 36.54% $6.34
Animals in Translation: Using the
Mysteries of Autism to Decode 9780156031448 50 $15.95 44.45% $8.86
Animal Behavior
Anna Karenina 9780143035008 50 $19.00 31.95% $12.93
Antigone 9781580493888 50 $3.99 30.58% $2.77
Arthur Writes a Story 9780780795488 50 $7.00 44.43% $3.89 | :&J:O;;r;;go';iz(;rlblm
Autobiography of Martin Luther | g, 1 c6 76502 50 $16.00 44.44% $8.89
King, Jr.
Awkward 9780316381307 50 $11.00 44.45% $6.11
Baby Cakes 9781416902898 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Backlash 9780545924146 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
Bad Blood 9781622507665 50 $9.95 30.55% $6.91
Bad Boy: A Memoir 9780064472883 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Bears 9781403484611 50 Out of Print
Beautiful and Damned 9780451530431 50 $7.95 36.60% $5.04
Because of Winn Dixie 9780763680862 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
Big Mamas 9780688158422 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Bippity Bop Barbershop 9780316033824 50 $7.00 44.43% $3.89




Black Boy 9780061130243 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
Black Star, Bright Dawn 9780547053196 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Blackthorn ';i‘)' (Key Series 9781481446525 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Bonesetter's Daughter 9780345457370 50 $17.00 35.94% $10.89
Book Scavenger (Series #1) 9781250079800 50 $7.99 44.43% S4.44
Book Thief 9780375842207 50 $12.99 37.49% $8.12
Boy Called Twister 9781616510022 50 $9.95 30.55% $6.91
Brave New World 9780060850524 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
Breakfast of Champions 9780385334204 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
Breaking Through 9780618342488 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Brown Bear, Brown Bear, What do| 4005047905 50 $7.95 44.40% $4.42
You See?
Brown Girl Dreaming 9780147515827 50 $10.99 37.40% $6.88
Bugs! Bugs! Bugs! 9780811822381 50 $14.99 41.69% $8.74
Building Academic Vocabulary: | g 011560347 50 $37.95 16.68% $31.62
Teachers Manual
Bunker Diary 9781467754200 50 $17.99 30.57% $12.49
Buried Onions 9780152062651 50 $6.95 44.46% $3.86
Camo Girl 9781416978053 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Catcher in the Rye 9780316769488 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99
Charlie and the Chocolate Factory 9780142401088 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Charlie and the Grandmothers 9780375868603 50 $16.99 31.90% $11.57
Chicken Soungor Kids Soul 9781623610418 50 $14.95 44.41% $8.31
Child Called It 9781558743663 50 $11.95 30.54% $8.30
Chinese Cinderella: The True 9780385740074 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25

Story of an Unwanted Daughter




Cinder (Lunar Chronicles) 9781250007209 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
Closing the Attitude Gap 9781416616283 50 $23.95 16.66% $19.96
Coming of Age in Mississippi 9780440314882 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Connect the Stars 9780062274663 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Corduroy 9780140501735 50 $6.99 37.63% $4.36
Crayon Box That Talked 9780679886112 50 $12.95 31.89% $8.82
Cress (Lunar Chronicles) 9781250007223 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11
David & Goliath 9780316204378 50 $18.00 44.44% $10.00
Dead Girls of Hysteria Hall 9781338032390 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
Disappearance of Emily H 9780385739443 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Don't Even Think About It 9780385737395 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Don't Let the Pigeon Stay Up Late 9780786837465 50 $16.99 44.44% $9.44
Dragonwings (Anniversary) 9780064400855 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
East of Eden 9780140186390 50 $18.00 31.94% $12.25
Every Living Thing 9780689712630 50 $5.99 44.41% $3.33
Everyone Loves Coloring Flowers 9781505022117 50 Out of Print

Extremely Loculis"’e”d Incredibly | 9780618711659 50 $15.99 44.47% $8.88
Fahrenheit 451 9781451673319 50 $15.99 44.47% $8.88
Fake ID 9780062121851 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24

Farm Animals 9781560212003 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88 I;g;?g;g;gjg;i';
Feedback 9780062026118 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Fences 9780452264014 50 $14.00 31.93% $9.53
Ferals 9780062321046 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37




Fireflies 9780689710551 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Fish Eyes: A Bogr': YouCan Count | 4780152280505 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44 |;§\:J;Os:i7r;3gor1):g§;%lcll<z
Flipped 9780375825446 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25
Frankenstein Graphic Novel 9781598898866 50 $6.95 44.46% $3.86 .;ﬁiﬁ%ﬁ;ﬁ?;@ﬁl
Freak the Mighty 9780439286060 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Freakonomics: A Rouge
Economist Explores the Hidden 9780060731335 50 $16.99 37.49% $10.62
Side of Everything
Froggy Gets Dressed 9780140544572 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
Fuzzy Mud 9780385743785 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00 | ;;\:’:"gt;r;goggg‘;%‘ﬁs
Ghost of Spirit Bear 9780060090098 50 $5.99 37.56% $3.74
Glad Monster, Sad Monster 9780316573955 50 $12.99 44.42% $7.22
Globe: Life in Shakespeare's 9781471125706 50 $15.00 44.47% $8.33
London
Go Set a Watchman 9780062409867 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
Going After Cacciato 9780767904421 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
Good Dog, Carl 9780689817717 50 $7.99 44.43% S4.44
Grandfather and | 9780688175269 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Grouchy Ladybug Board Book 9780694013203 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Growing Vegetable Soup 9780152050559 50 $6.95 44.46% $3.86
Guess Whatis i;‘;‘”ing Insidethe | 4780822561927 50 $16.99 30.55% $11.80
Harold and the Purple Crayon 9780062086525 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
Harry Potter & Sorcerer's Stone 9780590353427 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11
Heart of Dar'g'i:‘:;/ The Congo | o780141441672 50 $11.00 31.91% $7.49
Hello Ocean 9780881069884 50 $7.95 37.48% $4.97




Hidden Talents 9780765379146 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11
Holes 9780440414803 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Hoops 9780307976116 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25
House Arrest 9781452156484 50 $7.99 41.55% $4.67
How Children Succeed: Grit, 9780544104402 50 $15.95 44.45% $8.86
Curiosity...
How it Went Down 9781250068231 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
How Lamar's Bad Prank Wona | o061 995735 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Bubba-Sized Trophy
How Lunchbox Jones Saved Me
from Robots, Traitors, and Missy 9781619634541 50 $16.99 44.44% $9.44
the Cruel
How to Read Literature Like a
Prof Revised Edition: A Livel
rotessor Revised tAtion: ALIVE - 9280062301673 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
and Entertaining Guide to Reading
Between the Lines
How to Steal a Dog 9780312561123 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
| Am Malala, The Girl Who Stood
Up For Education and Was Shot By| 9780316322423 50 $16.00 44.44% $8.89
the Taliban
| Can Share! 9780448455921 50 $4.99 36.47% $3.17
IH A Little Probl Said th
ave At eBg:r em, SaIAIe 1 9780735840942 50 $8.95 44.47% $4.97
| Like Me! 9780140508192 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
| See 9781574719123 50 $3.49 30.37% $2.43
| Wanna lguana 9780399237171 50 $16.99 31.90% $11.57
Ida B 9780060730260 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
I'll Give You the Sun 9780142425763 50 $10.99 37.40% $6.88
lluminate (The llluminate Files | o0 03196117 50 $18.99 31.91% $12.93
Series #1)
Improbable Theory of Ana and Zak| 9780062272782 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
*Quoting paperback
In Dark 9781599907437 50 10.99 44.40% 6.11
n barkness ? ° 3 ISBN: 9781619631229
In the Small, Small Pond 9780805059830 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99




In the Tall, Tall, Grass 9780805039412 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Into the Wild 9780385486804 50 $15.00 31.93% $10.21
Iron Branch: A.CiviIWarTaIe of 9781463776978 50 No bid
Women in Between
Ish 9780763623449 50 $14.00 37.50% $8.75
Jesse Bear, What will you Wear? 9780689851902 50 Out of Print
Jumped 9780060760939 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Just Another Hero 9781416907015 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Just Ducks 9781627657334 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38 *Quoting paperback
ISBN: 9780763670511
Keeper 9780763687465 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Kick 9780062004918 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Kira-Kira 9780689856402 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Kite Runner 9781594631931 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
Krankenstein 9780486282114 50 $6.00 44.50% $3.33
Lis for Louisiana 9781589800229 50 $8.95 30.50% $6.22
Let's Make Pancakes 9780760876077 50 $7.00 37.43% $4.38 |§§\:J:0;i7r:3g1gz;si;ialc§ X
Lockdown 9780061214820 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Lord of the Flies 9780399501487 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25
Lost in the Sun 9780147508584 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Macbeth (Revised) 9780451526779 50 $4.95 36.57% $3.14
Magician of Auschwitz 9781927583463 50 $18.95 37.52% $11.84
Malcolm X: A Life of Reinvention | 9780143120322 50 $21.00 35.19% $13.61
Max's Bedtime 9780670887101 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
Medusa Plot 9780545298391 50 $12.99 44.42% $7.22




Meely LaBauve 9780375758164 50 $16.00 34.88% $10.42
Milkshake 9780760865392 50 No bid
Mindset - The New Psychology of | o 05315475308 50 $17.00 31.94% $11.57
Success
Miss Rumphus 9780140505399 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Monster 9780064407311 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Mouse Was Mad 9780547727509 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Mr. Putter and Tabby Write the | o011 55002428 50 $5.99 44.41% $3.33
Book
My Father's Hands 9780688091897 50 $17.99 37.52% $11.24
My Louisiana Sky 9780312660956 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
My Many Colored Days 9780679893448 50 $7.99 36.55% $5.07
Mystery of Cabin Island #8 9780448089089 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Nearly Gone 9780142424513 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
Nickel and Dimed: On (Not)
Getting by in America 9780312626686 50 $16.00 44.44% $8.89
(Anniversary)
Night 9780374500016 50 $9.95 44.42% $5.53
Night at the Fair 9780688114831 50 $17.99 37.52% $11.24
Nimona 9780062278227 50 Out of Print
No Biting! 9780448455815 50 $4.99 37.47% $3.12
No, David! 9780590930024 50 $17.99 44.47% $9.99
November Blues 9781416906995 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Number the Stars 9780547577098 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
Oliver Twist 9780486424538 50 $6.00 44.50% $3.33
Olivia Saves the Circus 9781442412873 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44




On Monday When It Rained 9780618111244 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
One and Only Ivan 9780061992254 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99 *Quoting paperback
ISBN: 9780061992278

One Dead in the Attic 9781501125379 50 $17.00 44.47% $9.44

One for the Murphys 9780142426524 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00

One Hundred Years of Solitude 9780060883287 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99

Orphan Train Rider: One Boy's | 5700395913628 50 $9.95 44.42% $5.53
True Story

Our Town: APlayin Three Acts | 9780060512637 50 $14.99 37.49% $9.37

Out of My Mind 9781416971719 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55

Outliers: The Story of Success 9780316017930 50 $16.99 44.44% $9.44

Owl Babies 9780763617103 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38

Owl Moon 9780399214578 50 $17.99 31.91% $12.25

Pancakes for Breakfast 9780156707688 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88

Pancakes, Crackers, and Pizza 9780516420639 50 $4.95 44.44% $2.75

Panda Bear, Panda Bear, What Do | o 05315515812 50 $12.99 44.42% $7.22
You See?

Panic 9780062014566 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24

Part of Me: Story of aLouisiana | o031 5581459 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99

Family

Pet Show 9780142300008 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38

Peter's Chair 9780140564419 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38

Ploar Bear, Polar Bear, What Do | o_q05c053883 50 $7.95 44.40% $4.42
You Hear?

Prisoner B-3087 9780545459013 50 $16.99 44.44% $9.44

Puddles 9780140561753 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38

Purple Hibiscus 9781616202415 50 $15.95 34.73% $10.41

Put Me in the Zoo 9780394800172 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25




Pygmalion 9780141439501 50 $12.00 31.92% $8.17
Quiet Loud 9780763619527 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
Red Queen (Series #1) 9780062310644 50 $10.99 37.49% $6.87
Red Rising (Series #1) 9780345539809 50 $15.00 31.93% $10.21
Roller Coaster 9780152057442 50 $7.99 44.43% S4.44
Romeo and Juliet 9780486275574 50 $3.00 44.33% $1.67
Ruby Holler 9780060560157 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Scarlet (Lunar Chronicles) 9781250007216 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
Scoop 9780316216371 50 $15.99 44.47% $8.88
Seesaw Girl 9780547248882 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Shakespeare Lexicon and
Quotation Dictionary: A Complete
Dictionary of All the English
Words, Phrases, and 9780486227269 50 $24.95 44.45% $13.86
Constructions in the Works of the
Poet (Volume 1 A-M) 3rd Revised
and Enlarged Edition
Shakespeare Lexicon and
Quotation Dictionary: A Complete
Dictionary of All the English
Words, Phrases, and 9780486227276 50 $24.95 44.45% $13.86
Constructions in the Works of the
Poet (Volume II, N-Z) 3rd Revised
and Enlarged Edition
Sheep in a Shop 9780395872765 50 $5.95 44.37% $3.31
Shortcut 9780688135768 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Slaughterhouse-Five: Or the
Children's Crusade, A Duty- Dance 9780440180296 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
with Death
Snakes 9780061140952 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Snowy Day 9780140501827 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
Sometimes I'm Bombaloo 9780439669412 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
S Parts: F Und ted
pare Farts: FourUndocumented! 9780374534981 50 $14.00 44.43% $7.78

Teenagers




Spot the Difference: Leaves 9781432909512 50 Out of Print
Stand Tall, Molly 9780399234163 50 $16.99 31.90% $11.57
St C f Dr. Jekyl and Mr.
range Lase ilv dre evianaMr | 9781496500342 50 $6.95 44.46% $3.86
Tales from a Not-So- Fabulous Life 9781416980063 50 $13.99 44.46% $7.77
Tangerine 9780152057800 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99
Ten Apples Up on Top! 9780394800196 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25
Terrible Things 9780827605077 50 $10.00 22.70% $7.73
The Absolutely True Di f
€ AbSOlUTely True DIary ota | 9780316013697 50 $15.99 44.47% $8.88
Part-Time Indian
The Age of Austerity: How
Scarcity Will Remake American 9780307946454 50 $15.95 31.91% $10.86
Politics
The Alchemist 9780062315007 50 $16.99 37.49% $10.62
The American Dream: A Short
History of an Idea That Shaped a 9780195173253 50 $19.99 16.66% $16.66
Nation (Revised)
The Arrival 9780439895293 50 $21.99 44.43% $12.22
The Art of Tim Burton 9781935539018 50 Out of Print
*Quoting different
The Awakening 9780553213300 50 $5.99 37.56% $3.74 paperback edition ISBN:
9780380002450
The Bag I'm Taking to Grandma's 9780688158408 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
The Battle of Jericho 9780689842337 50 $7.99 44.43% S4.44
The Bee Tree 9780698116962 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
The Best Story 9780803730557 50 $16.99 31.90% $11.57
The Book Thief 9780375842207 50 $12.99 37.49% $8.12
. . . *Quoting paperback
The B the Striped P 9780385751063 50 9.99 44.44% 5.55
= BRI s SRl L EmEs 2 ° ? ISBN: 9780385751896
The Call of the Wild: The Graphi
e ~arl orthe Td: The Braphic | 4789380028330 50 $9.99 31.83% $6.81
Novel (Campfire Graphic Novels)
The Catcher in the Rye 9780316769488 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99




The Crucible 9780142437339 50 $15.00 31.93% $10.21
The Gingerbread Man 9780545235143 50 $6.99 38.05% $4.33
The Giver 9780544336261 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99
The Giving Tree 9780060256654 50 $17.99 37.52% $11.24
The Grapes of Wrath 9780143039433 50 $18.00 31.94% $12.25
The Great Gatsby 9780743273565 50 $16.00 44.44% $8.89
The Help 9780425232200 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25 |;§\:J:09ti7r;3gozg;§;b5ﬁ(l
The House of Mango Street 9780679734772 50 $11.95 31.88% $8.14
The Kite Runner (Anniversary) | 9781594631931 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
The Leaves of the Tree 9780545312905 50 Out of Print
The Librarian of Basra 9780152054458 50 $17.99 44.47% $9.99
The Lion, xaer;'\r’:lfz and The 9780060765484 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37 l:g\:‘:(’g;”ggogzznglﬁs
The Little House 9780395259382 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
The Lost Boy: AFoster's Child's | o 01 5ce745155 50 $12.95 30.58% $8.99
Search For
The Magician of Auschwitz 9781927583463 50 $18.95 37.52% $11.84
The Misfits 9780689839566 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
The 0dds of Getting Even 9780803739611 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62 I;&’:(’;;”ggoizgzr;afgs
The Omnivore’s Dilemma: Young | o411 01993835 50 $9.99 37.44% $6.25
Readers Edition
The Other Side 9780064410021 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
The Other Way to Listen 9780689810534 50 $7.99 44.43% $4.44
The Picture of Dorain Gray 9781593080259 50 $7.95 30.57% $5.52
The Privilege of Youth 9780452286290 50 $15.00 31.93% $10.21
The Red Pyramid 9781423113454 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55




The Round House 9780062065254 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99
The Secret History 9781400031702 50 $16.95 31.92% $11.54
The Secret Life of Bees (Revised) 9780142001745 50 $16.00 31.94% $10.89
The Stand 9780307743688 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
The Story of Harriet Tubman:
Conductor of the Underground 9780440404002 50 $5.99 37.40% $3.75
Railroad
The Story of My Life - Helen Keller| 9781512092974 50 No bid

The Teddy Bear 9780805078824 50 $8.99 44.49% $4.99

The Teenage Brain 9780062067845 50 $15.99 37.52% $9.99 | :;:’f;%gogzgggasc:z
The Things They Carried 9780618706419 50 $15.99 44.47% $8.88
The Three Little Pigs 9780140557428 50 $6.99 37.34% $4.38
The Tragedy of Othello 9780743482820 50 $9.95 44.42% $5.53
The Watsons Go to Birmingham 9780385382946 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
The Wave 9780440993711 50 $6.99 37.63% $4.36

The Way to Rainy Mountain 9780826304360 50 No bid

The Wednesday Wars 9780547237602 50 $7.99 44.43% S4.44
Their Eyes Were Watching God 9780060838676 50 $14.99 37.49% $9.37
Things Fall Apart 9780385474542 50 $12.00 31.92% $8.17
Those Shoes 9780763642846 50 $6.99 37.63% $4.36
Through Grandpa's Eyes 9780064430418 50 $6.99 37.48% $4.37
Thunder Cake 9780698115811 50 $7.99 37.42% $5.00
Time of Wonder 9780140502015 50 $6.99 37.63% $4.36
To All The Boys I've Loved Before 9781442426719 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11




To Kill a Mockingbird 9780446310789 50 $8.99 16.69% $7.49
Touching Spirit Bear 9780380805600 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
Twelve Angry Men 9780143104407 50 $14.00 31.93% $9.53
*Quoting hardcover
Unsinkable 9780062213662 50 28.99 37.50% 18.12
? ? ? ISBN: 9780062213655
Very Busy Spider 9780399229190 50 $3.99 37.34% $2.50 *Quoting paperback
y BUSY 5P : S : ISBN: 9780448480527
Very Hungry Catepillar 9780399226908 50 $10.99 37.40% $6.88
Very Lonely Firefly 9780399234279 50 $11.99 37.45% $7.50
Voices in the Park 9780789481917 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Voices of Holocaust 9780789183743 50 Available publisher only
Voices of the Hol t Teach
oices ot the Holocaust Teacher | 9280789150530 50 Available publisher only
Guide
Walk Two Moons 9780064405171 50 $7.99 37.55% $4.99
Walls Around Us 9781616205904 50 $9.95 34.67% $6.50
Watership Down 9780743277709 50 $18.99 44.44% $10.55
We are in a Book! 9781423133087 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
We are Robin: Volume 1 The 9781401259822 50 $14.99 31.89% $10.21
Viligante Business
We Are Witnesses: 5 Diaries of 9780312535674 50 $9.99 44.44% $5.55
We Stand on Guard 9781534301412 50 $14.99 30.55% $10.41
We Were Liars 9780385741262 50 $17.99 31.91% $12.25
We Will Not Be Silent: The White
Rose Student Resistance
9780544223790 50 17.99 44.47% 9.99
Movement That Defied Adolf ? ? ?
Hitler
We're Different, We're All th
ere bitterent, Were Allthe 9780679832270 50 $4.99 36.47% $3.17
Same
Whale Talk 9780061771316 50 $9.99 37.54% $6.24
What Do Authors Do? 9780395866214 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88




When | was the Greatest 9781442459489 50 $10.99 44.40% $6.11
When Sophie Gets Angry 9780439598453 50 $6.99 44.49% $3.88
Where are the Great Pyramids 9780563488033 50 Out of Print
Who was Jackie Robinson? 9780448455570 50 $5.99 37.56% $3.74
Why Zebras Don't Get Ulcers 9780805073690 50 $19.99 44.42% $11.11
Wish Girl 9781595146878 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Within Reach: My Everest Story 9780141304977 50 $8.99 37.49% $5.62
Wonder 9780375869020 50 $16.99 31.90% $11.57
Worm is Hot 9780763611569 50 Out of Print




Certification Regarding
Debarment, Suspension, and Other Responsibility Matters
Primary Covered Transactions

This certification is required by the regulations implementing Executive Order 12549, Debarment and
Suspension, 13 CFR Part 145. The regulations were published as Part VI of the May 26, 1988 Federal Register
(pages 19160-19211).

INSTRUCTIONS FOR CERTIFICATION

1. By signing and submitting this proposal, the prospective primary participant is providing the certification set
out below.

2. The inability of a person to provide the certification required below will not necessarily result in denial of
participation in this covered transaction. The prospective participant shall submit an explanation of why it
cannot provide the certification set out below. The certification or explanation will be considered in
connection with the department or agency's determination whether to enter into this transaction. However,
failure of the prospective primary participant to furnish a certification or an explanation shall disqualify such
person from participation in this transaction.

3. The certification in this clause is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when the
department or agency determined to enter into this transaction. If it is later determined that the prospective
primary participant knowingly rendered an erroneous certification, in addition to other remedies available to
the Federal Government, the department or agency may terminate this transaction for cause or default.

4. The prospective primary participant shall provide immediate written notice to the department or agency to
which this proposal is submitted if at any time the prospective primary participant learns that its certification
was erroneous when submitted or has become erroneous by reason of changed circumstances.

5. The terms "covered transaction,” "debarred,” "suspended,” "ineligible," "lower tier covered transaction,"
"participant,” "person," "primary covered transaction," "principal,” "proposal,” and "voluntarily excluded," as
used in this clause, have the meanings set out in the Definitions and Coverage sections of the rules
implementing Executive Order 12549. You may contact the department or agency to which this proposal is
submitted for assistance in obtaining a copy of those regulations (13 CFR Part 145).

6. The prospective primary participant agrees by submitting this proposal that, should the proposed covered
transaction be entered into, it shall not knowingly enter into any lower tier covered transaction with a person
who is debarred, suspended, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this covered
transaction, unless authorized by the department or agency entering into this transaction.

7. The prospective primary participant further agrees by submitting this proposal that it will include the clause
titled "Certification Regarding Debarment, Suspension, Ineligibility and Voluntary Exclusion--Lower Tier
Covered Transactions," provided by the department or agency entering into this covered transaction, without
modification, in all lower tier covered transactions and in all solicitations for lower tier covered transactions.

8. A participant in a covered transaction may rely upon a certification of a prospective participant in a lower tier
covered transaction that it is not debarred, suspended, ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from the covered
transaction, unless it knows that the certification is erroneous. A participant may decide the method and
frequency by which it determines the ineligibility of its principals. Each participant may, but is not required
to, check the non-procurement List.

9. Nothing contained in the foregoing shall be construed to require establishment of a system of records in order
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10.

(D

@

By

to render in good faith the certification required by this clause. The knowledge and information of a
participant is not required to exceed that which is normally possessed by a prudent person in the ordinary
course of business dealings.

Except for transactions authorized under paragraph 6 of these instructions, if a participant in a covered
transaction knowingly enters into a lower tier covered transaction with a person who is suspended, debarred,
ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction, in addition to other remedies
available to the Federal Government, the department or agency may terminate this transaction for cause or
default.

CERTIFICATION

The prospective primary participant certifies to the best of its knowledge and belief that it and its principals:

(a) Are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for disbarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily
excluded from covered transactions by any Federal department or agency;

(b) Have not within a three-year period preceding this application been convicted of or had a civil judgment
rendered against them for commission of fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining,
attempting to obtain, or performing a public (Federal, State, or local) transaction or contract under a
public transaction; violation of Federal or State antitrust statutes or commission of embezzlement, theft,
forgery, bribery, falsification or destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen

property;

(c) Are not presently indicted for or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a governmental entity
(Federal, State, or local) with commission of any of the offenses enumerated in paragraph (1)(b) of this
certification; and

(d) Have not within a three-year period preceding this application had one or more public transactions
(Federal, State, or local) terminated for cause or default.

Where the prospective primary participant is unable to certify to any of the statements in this certification,
such prospective primary participant shall attach an explanation to this proposal.

Business Name Mackin Educational Resources Date 4/20/2017
Grace Mundt, Bid Coordinator %M W
Name and Title of Authorized Representative Signature of Authorized Representative
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Envelope containing bid should be marked on the outside “Sealed Bid—Paperback Books--#67-17
Opening April 21, 2017 at 10:00 am CST.

The bidder acknowledges receipt of addendum:

No.1 DATED 4/13/2017  No.2 DATED No.3 DATED

No.4 DATED No.5 DATED No.6 DATED
That I have read and agree to comply with and be subject to the provisions and/or penalties involved in

the “General Conditions and Instructions to Prospective Bidders” and the bid form as contained herein
the bid documents.

Mackin Educational Resources M%M
Name of Firm Signature of Bidder

3505 County Road 42 West Grace Mundt
Address Typed Name of Bidder
800-245-9540 bids@mackin.com

Telephone Number Email Address

Page 35 of 35





