INVITATION FOR BIDS
Page 2
Orders shall originate...

Where notice is required under any of the terms of the bid or contract, it shall be sent to
the respective parties to this bid and contract as follows:

SCHOOL BOARD: NAME Pointe Coupee Parish School Board

NAME/TITLE Donald Fuselier/ Director of Support Services

ADDRESS P. O. Drawer 579

New Roads. LA 70760
PHONE (225) 638-4437

CONTRACTOR: NAME General Paper Company. Inc.

(Please Complete) TITLE _ Operations Manager

ADDRESS p 0 Rox 77610, Baton Rouge, L A_T\0R79
PHONE  225-291-7827

The Pointe Coupee Parish School Board, the Louisiania Department of Education, the
United States Department of Agriculture, the Comptroller General of the United States,
or any of their duly authorized representatives, may have access to any books,
documents, papers and records of the contractor which are directly pertinent to this
specific contract, for the purpose of making audit, examination, excerpts, and
transcriptions.

Contractor shall comply with applicable federal, state, and local laws and regulations
pertaining to wages, hours, and conditions of employment. In connection with
contractor's performance of work under this Agreement, contracior agrees not to
discriminate against any employee(s) or application(s) for employment because of age,
race, religion, sex, creed, national origin, handicap or disability.

Contact Person: If you have any questions conceming this Invitation for Bid, please
phone (225) 638-4437, Mr. Donald Fuselier or Karen Armand.




SECTIONV; CONTRACT CONDITIONS

Repeated failure to make delivery in accordance with specifications will result in the
termination of the contract and/or disqualification of the vendor until such time as she/he
furnishes satisfactory evidence that future obligations can be fulfilled. Failure to render
prompt service will be considered in making subsequent awards.

Contracts may be terminated at any time on thirty (30) days notice upon the mutual

agreement of both parties, or at any time if the terms of the contract are violated in any
way.

By the signature of its authorized representative on this document, the bidder hereby
certifies that it is in compliance with Executive Order 11246, entitled "Equal
Employment Opportunity,” as amended by Executive Order 11375, and as supplemented
in Department of Labor regulations (41 CFR Part 60), with Section 503 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973 and with the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990.

NAME OF FIRM: _ General Paper Company, Inc.
SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: @JN_,

PRINT NAME OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: Ann Gerald

TITLE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: CEO
COMPLETE ADDRESS OF FIRM: 11091 Airline Hwy., Baton Rouge, LA 70816

DATE: jyne 2, 2015

*  NOTE: ITIS MANDATORY THAT YOU COMPLETE AND
RETURN THIS PAGE



CONTRACT SECTION:

In compliance with the attached request for bids and subject to conditions imposed in the
specifications and general rules, conditions, and instructions, the undersigned firm offers
and agrees to furnish any or all items at the price set opposite each item for the period
July 1, 2015 to June 30, 2016, upon award to it of this contract by the Pointe Coupee
Parish School Board.

NAME OF FIRM: General Paper Company -,

SIIATURE OF AUTHORTZED REPRESENTATTVE: ( }L/UU\/« %(/\OQ;Z

TYPED NAME OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: _Ann Gerald

TITLE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE: CEO

COMPLETE ADDRESS OF FIRM: _ 11091 Aidine Hwy.. Baton Rouge, LA 70816

TELEPHONE NUMBER OF FIRM: 225-2091-7827

FAX NUMBER: 225-291-7883

DATE: _June 2, 2015

OUR PURCHASE ORDER WILL FOLLOW BID AWARD.

NAME OF SCHOOL SYSTEM: Pointe Coupee Parish School Board

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE:

TYPEDNAME OF AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE:  Donald L. Fuselier

TITLE: Director of Support Services
COMPLETEADDRESS: P.O. Drawer 579. New Roads, LA 70760
TELFPHONENUMBER: 225) 638-4437 (Maintenance Department

FAXNUMBER: (225) 638-4238

DATE:

NOTE: ITIS MANDATORY THAT YOU COMPLETE AND RETURN
THIS PAGE

The Pointe Coupee Parish School System does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin,
sex, religion, age or disability in employment or the provisions of services.,
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Louisiana Preference
Special Conditions
Return This Page With Bid

If you qualify for any one of these preferences by the standards set forth in these statues,
please indicate on the form provided below.

Specify percent of preference claimed, contract item number(s) to which preference applies,
the name of the producer, manufacturer or processor of supplies, and the location within
Louisiana where the products(s) is/are grown, produced, harvested, processed or
manufactured, as appropriate to the item.

Percent of Itermn Producer/Manufacturer/Processor Louisiana
Preference Number Location
Claimed

ol 5138 Tvarsgui€ TdusheS Hamhad
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| certify that the above information is true and accurate and that bidder is entitled to the

preference claimed.

Signature %LUZ/Q&, pate_Le ! 9% PGS

in order to quailfy for a preference the bidder must supply the above information and the
above certification must be signed.




POINTE COUPEE PARISH SCHOOL BOARD

MAINTENANCE DEPARTMENT
JANITORIAL/PAPER SUPPLIES
JULY 1, 2015 - JUNE 30, 2016

Company Q‘@ Ne \’\QJ\ Pa‘ml" Cf)mtﬂlllf/}

DATE U!Z!b

e

[TEM |QUANTITY |DESCRIPTION BRAND |UNIT [{TOTAL

NO. PRICE |PRICE

01 |200 cases Neutral Floor Cleaner, Hi-Tech or equal,

(4-1gallon Appearance: Blue Green e 9623 | $4984.00
containers) Fragrance: Fresh Fresh per Gal
pH: 7108 {Submit Sample) $24.52
Flash Point: None p;ar4cs
Solvents: None %Non Volatile: 4% ©
02 |75 cases Pine 32 DISINFECTANT GERMICIDAL Pine 32 $6.23 pe
(4- 1 gallon CLEANER & DEODORANT ( Active Gal $1869.00
containers) Ingredients - Didecyl dimethyl ammonium $24.92
chloride 0.94%, ammonium chloride 0.62% or per CS
equal (Submit Sample) of 4

03 1400 cases Bleach - Clorox, Purell or equal (1 gal. plastic sessull
containers 6 gals, per case)

04 | 25 cases Window Cleaner (ready to use), cleans all glass Giass $4.78 | $478.00
surface - Windex, Hunter or equal 4-1 gallon Plus RTY | PperGa
containers per case $19.12

per cs
05 | 30 cases Hand Soap, Disinfectant (Dial or equal} 4 Antibacterial $756.00
1 gallon plastic cont e Gold Soap| 003G
- 1 gallon plastic cont. per cas $25.20
CS

06 {30 Soap Dispensers, Impact Clervu or Equal IMP
9330 (300z.) 4 Vi x 4 x 6 '4 See through tank. no bid
Accommodates liquid and lotion soaps - Meet
ADA requirements  (Submit Sample)

07 | 20dozen Broom, #36 Warehouse - 5 sew 28/Ibdoz. 100% | Royal TR
broom corn, wire bound, 1" diameter X 42" long 438 $7.29 :
for indoor and outdoor use 589909 each

L




ITEM |QUANTITY |DESCRIPTION BRAND |UNIT |TOTAL
NO. PRICE |PRICE
08 5 Long Handle Broom Rb9905 $19.35 $96.75
‘ each
09 | 30dozen Mops, heavy duty wet - #36 cotton RBos2c | $6.15 | $2214.00
32 oz. mop on handle each
10 110 Mop Bucket/wringer combo 26 qt. Bucket, metal no bid
16-24 oz. Wringer, side press, on 3 inch casters,
dirt trap, Rubbermaid or equal NSF listed
11 2 dozen Dust Mop Frame (metal) 24" RB24DF | $2.55 $61.20
each
12 | 1 dozen Dust Mop Frame (metal) 36" RB3sDF | $3:50 | $42.00
each
13 12 dozen Dust Mop Head only RB24DH | $4.68 $673.92
24" x 3"
Washable-reusable
14 | 12 dozen Dust Mop Head only RB36DH | 3625 | P00
36" x 3“
Washable - reusable
15 12 dozen Dust Mop Head only RB48DH | $8.35 $1202.40
48" x 3"
Washable - reusable
16 | 2dozen Dust Mop Handles (Snap - On, metal) REDMsoM| S7.00 | *168.00
17 |24 Dust Pan, Lobby (Plastic) Self-opening and closing | WC67 sago | $206.40
lid provides simple, trouble free operation 30" handle
or longer. Heavy duty for use in office areas, theaters,
or other public areas.
18 | 300 1bs Floor Compound - Oil Base - 50 Ib container nc bid
19 50 cases Garbage Liners, 12-16 gallon (24" x 33"} i
Natural - 1000 per case 6 Micron L
(Submit Sample)
20 | 250 cases Garbage Liners. 44 gallon (40x48) super wl leak proofto .
fit 44 gallons; extra heavy duty: high density; Mobile or no bid
equal 250 percase 16 Micron (Submit Sample)
21 | 50 cases Garbage Liners, 38 x 58 inch 1.2 mils. Black, no bid
100 per case (4 rolls) (Submit Sample)
22 150 cases Paper Hand Towels, Multifold Towels SK1850A
4000 towels per case (16 packages - 250 towels) SCA $15.34 | $2301.00
9-1/8" x 9-1/2" towel size




ITEM |QUANTITY DESCRIPTION BRAND |UNIT |TOTAL
NO. PRICE |PRICE
23 | 300 cases Paper Hand Towels, Single Fold Brown, D820 $30.32 | $9096.00
4020 single fold sheets per case (22) 3.4" SCA
x11 %" x 8 i/8"
24 | 50 cases Paper Towels, Brown Roll RK8002 | $18.73 | $936.50
(7.75 in X 800 Ft/Roll) SCA
6 rolls per case (Submit Sample)
25 |50 Dispensers to fit the above Brown Roll Paper 84TR
Towels (7.75x800 Ft/Roll) (Submit Sample) SCA $40.85)| $2042.50
26 100 cases Toilet Tissue - Jumbo roil 9", 2 ply, 1000" TJO922A |$22.17 | $2217.00
27 | 200 cases Toilet Tissue - Single Roll - 500 Sheets 2 Tm1616S | $30.34 | $6068.00
Ply 4.5 x 3.1 (Atlas or Equal)
28 |50 Locking Double Roll Toilet Tissue Chrome i
Dispenser  (Submit Sample) dete
To fit above Single Roll Tissue
Impact 2501, San Jamar R260XC or equal
29 | 4cases Brillo, SOS, or equal
(State Pack) no bid
30 | 4cases Comet or Equal AJAX $T71| g06.64
CPC1427 gach
24/210z
31 | 15 cases Furniture Polish - Lemon Luster ;?ZEP'O” $3.22 |$38.64
32 | 15cases Time Mist Air Freshener with odor counteractant, -
or equal Ll
Fragrance - Country Garden, Baby Powder, etc. 12
per case 6.60z cans
33 | 30 dozen Disinfectant Fragrant Spray, (Hospital) lemon .
scent or equal 16 oz. can no bid
34 |4 dozen Gloves - Yellow Flock Lined - for general ‘
Medium cleaning and mild chemical handling 12" length no bid
with embossed nonslip grip 18-20 mil thick
35 4 dozen Gloves - Yellow Flock Lined - for general _
Large cleaning and mild chemical handling 12" length g bid
with embossed nonslip grip 18-20 mil thick




ITEM |QUANTITY DESCRIPTION BRAND TOTAL
NO. PRICE [PRICE
36 | 4dozen Gloves - Yellow Flock Lined - for general no bid
X-Large cleaning and mild chemical handling 12" length
with embossed nonslip grip 18-20 mil thick
37 | 100 boxes Gloves - Powdered latex disposable gloves, no bid
(More orless)  |single use only, packaged 100 per box State
Packaging per case Size: LARGE
38 | 20 cases Wipes Plus Antibacterial Sanitizing Hand Wipes -
Alcohol-Free - Brand or Equal — Non-drying no bid
antibacterial lemon scented wipes prevent the spread of germs
_ designed to dispense one-at-a-time - Sheet Size 6
x 7 In, Pop Up Canister, Count 240,
Package 12 (Submit Sample)
If different STATE PACK
39 | 20 cases KLEENEX® Alcohol — Free Instant Hand no bid
Sanitizer - Brand or Equal
Kills 99.99% of most common germs that may
cause illness. Works in as little as 15 seconds.
No water or towels needed. Specially formulated
with moisturizers to leave hands feeling soft and
refreshed.
8 fluid oz. pump bottles 12 to a case
If different STATE PACK
40 j 20 Boxes Urinal Deodorizer Screen (Wave 2.0 or Equal)
Scent - Melon or Cucumber Melon Freshens for no bid
30 days, 10 per case or state pack
Submit Sample
41 30 Microfiber - Dust Mop Pad Blue 5" x
48" Janilink or Equal no bid
Submit Sample
42 |30 Microfiber — Dust Mop Pad Blue 5" X
36” — Janilink or Equal ‘
Submit Sample no bid
43 30 Microfiber — Dust Mop Pad Blue 5” X
247 — Janilink or Equal
Submit Sample no bid




ITEM IQUANTITY DESCRIPTION BRAND UNIT TOTAL
NO. PRICE | PRICE
44 1 1 dozen Dust Mop Frame (metal) 5" x 48" to fit the o bid
above microfiber dust mop pads
45 1125 cases Qdor Ban Neutral Deodorant Neutral
¥ 11.72
Super Concentrate, Fresh $58.60
Odor Counteractant, Deodorant sSDC
And Air Freshener Concentrate
Components — [sopropanal; Alkyl dimethyl
benzyl ammonium chloride
Appearance: Light Blue
Fragrance: Fresh (Submit Sample)
(4 — 1 gallon containers per case
46 | 25 cases Stoko “Refresh” Moisturizing Foam Hand
Cleaner Refresh | $41.40 $1035.00
Soap
6 — 800ml cartridges per case 29932
(Submit Sample)
47 | 12 items Stoko “Refresh” Dispenser
Refresh
For Moisturizing Foam Hand Cleaner sl L $12.00
30290
48 15 cases Fresh Urinal Blocks
100% pure perfumed
Paradichloronenzene  (Submit Sample) no bid
Cherry 12-3ps—c-fp
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